
   
Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Request Ref: NGFOI 17/18: 127 
    
Thank you for your request for information received at Northampton General Hospital NHS 
Trust (NGH) on 30/06/17 and I am pleased to be able to provide you with a response.    
 

1. Who is your current and previous NEPTS operator (spanning the last 3 years or existing 

contract- whichever is longer? 
 
Previous 3 years NSL. Current TASL 
 

2. What is the current contract (s) end date (s) and are there any provision for extensions? 

 
30th June 2022. There is no provision for extensions. 
 

3. Who or which body would the procurement of your future contract be made by? 

 
Nene CCG 
 

4. Please provide the name, address, email and telephone number of the person responsible for 

the commissioning of services and the same for the person responsible for reviewing contract 

performance. 

 
If you would like any further information about NHS Nene Clinical Commissioning Group or 
our projects in Northamptonshire we can be contacted in the following ways: 
 
By post: 
 
NHS Nene Clinical Commissioning Group 
Francis Crick House 
Summerhouse Road 
Moulton Park 
Northampton 
NN3 6BF 
 
By telephone: 
 
01604 651100 
 
By email: 
 
involvement.nene@nhs.net 
 
For Freedom of Information Requests by email: 
 
foi.neneccg@ardengemcsu.nhs.uk 
 

5. Please provide the current Service Speciation’s in place across the contract (s). 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 
 

mailto:foi.neneccg@ardengemcsu.nhs.uk


6. How is your current contract operated (in lots or as a whole)? What are the different budgets 

for these? 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 
 

7. What is your forecast spend in the following years (please break this down by service: 

scheduled patient journeys excl. renal, renal patient journeys, high dependency, secure and 

staff (if this is not available then please provide the total spend) 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 

 
8. Please provide KPI and Penalties measure in place across this contract and the most recent 

performance review of the same. 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 

 
9. Please provide the current Patient Transport Eligibility policy and what are your provisions for 

revision to this? 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 

 
10. What is your policy on transporting Escorts? Do you currently make payment provisions for 

this? 

 
This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from Nene CCG.  
They can be contacted at the above address. 

 


