Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000
Request Ref: NGFOI 16/17: 188

Thank you for your request for information received at Northampton General Hospital NHS
Trust (NGH) on 04/07/16.

| am pleased that we are now able to provide you with a response to your request as shown
below.

You requested:

Please tell me the total outstanding money owed to your trust by foreign patients not entitled
to free healthcare in each of the following financial years: a) 2011/12 b) 2012/13 c) 2013/14
d) 2014/15 e) 2015/16

Please also tell me the total amount of debt written off in each of the following financial years
for money owed by foreign patients not entitted to free healthcare:
a) 2011/12 b) 2012/13 c) 2013/14 d) 2014/15 e) 2015/16

For 2015/16 please provide a breakdown of money owed. For each case, please give details
of the nationality of the patient, the treatment/care received and the total cost.

Response from Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust (NGH):

Please tell me the total outstanding money owed to your trust by foreign patients not entitled
to free healthcare in each of the following financial years:

a) 2011/12 £3,590

b) 2012/13 £10,117

c) 2013/14 £25,568

d) 2014/15 £10,127

e) 2015/16 £140,038

Please also tell me the total amount of debt written off in each of the following financial years
for money owed by foreign patients not entitled to free healthcare:

a) 2011/12 £98,246

b) 2012/13 £121,548

c) 2013/14 £131,384

d) 2014/15 £148,206

e) 2015/16 £17,483 (reduced write off due to Clinical Commissioning Groups risk share)

For 2015/16 please provide a breakdown of money owed. For each case, please give details
of the nationality of the patient, the treatment/care received and the total cost.

I can confirm on behalf of the Trust and in accordance with S.1 (1) of the Freedom of
Information Act 2000 (FOIA) that we do not hold the information that you have requested.




Whilst we do hold information for outstanding balance and whether the patient was EEA or
Non EEA we do not record it for total cost, nationality and treatment/care received.

BALANCE OUTSTANDING

2015/16 £ 3,130.00 EEA
£ 5,447.93 Non-EEA
£ 1,442.06 EEA
£ 99.01 EEA
£ 4,631.84 Non-EEA
£ 369.41 EEA
£ 1,932.40 Non-EEA
£ 3,426.92 Non-EEA
£ 266.13 EEA
£ 7,198.65 Non-EEA
£ 550.73 EEA
£ 735.36 EEA
£ 5,457.93 Non-EEA
£ 3,338.62 EEA
£ 557.09 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 1,225.60 Non-EEA
£ 3,221.60 Non-EEA
£ 1,587.45 EEA
£ 2,381.18 EEA
£ 1,033.01 Non-EEA
£ 2,326.00 EEA
£ 754.47 Non-EEA
£ 5,147.93 Non-EEA
£ 563.46 EEA
£ 5,057.93 Non-EEA
£ 218.06 Non-EEA
£ 273.77 EEA
£ 2,679.37 Non-EEA
£ 649.00 Non-EEA
£ 1,341.27 EEA
£ 717.32 EEA
£ 1,637.92 EEA
£ 2,476.81 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 750.10 Non-EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 814.95 Non-EEA




£ 377.58 Non-EEA
£ 218.06 Non-EEA
£ 5,237.12 Non-EEA
£ 1,774.90 Non-EEA
£ 142.19 EEA
£ 2,381.18 EEA
£ 3,360.00 Non-EEA
£ 181.46 Non-EEA
£ 8,748.84 EEA
£ 1,810.29 EEA
£ 940.70 Non-EEA
£ 137.95 EEA
£ 5,633.02 Non-EEA
£ 967.75 EEA
£ 2,969.05 EEA
£ 569.83 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 3,638.62 EEA
£ 1,242.58 EEA
£ 4,433.56 Non-EEA

2015/16
YTD

£ 140,037.68




