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                                                   A G E N D A  

 

                                                PUBLIC TRUST BOARD  
 

Thursday 28 July 2016  
10.00 in the Board Room at Northampton General Hospital 

 

Time   Agenda Item Action Presented by Enclosure 

 

10:00   INTRODUCTORY ITEMS 

 1. Introduction and Apologies Note Mr P Farenden Verbal 

 2. Declarations of Interest  Note Mr P Farenden Verbal 

 3. Minutes of meeting 26 May 2016 Decision Mr P Farenden A. 

 4. Matters Arising and Action Log Note Mr P Farenden B. 

 5. Patient Story Receive Executive Director Verbal 

 6. Chairman’s Report Receive Mr P Farenden Verbal 

 7. Chief Executive’s Report Receive Dr S Swart C. 

10:25 CLINICAL QUALITY AND SAFETY 

 8. Medical Director’s Report  Assurance Dr M Cusack  D. 

 9. Director of Nursing and Midwifery Report Assurance Ms C Fox E. 

 10. Same Sex Accommodation Board Statement 
of Compliance 

Assurance Ms C Fox 
F. 

 11. 24 Hour Survey in A&E – Summary Report Assurance Mrs D Needham G. 

 12. Equality and Diversity Report Assurance Mrs J Brennan H. 

11:00 OPERATIONAL ASSURANCE 

 13. Finance Report  Assurance Mr S Lazarus I. 

 14. Workforce Performance Report Assurance Mrs J Brennan J. 

11:15 STRATEGY 

 15. Clinical Collaboration Update Assurance Mr C Pallot K. 

11:25 GOVERNANCE 

 16. Annual Fire Safety Report 2015/16 including 
the Annual Statement of Fire Safety 
Compliance 

 

Assurance Mr C Abolins 

L. 



 

 

Time   Agenda Item Action Presented by Enclosure 

 

11:55 FOR INFORMATION 

 17. Integrated Performance Report Assurance Mrs D Needham M. 

12:05 COMMITTEE REPORTS 

 18. Highlight Report from Finance Investment 
and Performance Committee 

Assurance Mr P Zeidler N. 

 19. Highlight Report from Quality Governance 
Committee 

Assurance Mrs L Searle O. 

 20. Highlight Report from Workforce Committee Assurance Mr G Kershaw P. 

 21. Highlight Report from Hospital Management 
Team 

Assurance Dr S Swart Q. 

12:30 22. ANY OTHER BUSINESS Mr P Farenden Verbal 

DATE OF NEXT MEETING 

The next meeting of the Trust Board will be held at 09:30 on Thursday 29 September 2016 in the Board 
Room at Northampton General Hospital. 
 

RESOLUTION – CONFIDENTIAL ISSUES:  

The Trust Board is invited to adopt the following: 

“That representatives of the press and other members of the public be excluded from the remainder of this 
meeting having regard to the confidential nature of the business to be transacted, publicity on which would be 
prejudicial to the public interest” (Section 1(2) Public Bodies (Admission to Meetings) Act 1960). 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 
 

Minutes of the Public Trust Board 
 

Thursday 26 May 2016 at 09:30 in the Board Room                                                        
at Northampton General Hospital 

 

Present 
 Mr P Farenden 

Mr P Zeidler 
Chairman (Chair) 
Non-Executive Director  

 Dr M Cusack Medical Director 
 Ms C Fox Director of Nursing, Midwifery & Patient Services 

 Mr G Kershaw 
Mrs L Searle 

Non-Executive Director  
Non-Executive Director 

 Mr S Lazarus Director of Finance 
 Mrs D Needham Chief Operating Officer and Deputy Chief Executive Officer 
 Mr D Noble Non-Executive Director 

 Dr S Swart 
 

Chief Executive Officer 
 

In Attendance 
 Ms K Palmer Executive Board Secretary 
 Ms C Thorne 

Mr C Pallot 
Mr C Abolins 

Director of Corporate Development Governance & Assurance 
Director of Strategy and Partnerships 
Director of Facilities and Capital Development 

 Mrs S Watts 
Mrs A Chown 

Head of Communications 
Deputy  Director of Workforce and Transformation 

Apologies 
 Ms O Clymer 

Mrs J Brennan 
 

Non-Executive Director 
Director of Workforce and Transformation 

 

TB 16/17 001 Introductions and Apologies 
 Mr P Farenden welcomed those present to the meeting of the Public Trust Board. 

 
Apologies for absence were recorded from Mrs J Brennan and Ms O Clymer. 
 

TB 16/17 002 Declarations of Interest  
 No further interests or additions to the Register of Interests were declared. 

 
TB 16/17 003 Minutes of the meeting 31 March 2016 
 The minutes of the Trust Board meeting held on 31 March 2016 were presented for 

approval Ms Thorne noted that in the Chairman’s Report it should state the event 
was an AQUA event and that the whole Trust Board attended instead of only Mr 
Farenden..  
 
The Board resolved to APPROVE the minutes of the 31 March 2016 as a true and 
accurate record of proceedings subject to one typographical error.  
 

TB 16/17 004 Matters Arising and Action Log 31 March 2016 
 The Matters Arising and Action Log from the 31 March 2016 were considered. 

 
Mr Pallot updated the Board on the Clinical Collaboration with Cardiology that was 
discussed in the minutes of 31 March 2016 Public Trust Board. Mr Pallot advised 
that the Trust would be moving forward with the heart-failure service and NGH is now 
looking to appoint to positions within this service. 
 
The Board NOTED the Action Log and Matters Arising from the 31 March 2016. 
 

TB 16/17 005 Patient Story 
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 Mrs Needham presented the Patient Story. 
 
Mrs Needham advised that a 66 year old male fell over whilst at home on Good 
Friday and called 999 as he had banged his head. The patient was admitted and 
transferred to Benham ward at 2pm. Mrs Needham stated that the patient was not 
seen for 9 hours. The patient was seen on the Saturday and the doctor hoped for 
discharge. Mrs Needham reported that the patient wasn’t seen by a doctor on the 
Sunday and by the Monday the patient requested that the nurse contact the doctor to 
query whether discharge was possible. It was requested that the patient would need 
to have an x-ray, ECG and his blood pressure checked. On the Tuesday the patient 
was advised he could be discharged and was transferred to the discharge suite at 
12.30pm. Mrs Needham advised that at 2pm the patient was still in the discharge 
suite awaiting his medication, at 6pm he was still waiting. The patient was eventually 
able to collect his prescription at 10.30am on the Wednesday. 
 
Mrs Needham reported that the patient noted that the staff were kind and treated him 
well. The patient believes the delay in discharge was contributory to the paperwork 
that needed to be completed.  
                                                  
The Board NOTED the Patient Story. 
 

TB 16/17 006 Chairman’s Report 
 Mr Farenden presented the Chairman’s Report. 

 
Mr Farenden commented on the positive effect that the Non-Executive Directors 
have by attending the ‘Beat the Bug’ rounds. Mr Farenden stated that the staff value 
their attendance and Mr Farenden believes that it makes a difference. Mr Farenden 
found it interesting to note the changes within the NHS over his 47 years of service. 
Mr Farenden noted that changes have been seen in technology, science of 
medicine, patient’s expectations and the openness of the health system. Mr 
Farenden reported that what had not changed was the way staff deal with patients 
and the commitment and dedication of staff. 
 
The Board NOTED the Chairman’s Report. 
 

TB 16/17 007 Chief Executive’s Report 
 Dr Swart presented the Chief Executive’s Report. 

 
Dr Swart advised that pressures in Urgent Care continue with an increase 40% in 
attendees to A&E in comparison to some days in May 2015. Dr Swart noted that 
Urgent Care issues are the biggest risk to the Trust and it had been reported that 
contributory to this are a high number of patients who are unable to make 
appointments with their GP’s.  
 
Dr Swart commented on the key point drawn from the Mrs Needham’s patient story 
of delayed transfer of care and the need to increase bed capacity as a priority for the 
Trust.  
 
Dr Swart stated that the Trust was one of five hospitals shortlisted for the Hospital 
Patient Safety Award from CHKS. Dr Swart advised that unfortunately the Trust 
didn’t win the award, but this is the first time the Trust have been in the top five 
hospitals for the award and reflects the core value of putting patient safety above all 
else. 
 
Dr Swart reported that the Trust had coped well during the recent Junior Doctors’ 
strike action.  
 
Dr Swart advised that the Trusts Quality Improvement Strategy is now being finalised 

Page 2 of 235



 

 

 
 

and that it will help ensure that everyone who works at the Trust can fulfil the core 
value of aspiring to excellence.  
 
Dr Swart stated that the QI work is engaging the Trust’s trainees and has been well 
recognised nationally. Dr Swart reported that nurses are soon to become involved in 
the QI projects.  
 
Dr Swart reported that the Trust is actively involved in the development of the 
sustainability and transformation plan (STP) for the county. Dr Swart noted that it is 
becoming increasingly clear that the STP is becoming a national driving force in 
health care.  
 
Dr Swart advised that the Best Possible Care Awards would be building on last 
year’s success and will be held on 30 September 2016. Dr Swart stated that there 
would be an additional award category of Clinical Educator of the Year, and the Trust 
is committed to seeking sponsorship for this event.  
 
The Board NOTED the Chief Executive’s Report. 
 

TB 16/17 008 Medical Director’s Report 
 Dr Cusack presented the Medical Director’s Report. 

 
Dr Cusack advised that the key challenge to the Trust remains the acute pressures 
on the urgent care pathways. Dr Cusack noted that the recruitment of appropriate 
trained nursing and medical staff is a further on-going risk to the Trust. Dr Cusack 
advised that the recruitment and retention of medical staff was difficult and that it can 
have an impact of the quality of services provided. Dr Cusack commented that there 
is a robust plan in place to mitigate these risks.  
 
Dr Cusack drew the Board to page 20 – 21 of the report which details the 3 never 
events in 2015/16. Dr Cusack advised that the investigation is now complete for the 
incident in Gynaecology. Dr Cusack reported that the CCG and the patient involved 
will be sent the report by the end of the week.  
 
Dr Cusack stated that the Trust has been officially issued a Rule 28 and the Trust 
has 50 days to respond. The Rule 28 is in relation to the transfer of information when 
a patient was discharged to a care home.  Mrs Needham confirmed that learning has 
been actioned from the handover of information to nursing homes and that this has 
been feedback to the CCG. 
 
Dr Cusack shared with the Board the positive feedback received from the recent 
‘Dare to Share’ event. Dr Cusack stated that the event provided a sharing and 
learning forum for members of staff to discuss incidents that they had learnt from in 
their Directorates. Dr Cusack advised that the next event was to be held in 
September 2016. 
 
Dr Cusack stated that Capsticks solicitors provided a multidisciplinary educational 
teaching session at the Trust on issues relating to DNACPR on 6 May 2016 which 
had a high level of attendance. Dr Cusack reported that further education meetings 
are planned and that Information regarding the community DNACPR process has 
been widely shared at educational/academic meetings/through the safety huddles. 
 
Dr Cusack advised that the HSMR for the year to January 2016 (latest Dr Foster 
data) remains with the ‘as expected’ range at 98.4.  
 
Dr Cusack shared with the Board that NGH held the countywide mortality meeting on 
20 May 2016.  Dr Cusack advised that the meeting focused on Sepsis and AKI which 
incorporated a Grand Round presentation. Dr Cusack commented that the national 
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picture for Sepsis is not positive however the work the Trust is doing in relation to 
Sepsis is noteworthy.  
 
Dr Cusack advised that the analysis of 7th Trust wide mortality case note review has 
been completed.  Dr Cusack stated that this review focused on low-risk and post-
operative patients. Dr Cusack shared with the Board that the outcome of the review 
will be presented to the Board in July 16. 
                                                                                                        Action: Dr Cusack 
 
Mr Zeidler expressed his concern that since the last report to the Board there have 
been 5 new Serious Incidents reported and of the 3 confirmed Never Events in the 
last 6 months with a 4th potential in Gynaecology. Dr Cusack advised that a range of 
measures had been implanted to gain assurance from the Gynaecology team. Dr 
Cusack reported that the Theatre Team Group have met and are looking at what 
could go wrong at each step of a procedure with actions detailed on how to mitigate 
the error. Mr Zeidler queried whether there was a theme that needed to be 
investigated? Dr Cusack assured the Board that actions were in place and reflection 
work was being done in Gynaecology. Mr Zeidler was happy with this assurance 
from Dr Cusack.  
 
Mr Zeidler queried the open SI of Hyperkalaemia on page 22 of the report which has 
an incident date of 19 June 2015. Dr Cusack confirmed that has been closed and is 
in the report in error. 
 
The Board NOTED the Medical Director’s Report. 
 

TB 16/17 009 Director of Nursing and Midwifery Care Report 
 Ms Fox presented the Director of Nursing and Midwifery Care Report. 

 
Ms Fox advised that in April 2016 NGH achieved 95% harm free care (new harms). 
 
Ms Fox reported that a pressure ulcer run chart had been included within the report 
to highlight any trends. Ms Fox commented that an improvement is noted with work 
still to be done. Ms Fox advised that a key theme recognised was moving and 
handling issues. Ms Fox stated that work is being done system wide to reduce this 
contributing factor to pressure damage.  
 
Ms Fox advised that there have been 3 cases of C.diff apportioned to the Trust for 
the month of April 2016. Ms Fox stated that a Root Cause Analysis (RCA) will be 
undertaken for each case and these will be presented at the next Quality 
Governance Committee. The report will also contain a retrospective look at the 31 
cases of C.diff reported in 2015/16. Ms Fox noted that there have been no 
recordings for MSRA and MSSA in the month of April 16.  
                                                                                                          Action: Ms C Fox 
 
Ms Fox drew the Board to the graph on page 31 of the report in relation to Catheter 
Related Urinary Tract Infections (CRUTI). Ms Fox commented that there has been a 
peak in April 16 and this will be investigated further.  
 
Ms Fox reported that work is underway to reduce the falls rate and improve post fall 
care. Ms Fox stated that the key issue was to give targeted support training to wards 
RAG rated red in completion of the falls risk assessment and/or care plan. 
 
Ms Fox advised that the narrative on the Nursing and Midwifery Dashboard has been 
revised.  
 
Ms Fox stated that Friends & Family Test (FTT) has seen an upturn in patient 
experience. Ms Fox commented that it is evident from looking at the run chart that 
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improvements have begun to be made for Inpatient services. Ms Fox reported that 
there is an upward trajectory in A&E and Ms Fox believes that this is due to the 
driving of information to the front line team.  
 
Ms Fox advised that PL@N (Practice Learning at Northampton) pilot has 
commenced on Rowan and Knightley as a new way to support student nurses.  
 
Ms Fox reported that preceptorship and clinical skills programmes continue for the 
new international nurses with an additional cultural programme following a 
successful bid to the Local Education Training Board commencing in May 2016. 
 
Ms Fox stated that a further 23 registrants have successfully revalidated for May 
2016 with workshops continuing to run on a monthly basis.   
 
Ms Fox advised that work on Dementia continues with the importance of John’s 
Campaign highlighted in the report.  
 
Ms Fox reported that the End of Life team had been strengthened with the 
recruitment of a new End of Life Care Project Lead. Ms Fox stated that all end of life 
key performance indicator data, including that related to the Preferred Place of Death 
CQUIN, will be prepared and submitted using the CQEG template, and will go to 
CQEG via the Steering Group.  
 
Ms Fox gave the Board an update on the completed service compliance figures for 
complaints. Ms Fox advised that the figures reported have seen a drop from 83% to 
76% in April 16. Ms Fox commented that this drop was due to staffing issues which 
has now been resolved.  
 
Mr Noble noted that the End of Life Care work was encouraging. Mr Noble queried 
how it ties in with palliative care. Ms Fox clarified that the work includes all relevant 
national documentation for the best standards of practice.  
 
Mr Noble shared his concern on the downward trend of compliance figures for 
complaints. Mr Noble advised that the Board had been assured in previous months 
that these figures would improve. Dr Swart stated that the issue is the volume of 
complaints and additional work is being done to address the complaints at an earlier 
stage. 
 
Ms Searle commented that the Pressure Ulcer run chart is helpful however she fails 
to understand how the data is benchmarked. Ms Fox confirmed that absolute and 
cumulative numbers will be included in future run charts to ensure improvements in 
the trends are more visually noticeable. 
 
Mr Zeidler queried whether 11 Safeguarding referrals against the Trust were normal? 
Ms Fox advised that level of normal referrals can be dependent on the size of the 
organisation and confirmed that 11 was not above average for the Trust. Ms Fox 
stated that she was comfortable that all safeguarding incidents are assessed and 
discussed appropriately.  
 
Mr Abolins gave a further update on the moving and handling issue with regards to 
pressure ulcers. Mr Abolins advised that the Health and Safety Committee were 
aware of this and will be advising colleagues on the most appropriate way to address 
this concern.  
 
Mr Zeidler was shocked to be made aware of revalidation issues within nursing. Mr 
Zeidler queried whether this could increase the risk of losing nursing staff. Ms Fox 
confirmed that it could.    
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The Board NOTED the Director of Nursing and Midwifery Care Report. 
 

TB 16/17 010 Midwifery Learning Disability Group Presentation 
 Ms Fox introduced the Midwifery Learning Disability Group Presentation. 

 
Ms Fox advised that the ‘Chit Chat’ programme had been developed after there had 
been a number of complaints from new mothers with learning disabilities who felt 
they needed extra support. Ms Fox made the Board aware that members of the 
public with Learning Disabilities find it a struggle to access acute services and with a 
national focus on maternity services, a service that would link the two has been 
developed by the Trust.  
 
Ms Fox stated that the presentation will be submitted to the National Nursing Times 
Awards, be included in the HSJ and will also be submitted to the Kate Grange Care 
and Compassion Awards.  
 
Mr Farenden noted that he found the presentation uplifting.  
 
The Board NOTED the Finance Report Midwifery Learning Disability Group 
Presentation.  
 

TB 16/17 011 Approval of Quality Account 
 Dr Cusack presented the Quality Account. 

 
Dr Cusack made reference to the recent updated Draft Quality Account that was 
distributed to the Board members post circulation of the Public Board papers.  
 
Dr Cusack advised that figures noted for the Trusts performance activity up to 31 
March 2016 with a comparison to the previous year’s activity was updated to reflect 
the correct information. Dr Cusack reported that the quarter 4 ‘Sign Up To Safety’ 
data was now included with the report.  
 
Dr Cusack advised that the response from Northamptonshire County Council was 
recorded in the report. 
 
Dr Cusack requested that the Board carefully read Section 4 of the report and pass 
any additional information for this section to him. 
 
Dr Cusack stated that the Communications team will work on the final format of the 
Quality Account.  
 
Ms Searle queried whether the Board will need to sign of the Quality Account 
pending final changes as required. It was confirmed that this is the correct process to 
follow. Ms Searle reminded Dr Cusack to send comments received from partners to 
the Non-Executive Directors.  
 
The Board APPROVED the Quality Account pending final changes as required. 
 

TB 16/17 012 Finance Report 

 Mr Lazarus presented the Finance Report. 
 
Mr Lazarus advised that the financial position of the Trust for the period ended 30th 
April (Month 1 is a deficit of £2.2m, £0.3m adverse to plan. Mr Lazarus did not 
express concern as whilst month 1 results are not always a good barometer, it is 
clear that pay costs have increased over and above budgeted levels which may give 
rise to a concerning trend if repeated in May 16. 
 
Mr Lazarus reported that factors that may have contributed to increased pay costs 
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are the change to weekly payroll, Easter enhancements and medical agency costs. 
Mr Lazarus reported that there is a difference of average pay of 5.8% from March to 
April in WTE costs. Mr Lazarus commented that this could be linked to national 
insurance increase and the 1% pay award, however further analysis is required and 
Mr Lazarus will present this information to the Finance Investment and Performance 
Committee. Mrs Needham acknowledged that the loss of income in relation to pay 
could have been more if not for the 2 day Junior Doctor’s industrial strike. 
                                                                                                       Action: Mr Lazarus 
 
Mr Lazarus advised that the CCG are now paying the Trust its monthly income at the 
start of the month.  
 
The Board NOTED the Finance Report. 
 

TB 16/17 013 Workforce Performance Report 

 Mrs Chown presented the Workforce Performance Report.  
 
Mrs Chown advised that the substantive Workforce Capacity increased by 8.81% 
FTE in April 2016. Mrs Chown stated that the percentage is lower due to the 
increase in the FTE following the introduction of posts through the business cases 
that have been approved but have yet been recruited to.  
 
Mrs Chown reported that there has been a downward trend in annual Trust staff 
turnover.  
 
Mrs Chown noted that the staff sickness absence had increased by 0.14% but it 
must be noted that a total of 7 Directorates were below the Trust target rate.  
 
Mrs Chown stated that the current rate of Appraisals recorded for April 16 is 82.71% 
which is a further improvement.     
 
Mrs Chown commented that Role Specific Essential Training compliance decreased 
in April to 73.70% which was mainly due to Blood Training competence requirements 
being changed this month so the pool of staff requiring the training had increased.  
 
Mrs Chown advised that Mandatory Training compliance in April 16 had exceeded 
the Trust target and increased from 84.5% to 85.13%.   
Ms Fox made the Board aware of the joint Nursing/HR presentation that will be 
brought to Julys Workforce Committee to highlight what has been done in nurse 
recruitment and retention.  
 
Mr Zeidler queried the establishment gap on page 144 of the report as it appears that 
Allied Health Professionals have a significant shortfall. Mrs Chown advised this 
would be investigate and brought back to the next Board meeting. 
                                                                                                      Action: Mrs Chown 
 
The Board NOTED the Workforce Performance Report. 
 

TB 16/17 014 Sustainability and Transformation Plan Update 

 Mr Pallot presented Sustainability and Transformation Plan Update. 
 
Mr Pallot advised that the report largely replicates the most recent update provided 
to the Sustainable Transformation Plan (STP) Board and is provided to ensure 
consistency of message across all organisations. Mr Pallot stated that additions in 
this version include the overall governance framework for delivery of the STP and 
additional detail on the acute transformation element. 
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Mr Pallot drew the Board to page 155 of the report which details the Governance 
Structure.  
 
Mr Pallot reported that the Mckinsey work was coming to an end and they have 
provided the Trust with information packs on the 10 agreed specialities.  
 
Mr Farenden queried whether the success of collaboration with KGH regarding the 
Acute Services work dependant on the MCP. Mr Pallot confirmed that it would.  
 
Dr Swart commented that the population of Northamptonshire and the needs of the 
county need to be addressed. Dr Swart stated that the programmes of work that are 
most likely to made a difference need to be identified within the STP.  
 
Mr Zeidler queried the completion dates on page 158 and the progress on these.  Mr 
Pallot advised that workshops have taken place with the CCG, GP 
Federations/NHFT and Mckinsey.  
 
The Board NOTED the Sustainability and Transformation Plan Update. 
 

TB 16/17 015 Approval of Annual Report and Annual Accounts 2015/16 

 Mr Lazarus presented the Annual Report and Annual Accounts 2015/16 for approval. 
 
Mr Lazarus advised the Annual Report and Annual Accounts 2015/16 had been to 
Audit Committee along with the 3 additional amendments. Mr Lazarus advised that 
the additional changes were the inclusion of an updated salary and pension table 
and additional information of gender distribution of senior managers and medical 
staff. Mr Lazarus commented that the Trust does not hold a Remuneration Policy 
and the Annual Report would include the duties of the Remuneration & Appointments 
Committee as set out in the Terms of Reference. Mr Lazarus noted that the 
membership of the Remuneration & Appointments Committee is predominantly Non-
Executive Directors and that this would be included with the report.  
 
Mr Lazarus advised that the Audit Committee had recommended approval of the 
Annual Report and Annual Accounts. 
 
Dr Cusack stated that on page 229 it incorrectly notes that he is Hon Treasurer of the 
NHS Retirement Fellowship. 
 
Mr Lazarus distributed the letter of representation which is required for audit 
purposes.  Mr Lazarus confirmed that the only significant change is last paragraph on 
page 7 in which the statement notes that the Board has considered the valuation of 
its land and buildings. Mr Lazarus advised the Audit Committee recommends 
approval of the letter. 
 
The Board APPROVED the Annual Report and Annual Accounts 2015/16 pending 
amendments discussed and APPROVED the letter of representation. 
 

TB 16/17 016 Corporate Governance Report 

 Ms Thorne presented the  Corporate Governance Report 
 
Ms Thorne highlighted to the Board that on page 289 of the Board Pack which notes 
that between January and April 201 there were 17 Declarations of Hospitality 
received. Ms Thorne advised that she will be linking in with the Counter Fraud Officer 
who works with the Trust to raise awareness of Standard Business of Conduct 
Policy. Ms Thorne reported that declarations are reducing and Ms Thorne believes 
that this could be due to lack of understanding with staff.  
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Ms Thorne stated that the Audit Committee had approved the Corporate Governance 
Manual pending amendments.  
 
Mrs Thorne advised that the Corporate Governance Manual will act as a handbook 
which all senior staff will need to sign to say they have read and understood the 
manual.  
 
The Board NOTED the Corporate Governance Report. 
 

TB 16/17 017 Approval of Risk Management Strategy 

 Ms Thorne presented the Risk Management Strategy for approval. 
 
Ms Thorne advised that the Risk Management Strategy had been discussed in detail 
at April’s Board of Directors and approval was recommended to the Board .  
 
The Board APPROVED the Risk Management Strategy. 
 

TB 16/17 018 Integrated Performance Report 

 Mrs Needham presented the Integrated Performance Report. 
 
Mrs Needham advised of the Integrated Performance Report now includes the 
indicators which are amber and red rated with an accompanying exception report. 
Mrs Needham informed the Board that all areas had been covered in detail at the 
recent May Finance Investment and Performance Committee, Quality Governance 
Committee and Workforce Committee meetings.  
 
Mrs Needham stated that there had been an increase in non-elective activity and 
A&E attendees during May 16.  
 
Mrs Needham reported that herself and Mr Pallot had met with Social Care, Private 
Providers and investigated internal resource methods that could reduce the length of 
stay and support the gap in capacity over Winter.  
 
Mrs Needham advised that Winter Workshop is planned which will identify learning 
from Winter 2015/16 and outline what can be done moving forward into Winter 
2016/17.  
 
Mr Noble commented that the inclusion of run charts within the exception reports 
was a big improvement. Mr Noble requested that Mrs Needham looks at the 
definition of the improving trend indicator. 
                                                                                                  Action: Mrs Needham 
 
The Board NOTED the Report from the Integrated Performance Report. 
 

TB 16/17 019 Highlight Report from Finance Investment and Performance Committee 

 Mr Zeidler presented the Report from the Finance Investment and Performance 
Committee. 
 
The Board were provided a verbal update on activities undertaken during the month 
of April and what had been discussed at the Finance Investment and Performance 
Committee meeting held on 18 May 2016.  The report covered any issues of 
significance, interest and associated actions that were required and had been agreed 
to be taken forward by the Committee. 
 
Mr Zeidler advised that the importance of the Changing Care programme was 
discussed in detail. Mr Zeidler commented that a great deal of work had been done 
in internal CIPs and Mr Zeidler had requested that external collaborative work also to  
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be explored.  
 
Mr Zeidler reported that there had been a 5.8% increase in pay and advised the 
Board that Mr Lazarus would be investigating this with an update provided in Junes 
Finance Investment and Performance Committee.  
 
Mr Zeidler stated that an increase in DTOC had been highlighted as a concern as 
well as the delay of the 60 bedded ward.   
 
The Board NOTED the Highlight Report from the Finance Investment and 
Performance Committee. 
 

TB 16/17 020 Highlight Report from Quality Governance Committee 

 Ms Searle presented the Report from the Quality Governance Committee. 
 
The Board were provided an update on activities undertaken during the month of 
April and what had been discussed at the QGC meeting held on 20 May 2016.  The 
report covered any issues of significance, interest and associated actions that were 
required and had been agreed to be taken forward by the Committee. 
 
Ms Searle advised that the Quality Improvement Scorecard had been distributed at 
the Committee meeting. The Committee agreed that the new format was more 
helpful and requested for benchmarking data to be included on all the charts within 
the scorecard going forward. Mr Searle stated that an investigation was to be had on 
the spike on the Cardiac Arrest graph. 
 
Ms Searle reported that the Committee enjoyed a presentation on Rapid 
Tranquilisation from 3 Junior Doctors.  
 
Ms Searle stated that the Committee lacked assurance in C-Section compliance. The 
Committee requested when analysis from the September 16 audit was available it 
was to be brought back to the Quality Governance Committee for further assurance.  
 
The Board NOTED the Highlight Report from Quality Governance Committee. 
 

TB 16/17 021 Highlight Report from Workforce Committee 

 Mr Kershaw presented the report from the Workforce Committee. 
 
The Board were provided an update on activities undertaken during the month of 
April and what had been discussed at the Workforce meeting held on 18 May 2016.  
The report covered any issues of significance, interest and associated actions that 
were required and had been agreed to be taken forward by the Committee. 
 
Mr Kershaw advised that the Committee had received a detailed review on nursing 
staff recruitment and retention. Mr Kershaw reported that a further detailed review 
was to be brought back to the Committee on how to address the issue further.  
 
Mr Kershaw noted that there had been an increase in nurse fill rates. 
 
Mr Kershaw stated that Dr Jeffrey gave the Committee a verbal update on the triple 
red flag in Oncology. Mr Kershaw advised that a further written report will be 
presented in Junes Workforce Committee.  
 
Mr Kershaw shared with the Board the positive news of the increase in mandatory 
training compliance.  
 
The Board NOTED the  Highlight Report from Workforce Committee 
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TB 16/17 022 Highlight Report from Audit Committee 

 Mr Zeidler presented the report from the Audit Committee. 
 
The Board were provided an update on activities undertaken during the month of 
April and what had been discussed at the Audit meeting held on 25 May 2016.  The 
report covered any issues of significance, interest and associated actions that were 
required and had been agreed to be taken forward by the Committee. 
 
Mr Zeidler advised the following: 

 Internal Audit Annual Report – received reasonable assurance 

 Internal Audit Report – received reasonable assurance 

 Accounts 2015/16 – qualified opinion advised of no concerns. A letter will be 
sent to the Secretary of State to advise of the Trusts failure to not break even 
over a 3 year period. 

 External Audit – Salary overpayments have increased and are an area of 
concern. 

 Going Concern – The Audit Committee were advised that the Trust will not 
receive a letter next year and discussions were had on what the risks this 
poses the Trust. 

 
The Board NOTED the Highlight Report from Audit Committee. 
 

TB 16/17 023 Highlight Report from Hospital Management Team 

 Dr Swart presented the report from the Hospital Management Team (HMT). 
 
Dr Swart reported that the meeting on 03 May 2016 was a HMT Workshop and 
included the wider management team; Divisional Managers, Directorate Managers, 
Matrons and Clinical Directors. 
 
Dr Swart advised that 7 day working was discussed at HMT. Dr Swart stated that the 
Trust had received a letter from NHSI highlighting the 10 Standards which the Trust 
should aim to achieve. Dr Swart commented that Dr Cusack and Dr Bissett were 
taking the lead on this important issue. Dr Cusack and Dr Bissett would be noting the 
implications had on recruiting additional staff, the access to services and ensuring 
the right facilities would be available at the weekend.  
 
Mr Noble queried on how well defined the Standards were in Trust. Dr Swart advised 
Mr Noble the 10 Standards would be shared at a future Board meeting to gain further 
understanding on how and if the Standards could be achieved by the Trust.  
 
The Board NOTED the Highlight Report from Hospital Management Team 
 

TB 16/17 024 Any Other Business 

 There were no items of any other business. 
 

  
Date of next meeting: Thursday 28 July 2016 at 09:30 in the Board Room at 
Northampton General Hospital. 
 

 Mr P Farenden called the meeting to a close at 11:15 
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Report To 
 

Public Trust Board 
 

Date of Meeting 28 July  2016 

 
 

Title of the Report 
 

Chief Executive’s Report 

Agenda item 
 

7 

Presenter of the Report 
 

Dr Sonia Swart, Chief Executive 
 

Author(s) of Report 
 

Sally-Anne Watts, Head of Communications and Dr Sonia Swart 
 

Purpose 
 

For information and assurance 

Executive summary 
The report highlights key business and service issues for Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust in 
recent weeks. 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

N/A 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

N/A 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

N/A 

Equality Impact Assessment 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed decision/ 
policy will not promote equality of opportunity for all or promote 
good relations between different groups? (N) 
 
Is there potential for or evidence that the proposed decision/policy 
will affect different population groups differently (including possibly 
discriminating against certain groups)?(N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 
 

None 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Trust Board is asked to note the contents of the report 
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Public Trust Board 
28 July 2016 

 
Chief Executive’s Report 

 
1. Patient Safety and Quality Improvement 
There has been considerable national focus on the treatment of sepsis. At NGH we are building on 
the initial sepsis improvement work which formed the focus of the 2011 Aspiring to Excellence 
course for our undergraduate medical students.  We have sustained our efforts to ensure we treat 
sepsis in a more timely and efficient way, continually building on a number of improvements over 
the years with good results in terms of patient outcomes.   
 
Recently over 60 staff, including many consultants, attended a session on surviving sepsis given 
by Ron Daniels, the NHS Institute Safer Care Faculty Chair and the chief executive and co-founder 
of The UK Sepsis Trust charity.  Dr Jono Hardwick facilitated the session as our sepsis lead, with 
input from Dr Minassian. The message that we are an organisation focused on continual 
improvement was loud and clear, and something to be proud of. 

 
NGH has been asked on behalf of the East Midlands Academic Health Science Network Patient 
Safety Collaborative (PSC) to develop and lead a system-wide improvement plan to reduce 
avoidable harm.  This development has been received positively by neighboring organisations and 
is fully supported by the CCG.  I will update the board as this work progresses, but in essence the 
proposal is to utilise NGH`s Sign up for Safety improvement plan as a system-wide standard and 
report progress via quality improvement metrics following the model that is currently in place at 
NGH. 

 
There is an increase in focus in the UK and internationally on approaches to improve safety 
generally and this has led to greater recognition of the importance of the culture of an organisation. 
During June 2016, working in collaboration with the PSC, NGH joined eight acute trusts in the East 
Midlands and a began a four year safety culture improvement programme for the workforce in 
emergency departments and maternity units. The programme is being supported internally via the 
quality improvement team and responses are analysed externally by Pascal Metrics, a US-based 
company who have delivered a number of similar projects in the NHS.  The company will also 
support the delivery of strategies to improve the culture of patient safety in these services, based 
on the results of the surveys.  Baseline results from initial responses are expected during the latter 
part of August 2016. 
 
NGH has continued to successfully build on our quality improvement work with the support of the 
Board and a high degree of multidisciplinary support and commitment which has been 
unconditionally provided by all our operational teams and services.   
 
Developing our staff and building improvement skills has become increasingly important.  The 
specific focus provided by the IQE and Safety Teams, as well as the Changing Care programme, 
has provided staff with opportunities to change systems and processes of care. This has fuelled 
our progress in quality improvement and safety to the extent that there is also now a demand for a 
progressive curriculum in quality improvement encouraged through the Medical Royal Colleges 
and others. The view is that this approach will continually build both the capability and leadership 
necessary in healthcare today. 
 
To support the quality improvement work many of our staff are involved in, we now have an 
opportunity to deliver a Patient Safety and Quality Improvement accredited course at NGH. The 
following are currently being considered in collaboration with the University of Northampton with a 
plan to commence the first programmes in 2017. 
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 PG Certificate  - Patient safety and quality improvement – this will support colleagues who 
require professional revalidation  

 Diploma Patient safety and quality improvement 

 MSc  Patient safety and quality improvement  
 
The courses provide an inclusive opportunity for all multidisciplinary staff welcoming staff with 
different levels of experience and academic qualifications and initial expressions of interest have 
been very positive 
 
The Board will be aware that the QI work with junior doctors and medical students continues to be 
strengthened and valued by our doctors in training. Building on the previous success at the 
international conference in Gothenburg earlier this year, our NGH doctors in training project on 
standardisation of procedure trays was awarded the Innovation Prize at the East Midlands Quality 
Improvement forum in June. The forum brought together health & social care learners, educators 
and professionals from across the East Midlands to exhibit a range of quality improvement 
projects, share best practice and enhance learning. NGH junior doctors were very well represented 
generally and I am sure the success will lead to further enthusiasm from the NGH Junior Doctor 
Safety Board for Quality Improvement work at NGH. 
 
These achievements and external recognition that NGH is an organization committed to QI to 
continually improve patient care, have been a catalyst to a initiate preliminary discussions with 
Health Education England (HEE) for NGH to deliver QI education and training to GP trainees as a 
12 month pilot.  Now that The Academy of Medical Royal Colleges is advocating a core 
understanding of Quality Improvement is as important as doctors understanding of anatomy, 
physiology and biochemistry, there is a huge amount of interest in this area in the context of 
medical training. In view of the fact that multidisciplinary training is also regarded as of paramount 
importance, there is no better platform for real workplace based training than an organisation 
aligning all its efforts around quality improvement. Our developing quality improvement strategy as 
agreed at the Board session with the Advancing Quality Alliance will signal this organisational 
alignment as our key priority. 
 
2. STP 
The Northamptonshire System Transformation Plan builds on much of the work that has taken 
place as part of Heathier Together and Heathier Northamptonshire. The plan was submitted on 
30th June and was discussed at a national challenge meeting with Simon Stevens and other key 
leaders.  

 
The Northamptonshire plan is regarded as a sensible and pragmatic plan which should result in 
improvements in quality of care, efficiency and financial sustainability over the next 5 years.  The 
plan makes it clear that the enablers of change will need to receive the highest priority. These 
include development of the workforce, development of the IT infrastructure, and development of 
primary and community care and estate issues. If these issues can be appropriately addressed 
then the vision of ensuring high quality hospital care for those that need it and ensuring much more 
care can be delivered in the community can be translated into a clear implementation plan.  

 
For NGH and KGH the challenge is to provide services clearly based on the needs of the 
population in a way that integrates the patient pathways so that care is more patient centred, more 
efficient and can meet the quality and capacity needs of the future.  

 
Solving the current issues in urgent care remains central to all of the plans. The national team have 
asked us to refine the plans further over the next 2 months. One of the biggest challenges will be to 
refine a clear sequenced implementation plan supported by all partners in health and social care at 
a time when there is very little addition resource and when all our leaders and managers are 
already fully committed.  

 
The need to close the financial gap predicted for the NHS over the next 5 years is also critically 
important and we do need to provide a great deal more detail on how this can be done. 
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The ambition is to ensure that these transformation plans become a part of routine business and it 
is partly for that reason that the funding coming down from HEE for workforce transformation will 
be starting with a comprehensive programme of organisation development for all our teams across 
the system and will include engagement of the workforce and development of the workforce. 

 
3.  Brexit  
In response to the level of concern raised by the recent Referendum I issued a dedicated blog for 
NGH staff to reinforce our absolute commitment to valuing every member of staff.  At the same 
time I felt it important that we acknowledge that all our overseas staff, whether from the EU or 
further afield, add so much to team NGH. 

 
Clearly the outcome of the Referendum will have big implications and we will have to wait and see 
how legislation evolves.  One concern is that a lot of attention will be focused on Brexit which might 
otherwise be spent on solving some of our current problems.  

 
However, this is definitely a time to remember that change is inevitable, that the referendum result 
will have far reaching implications, but that nothing is likely to change very quickly - and in 
particular we will continue to need to recruit a workforce from other countries. 

 
For the NHS then and for NGH this should be a time to go back to first principles. For the NHS it is 
time to remember that we have a cradle to grave service that provides healthcare free at the point 
of access and is something to be proud of. The NHS has been dependent on a multinational highly 
skilled workforce for a long time.  

 
In recent times we have been recruiting large numbers of nurses from the EU and further afield 
and increasingly are reliant on medical staff from other countries. This is so much part of our ethos 
that we mostly assume that this will continue. We simply do not train enough nurses and doctors to 
meet the demand on the services we provide. 

 
We need these people and they need us and what we also need to remember is that diversity in 
the workforce brings great value. We learn more about ourselves and more about others and 
provide better care if we embrace difference. 

 
For NGH now more than ever before, with the pressures on the service being as they are, it is time 
once again to remember our overall aim of Best Possible Care and the values that underpin this. 
They are all about keeping our patients safe, learning, improving, aiming for excellence and, most 
importantly, of us all respecting and supporting each other. 

 
The NHS workforce has been under increasing pressure in recent years and there is a clear need 
to ensure that as we plan for the workforce of the future we increase the training opportunities for 
the many new roles that will be required as part of the realisation of the 5 year forward view .  
 
Locally the STP is also identifying the need for a different kind of workforce. This will bring a range 
of opportunism both for existing staff and for the future workforce. There will be new opportunities 
to bring in the very many young people interested in a career in health and social care and new 
roles that will broaden access at entry and improve development opportunities for those in post. 
The Local Workforces Advisory Board for the STP (LWAB) will be considering these issues in 
some detail. 

 
4. Best Possible Care Awards 
This year we have received a record number of nominations for our Best Possible Care Awards.  
The judging panel was faced with some difficult choices and it is important for everyone who was 
nominated to know that what they do is recognised and celebrated. 
 
The shortlisted nominees (six in each of the ten award categories) are now being contacted and 
every person or team nominated will receive a personal thank–you and acknowledgement from me 
and the chairman. 
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I am looking forward to the award presentations on 30th September and encourage as many board 
members as possible to join us on what, I know, will be an uplifting evening as we celebrate team 
NGH. 
 
 
Dr Sonia Swart 
Chief Executive 
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Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 
 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
 

 
 

 
Title of the Report 
 
 

 
Medical Director’s Report 

 
Agenda item 
 
 

  
8 

Sponsoring Director 
 

Dr Michael Cusack, Medical Director 

Author(s) of Report 
 

Dr Michael Cusack, Medical Director 

Purpose 
 
 

Assurance 
 

Executive summary 
 
Four new Serious Incidents have been reported during the reporting period 1/5/2016 – 30/6/2016 which 
remain open and under investigation. Where appropriate immediate actions have been agreed at the SI 
Group to mitigate the risk recurrence. There have been seven Serious Incidents which have been 
reported since 01/04/2016. Five Serious Incident reports have been submitted to the CCG for closure 
during the reporting period – one of which relates to a Never Event. 
 
Following a review of the incident investigation process at NGH, this has been revised and the title of 
the meeting has been changed to the Review of Harm Group which better describes its function. 
 
Dr Foster data showed overall mortality expressed as the HSMR and SHMI remains within the ‘as 
expected’ range. The Trust remains within expected compared to hospital Trusts nationally for the two 
patient safety indicators related to mortality. There is no evidence of a ‘weekend effect’ in relation to 
mortality. 
 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Be a provider of quality care for all our patients 
 

Risk and Assurance Risks to patient safety if the Trust does not robustly investigate and 
identify any remedial actions required in the event of a Significant 
Incident or mortality alert. 
 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 1.4, BAF 1.5, BAF 4.1 and BAF 4.2  
 

Equality Impact Assessment 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed decision/ 
policy will not promote equality of opportunity for all or promote 
good relations between different groups? (Y/N) 
 
Is there potential for or evidence that the proposed decision/policy 
will affect different population groups differently (including possibly 
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discriminating against certain groups)?(Y/N) 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 
 

Are there any legal/regulatory implications of the paper 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
  
The Board is asked to note the contents of this report, details of clinical risks, mortality and the serious 
incidents declared and identify areas for which further assurance is sought. 
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Public Trust Board 

28 July 2016 
 

Medical Director’s Report 
 
The purpose of this report is to highlight areas of concern in respect to clinical quality and 

safety at NGH to the Trust Board. 

 

1. Summary Serious Incident Profile 
 

Shown in the table below are the numbers of Serious Incidents and Never Events which 
have been reported on the Strategic Executive Information System (StEIS) by year since 
2010: 
 

 10/11 11/12 12/13 13/14 14/15  15/16 16/17 

Serious 
Incidents 

 
27 

 
55 

 
78 

 
115 

 
93 

 
11 

 
6 

Never 
Events 

 
2 

 
2 

 
1 

 
0 

 
1 

 
3 

 
1 

 
In 2015/16 there were three serious incidents which met the criteria for Never Events and 
have been reported to the Board previously. In 2016/17 there has been a further incident 
which has been declared as a Never Event following the gathering of further through initial 
investigation. A summary of this Never Event and the learning identified from the 
investigation is described here:  
 

STEIS/Datix 
Ref. 

Date 
Reported 

on 
STEIS 

STEIS Criteria / SI Brief 
Detail 

Directorate 

2016/9477 
 

07 Apr 
2016 

Retained object during 
gynaecological procedure 

Anaesthetics, Critical Care and Theatres 

Learning identified from the investigation: 
 

 Trust wide - All objects intended for removal at the end of surgery must be recorded on the 
swabs and instruments board and be included in the “count” within the PACKS category 

 To incorporate process for counting, logging and removal of all relevant items within existing 
Trust policy. 

 To ensure that all areas (including those outside theatres) are compliant with updated policy. 

 To formalise and agree on the specific item to be used in place of the pack/bung and 
communicate to all Gynaecological surgical teams. 
 

 
One Never Event that was reported in 2015/16 and subsequently been investigated has 
since been submitted to the CCG for closure and is detailed below: 
 

STEIS/Datix 
Ref. 

Date 
Reported 

on 
STEIS 

STEIS Criteria / SI Brief 
Detail 

Directorate 

2016/143 04 Jan 
2016 

Wrong site surgery Womens’ 
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Learning identified from the investigation: 
 

 Review of WHO check process – incorporated in work of the Theatres Review Group 

 Consideration of the use of ICE system by surgeons to confirm the procedure to be performed  

 Implementation of robust mini-time out where appropriate before major surgical interventions 
and selection of implants/prostheses. 

 Roll out of the updated theatre standards to comply with the National Safety Standards for 
Invasive Procedures (NatSSIPs)   

 The incident and learning to be shared through Governance Groups, ‘Dare to Share’ learning 
event 

  

 
 

1.1. New Serious Incidents 
 
Since the last report to the Board, during the reporting period 1/5/2016 – 30/6/2016 4 new 
Serious Incidents have been reported. 
 
A Root Cause Analysis (RCA) is being undertaken into each of these incidents. The Trust 
has a contractual agreement with the CCG to submit all RCA reports to them within a 60 
working day timeframe; provide evidence to support the Duty of Candour requirement; and 
provide evidence to support the completion of RCA action plans via the Serious Incident 
Assurance Meetings (SIAM). 
 
Within 2016/17, 7 Serious Incidents have been reported under the following categories: 

 Surgical/invasive procedure 

 Sub-optimal care 

 Delay in treatment/referral to specialist team 

 Slips/Trips/Falls 

 Complication during surgery 
 
 

1.2. Open Serious Incidents 
 
The serious incidents at 30th June 2016 which remain open and under investigation are 
listed below: 
 

STEIS/Datix 
Ref. 

Date 
Reported 
on STEIS 

STEIS Criteria / SI Brief Detail Directorate 

2016-9316 
W-61695 

06 Apr 
2016 

Surgical Complication 
/Nephrectomy 

General & Specialist Surgery 

2016/12689 
& W-62695 

10 May 
2016 

Ophthalmology - Delay in 
Appointment 

 
Surgery Division 

2016/15015 
W-63558 

02 Jun 
2016 

Sub Optimal Care of 
Deteriorating Patient 

Urgent Care 

2016/15999 
W-56836 & 
W-58943 

13 Jun 
2016 

2 x falls = # of R + L NOF General & Specialist Surgery 
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2016/16728 
W-63014 

21 Jun 
2016 

EVAR Stent  - complications 
during procedure 

General & Specialist Surgery 

  
 

1.3. Serious Incidents Submitted for Closure 
 
During the reporting period there were five serious incident reports submitted to Nene and 
Corby Clinical Commissioning Group (CCG) for closure, one of which relates to a Never 
Event. The remaining four are listed here: 
 

 STEIS 2016/3968 Digit amputation – Trauma & Orthopaedics 

 STEIS 2016/4318 Fall resulting in a parenchymal haemorrhage - Medicine 

 STEIS 2016/8058 Deterioration following transfer to another hospital - Medicine 

 STEIS 2016/9931 Medication interaction potentially resulting in hyperkalemia – 
Medicine 
 

 

2. Review of Harm Group 
 
The Incident Investigation process at NGH has been reviewed to ensure that it remains fit for 
purpose and builds on good practice. This has also ensured that the process aligns with the 
new Serious Incident Framework (published 2015) and subsequent revision of the process 
and template issued by the CCGs. 

The SI Group commonly reviews incidents where there has been both moderate and severe 
harm therefore the title of the meeting was potentially misleading. This has as a result been 
changed to better reflect the group’s function – Review of Harm Group. The terms of 
reference and agenda have also been amended accordingly. 

The investigation panels will be drawn from a registered group of staff working to the 
timescales shown in Appendix 1. Using HealthAssure will facilitate transparent monitoring 
and allow the generated action plans to be circulated widely supporting organisational 
learning. 

 

3. Mortality Monitoring 

The HSMR for the year to March 2016 (latest Dr Foster data) remains with the ‘as expected’ 

range at 96.7. The overall 12 month trend is shown in the graph below: 
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The HSMR for NGH and that of the Trust peer group is shown in the funnel plot below: 

 

The crude (unadjusted) mortality for the HSMR group of diagnoses was 3.26% (peer group 

mean was 3.64%). 

The SHMI for the period January to December 2015 is 98.4 (as expected) and SHMI trend is 

shown below: 
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3.1. Patient Safety Indicators 

The Trust remains within expected compared to hospital Trusts nationally for the two patient 
safety indicators related to mortality (deaths in low risk diagnosis groups and deaths after 
surgery): 

 Deaths in low risk diagnosis groups RR = 92.3 

 Deaths after surgery RR = 105  
 
 

3.2. Weekend Effects 

For the rolling year ending to January 2016 there was no statistical difference between the 

standardised mortality rates for weekend [97.4] and weekday admissions [98.2]. 

 

4. Next Steps 

The Review of Harm Group will meet on a weekly basis as described in the report to 

expedite the agreement & external notification of Serious Incidents. 

 

Mortality within the Trust is closely monitored and reported through the Quality Governance 

Committee. The Mortality Surveillance Group model has been adopted in accordance with 

NHSE recommendations and will provide assurance to Trust Board.   

 

This Board is asked to seek clarification where necessary and assurance regarding the 

information contained within this report. 
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Nursing & Midwifery Care Report 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
9 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Carolyn Fox, Director of Nursing, Midwifery & Patient Services  

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Fiona Barnes, Deputy Director of Nursing 
Jason King, Associate Director of Nursing 
Senior Nursing & Midwifery Team  

 
Purpose 
 

 
Assurance & Information  

Executive summary  
 
This report provides an update and progress on a number of clinical projects and improvement 
strategies that the Nursing & Midwifery senior team are working on.  An abridged version of this report, 
providing an overview of the key quality standards, will become available on the Trusts website as part 
of the Monthly Open & Honest Care Report.   
 
Key points from this report: 

 Safety Thermometer – The Trust achieved 98.2% harm free care with new harms. 

 In June the number of reported pressure ulcers was 19. These will be validated in July at the 
‘share and learn’ meeting. 

 There has been 2 C. Difficile case reported in June 2016, 0 MRSA Bacteraemia, and 1 MSSA 
bacteraemia. 

 In June there has been 2 in-patient falls that has caused severe harm and are currently under 
investigation. 

 FFT in June 2016– Inpatients 89.8%, OPD 91.2%, Emergency Dept. 85% and Maternity 97.4% 
‘would’ recommend 

 

 
Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

 
Quality & Safety. 
We will avoid harm, reduce mortality, and improve patient 
outcomes through a focus on quality outcomes, effectiveness and 
safety 

Risk and assurance The report aims to provide assurance to the Trust regarding the 
quality of nursing and midwifery care being delivered 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 1.3 and 1.5 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Are there any legal/regulatory implications of the paper - NO 

 
Actions required by the Board 
The Board is asked to discuss and where appropriate challenge the content of this report and to 
support the work moving forward.  
 
The Board is asked to support the on-going publication of the Open & Honest Care Report on to the 
Trust’s website which will include safety, staffing and improvement data. 
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Public Trust Board 
     28 July 2016 

 
Nursing & Midwifery Care Report 

 
1. Introduction  

The Nursing & Midwifery (N&M) Care Report presents highlights from areas, audits and projects 
during the month of June 2016.  Key quality and safety standards will be summarised from this 
monthly report to share with the public on the NGH website as part of the ‘Open & Honest’ Care 
report.  This monthly report supports the Trust to become more transparent and consistent in 
publishing safety, experience and improvement data, with the overall aim of improving care, 
practice and culture. 
 
The Nursing and Midwifery Quality Dashboard provides triangulated data utilising quality outcome 
measures, patient experience and workforce informatics.  Please see appendix 3 
   
 

2. Midwifery Update 
Sign Up to Safety 
 
In March 2016, the maternity services put together a ‘Sign up to Safety’ improvement plan with the 
overall aim to reduce the number stillbirths and undiagnosed small-for-gestational age babies by 
50% by March 2018.  The improvement plan specifically focuses on identifying women who smoke 
during pregnancy and implementing an innovative midwife led pathway which includes increased 
antenatal surveillance.   
 

 
3. Safety Thermometer  
The graph below shows the percentage of all new harms attributed to the Trust.  In June 2016 
NGH achieved 98.2% harm free care (new harms).  Please see appendix 1 for the definition of 
safety thermometer. 

 

 
 
 

85%
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In June 2016 NGH achieved 93.43% of harm free care, with 1.76% of patients on the day recorded 
in the category of ‘new’ harm (sustained during whilst they were in our care) which is an 
improvement from May 2016 which was 2.22%.  Broken down into the four categories this equated 
to: 2 falls with harm, 0 VTE, 1 CRUTI and 18 ‘new’ pressure ulcers. 
 
 

4. Pressure Ulcer Incidence 
 
In June 19 patients were harmed whilst in the care of Northampton General Hospital, resulting in 
27 pressure ulcers. 7 patients had 2 or more harms.  
 
 

 
 

The Graph above shows the pressure ulcers/1000 bed days in relation to hospital acquired 
pressure damage. The three points shown above were the pressure ulcer collaboratives which 
took place; there have been 3 in total. 
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The table below shows the total number of patients that have been harmed whilst in our care from 
April 2016-June 2016. 

 
 
For the period covering April – June 2016 a total of 72 patients were harmed, resulting in 91 
pressure ulcers. 

 
The Tissue Viability Lead Nurse met with Director of Nursing, Midwifery & Patient Services, Deputy 
Director of Nursing and QAI (Quality Assurance and Improvement) Matron to review Data Quality.  
A number of changes to the process have been identified which include: 

1. Weekly Share & Learn meetings, to commence week beginning 8th August 2016. 

2 Validation of all Hospital Acquired Pressure Ulcers by member of Tissue Viability Team on 
the ward, which has been commenced. 

3. Introduction of new Grade 2 Investigation Tool. 

4. To remove the use of terminology around avoidable/unavoidable across Trust, instead 
identifying ‘lapses in care’.  

5. Re-examine the use of Safety Boards (not Safety Cross) to record/document “days since   
last pressure ulcer acquired on ward”, rather than days since last avoidable pressure ulcer 
acquired on ward.                       

 

5. Infection Prevention and Control NHS Improvement Programme  

As reported in April’s IPT is working with NHS Improvement on an Infection Prevention and Control 
Improvement Programme. The Trust is working with 22 other Trusts in a 90 day collaborative. The 
launch provided an opportunity to meet with other organisations to share good practice and work 
together to raise the profile of infection prevention and to make a measurable and sustainable 
difference.  
IPT continue to work with Collingtree, Willow and Creaton (formerly Allebone) wards continue to 
ramp up their PDSA (Plan, Do, Study Act) cycles and test of change in readiness for the next 
collaborative event. Benham Assessment Unit and the Emergency Admission Unit (EAU) have 
now joined the Infection Prevention collaborative and a test of change is being undertaken with the 
admission checklist paperwork with these areas. Following July 8th July 2016 meeting with NHS 
improvement the collaborative work will require ‘scaling up and spreading’ across the Trust.  
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Performance Information 

Clostridium difficile Infection 

Clostridium difficile infection (Trust apportioned) 

 

 

The graph above shows to date that there have been 5 cases of Clostridium difficile infection 
apportioned to the Trust.  2 patients identified with CDI for June 2016. 
 
 
The table below demonstrates the Trust apportioned cases to date that are awaiting review.  
 
 

CDI Cases  
CDI cases no lapse 

in care to date 
CDI cases 

lapses in care 
CDI cases awaiting 

review 

5 4 0 1 

 
 

MRSA Bacteraemia  

For June there has been 0 trust attributable MRSA bacteraemia. 
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MSSA Bacteraemia  

MSSA Bacteraemia (Trust attributable cumulative totals) 

 

 

 

There is no national target set for MSSA bacteraemia. The Infection Prevention forward plan has 
set an ambition of no more than 15 cases for 2016/2017.  For June 2016 there was 1 trust 
attributable case. To date there have been 2 trust attributable cases.  

A post infection review is being undertaken for the patient identified in June and the findings will 
be reported in next month’s report following the review.  

 

Escherichia coli (E.coli) Bacteraemia  

 

 

There is no national target set for E.coli bacteraemias.  For June there were 3 Trust attributable 
cases.  
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Source of Infection Number of Cases 

Urosepsis 1 

Unknown 2 

 

The table above provides the breakdown of source and number of E.coli bacteraemia cases for  

June 2016. 

 

Outbreak and incidents  
No outbreaks of infection were reported in June 2016 

 

Catheter-Related Urinary Tract Infections (CRUTI) 

 
 
The graph above shows that for June 2016 there was 1 trusts attributable CRUTI’s, this was 
attributed to Willow ward and a Root Cause Analysis is in progress.  

 

Beat the Bug Update 
The quality visits continue with 14 wards visited in June. Finding of these visits can been seen 
below: 
 
Positive findings: 

 Floors are clean, and free from dust and extraneous items 

 Waste Bins were free from dust including behind the bin 

 All urinary catheters were above  the floor but below bladder 
level 

 The bays were free form unpleasant odours 

 Isolation precautions are in place e.g. sign on the door 
 

Areas for Improvement : 

 Blue ANTT trays were not always found to be clean and dry 
and stored inverted 

 Commode cleaning 

 Chlorclean tablets require being stored in a locked cupboard 

 The TVs, vents, radiators, bedframes, curtain rails, back of 
lockers, tops of doors including door frames were not all 
dust free 
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All of the above findings were fed back to the ward managers verbally and through a written report. 
All findings are followed up by the Infection Prevention Team on their weekly visits to the ward.  
 
 
 

6.  Falls Prevention 
Falls/1000 bed days  
 
The way in which we calculate our bed days has change from 1st April 2016; we are now not 
including bed days from the Barret. This results in our bed days being lower and therefore may 
make our falls/1000 bed days appear higher if compared with last year. Therefore as these figures 
are not comparable with previous years an SPC chart or run chart cannot reliably be generated. 
Last year’s figures are below for information only 
 
 
 

 

 

The Trust’s Falls/1000 bed days is below the national average and the (internally set) target.  
 
Maximum of 1.6 harmful falls/1000 bed days (internally set target). 
 
It can be seen from the graph below that the harmful falls/1000 bed days is below the internally set 
target. 
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Falls resulting in moderate, severe or catastrophic harm 
 
This month (June) 

 
 
 
 
 

 
This month we reported 3 in-patient falls that caused at least 'moderate' harm. Some of these falls 
are still being investigated and the severity of the injury may be reviewed once the investigation is 
complete. One fall resulted in moderate harm resulted in a fractured dislocated humerus), 2 
fractured neck of femurs and 1 patient died on the 6th June after they had fallen on the 26th May. 
IAF completed, circulated to SIG. 
 
 
 
Work underway to reduce the falls rate/improve post fall care:  

 Quality Assurance & Improvement matron has undertaken a ‘gap analysis’ of the recent Falls 
NICE guidance, the Trusts current Falls care plan, Bed rail assessment and care plan to 
objectively consider if further improvements can be made.  The outcome will be discussed by 
the Falls Team, including Dr Shah and Patient Nursing Services.  

 Training as part of cluster days, simulation suite sessions (including neurological observation 
simulation training sessions for Nurses) and junior doctors training continues with positive 
evaluations 

 New simulation suite session piloted in April 2016 was very successful-plan to roll-out 

 (0.6 WTE) B7 Deputy Falls Prevention Coordinator  commenced work in May 

 Lead Falls Prevention Coordinator successfully recruited – due to start in the autumn, date to 
be confirmed. 

 Trial Nursing Falls care plan - feedback received, to be discussed at the Falls Prevention 
meeting on the 12th July 2016. 
 

7. Nursing and Midwifery Dashboard 
 

Please see appendix 2 for a definition of the Nursing Midwifery Dashboard and appendix 3 for the 
Nursing Midwifery dashboard for June 2016. 
 
The Quality Care Indicators (QCI) for June 2016 show the following: 

 ‘First impressions’ section is the area of the month with most of the red and amber ratings.  
On further examination of this, this was due to the fact that there were a number of wards 
where it had been suggested that this requires some improvement.  After discussion with 
some of the Matron’s this often relates to clutter on ward areas.  Work is being undertaken 
with these specific Wards to reduce clutter and improve initial impressions. 

 Compliance with falls assessments and care planning has improved again this month.  
Ward areas continue to monitor and implement suggestions from the Falls Group. 

 The section which covers Patient Safety and Quality is showing a negative response with 
regards to staff understanding of how to access the Trust transfer defibrillator/monitor for 
use when transferring acutely ill patients between wards/departments.  Work is being 
undertaken divisionally to improve this. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Severity of injury  Number of falls last month 

Moderate 1 
Severe 2 
Death 1 
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8. Friends & Family Test  
FFT Overview- % Would Recommend Run Charts  

 
 
 

 Trust wide results for the amount of patients that would recommend continue to rise with 
April and May both sitting above the mean line.  

 The Trust wide results directly correlate with the improvements seen within Inpatient 
Wards. Below is the run chart from Nov-14 till May-15 
 

 
 

 It is evident from looking at the run chart that improvements have begun to be made for 
Inpatient services, particularly when comparing Nov-14 through to May-15.  

 

 
9.  Collaborative working with NHFT 
 
NGH has undertaken some collaborative working with NHFT, with an aim to provide support to our 
HCA’s working on our ward areas caring for those patients with dementia and challenging 
behaviour.  The training sessions are being supported by Jenny Reece who is Team Lead -Liaison 
Psychiatry for older people, KGH & NGH Community Psychiatric Nurse for Angela Grace Care 
Home and another colleague trainer. 

There are 4 training dates available to up to 80 staff members, these dates have been filled.  
These dates provide our staff with an ideal training and development opportunity to those 
individuals but with a real patient focus.  The outcomes of the training will be reported on in a future 
report 
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10. National Research Project using Patient Experience Data 

 The Trust has been successfully selected  to be one of six organisations to be part of new 
research into exploring how frontline staff use patient experience data for service improvement. 

 University of Oxford and Picker Institute Europe have been awarded research funding by the 
National Institute for Health Research to investigate how NHS frontline teams use different 
types of patient experience data for improvement. The project aims to build an understanding 
of which types of data or quality improvement approaches are more or less likely to be useful 
with frontline teams in making health care more person-centred.  The research will focus 
specifically on six frontline general medical ward teams, using a formative and exploratory case 
study approach.  

 Creaton Ward has been chosen to represent the Trust in this project and a small team, 
including patient representatives, are going to Oxford in the next week to understand the first 
stages of the research project.   

 

11. Dementia CQUINS  
 
 

Discharge Summaries 
 

Q1 Milestone Status Projection 

The provider must scope, in 
agreement with the CCG,  the 
methodology for identification of 
patients in relation to indicator (i) 
and the planned (elective) 
episodes of care included in 
indicator (ii). 

i Proposed methodology for 
identification of patients with a 
known existing diagnosis identified 

Achieved 

ii Elective surgery patients were 
excluded as part of 2015/16 (and 
preceeding) CQUINS.  This 
exlusion was enforced 'at source' 
and has been removed from the 
parameters for the denominator 
calculation 

Achieved 

 
 
Underpinning the Discharge Summaries CQUIN is the FAIRI, which, as reported previously, 
although no longer a reportable measure for the CQUIN, is essential for achieving the discharge 
summary target.  Compliance for the year to date is below: 
 

 
 
 
 
John’s Campaign 
The milestones for achievement of John’s Campaign (Carer visiting) are attributed to Q2.  Internal 
timelines have been implemented to ensure achievement and a progress report will be reported to 
the Patient Experience and Engagement Group in August. 
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Safeguarding Referral Activity  
 

 
 
The rate of referrals to MASH for Children in need of Protection is decreasing, in line with 
Improvement Plan aspirations; the decreasing trend will be monitored to ensure quality of referral 
remains high and corresponding early help activity (both reported via the Safeguarding Assurance 
Group) is in place. 
 

 
 
The decreasing trend in referrals against the Trust continues, and this remains an area of 
considerable focus with increased activity over the summer months to ensure concerns regarding 
care are addressed at point of origin in order to reduce the necessity for referral. 
 
Carers Survey 
 
Whilst no longer part of the CQUIN, the Dementia Liaison Service continues to seek the views of 
carers in order to make continues improvement to care provided, the key responses for this are 
shown in the graph below (n=25). 
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Learning Disability 
 

 
 
The development of the Learning Disability Service Plan, approved by PEEG in June 2016, will see 
new metrics and projects during 2016/17.  These will be reported through the Learning Disability 
Steering Group. 
 
The Learning Disability Steering Group will monitor progress against plans to improve compliance 
with the Quality Schedule targets. 
 
Education and Training 
The following two charts demonstrate the training compliance (Trust position) for Safeguarding 
Children and Safeguarding Adults respectively: 
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12. The Nutrition and Hydration Steering Group 
 
In February the Trust set up a Nutrition and Hydration Steering Group.  The purpose of the 
Steering Group is to review, evaluate relevant local and national nutrition and hydration policies, 
and initiatives, within the Trust. There have been two meeting to date and a highlight report is 
received by the Clinical Quality & Effectiveness Group on a quarterly basis.  The terms of 
reference have been agreed and the formalisation of an operational sub group, the Nutrition & 
Catering Group, has also been agreed and ratified. 
 
To date the Steering Group has received a detailed gap analysis undertaken by the QAI matron 
providing an overview of the progress against a number of national standards, NICE guidance and 
NHS England’s Guidance – Commissioning Excellent Nutrition and Hydration 2015-2018.  Due to 
the extended period of time without a full time Nutritional Clinical Nurse Specialist (CNS) there are 
a number of gaps relating to policies across the Trust and there are specific actions for adult and 
children services.  An action plan will be developed to address the highlighted gaps which will be 
lead through the Nutrition & Catering Group.  The reduced availability of a Nutritional CNS has 
been raised as a risk on the Trust Risk register. 
 
The last Steering Group meeting also received an update on the Fluid Balance audits that the QAI 
matrons have undertaken with improvements noted across the Trust on each audit.  
 
Part of the forward plan for the Steering Group is the development of a Food & Hydration Strategy 
that is due in draft at the next meeting in August 2016.  
 
 

13.       Recommendations 
The Board is asked to note the content of the report, support the mitigating actions required to 
address the risks presented and continue to provide appropriate challenge and support. 
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Appendix 1 

Safety Thermometer Definition 

The Department of Health introduced the NHS Safety Thermometer “Delivering the NHS Safety 
Thermometer 2012” the initiative was also initially a CQuIN in 2013/14 to ensure the launch was 
sustained throughout the nation. The NHS Safety Thermometer is used nationally but is designed 
to be a local improvement tool for measuring, monitoring, and analysing patient harms and 
developing systems that then provide 'harm free' care. Developed for the NHS by the NHS as a 
point of care survey instrument, the NHS Safety Thermometer provides a ‘temperature check’ on 
harm that needs be used alongside Trusts data that is prevalence based and triangulated with 
outcome measures and resource monitoring. The national aim is to achieve 95% or greater harm 
free care for all patients, which to date the national average is running at 94.2%. 
 
The NHS Safety Thermometer has been designed to be used by frontline healthcare professionals 
to measure a ‘snapshot’ of harm once a month from pressure ulcers, falls with harm, urinary 
infection in patients with catheters and treatment for VTE. All inpatients (including those patients in 
theatres at the time but excluding paediatrics) are recorded by the wards and the data inputted 
onto the reporting system, on average NGH reports on 630+ patients each month. Once the 
information is validated by the sub-group teams it is uploaded onto the national server to enable a 
comparator to be produced. 
 
The Safety Thermometer produces point prevalence data on all harms (which includes harms that 
did not necessarily occur in hospital) and ‘new’ harms which do occur whilst in hospital – in the 
case of falls, VTE and CRUTI the classification of ‘new’ means within the last 72 hours, this is 
slightly different for pressure damage as ‘new’ is categorised as development that occurred in our 
care post 72 hours of admission to hospital and is recorded throughout the patient stay on the 
Safety Thermometer. Therefore pressure damage is the only category that if the patient remains 
an in-patient for the next month’s data collection it is recorded as ‘new’ again. 
 
NGH has a rigorous process in place for Safety Thermometer data collection, validation and 
submission. Four sub-groups for each category exist and are led by the specialists in the area, 
they monitor their progress against any reduction trajectory and quality schedule target. For 
pressure damage all harms are recorded on datix throughout the month (not just on this one day) 
reviews are undertaken to highlight any lapses in care, every area with an incident attends the 
Share and Learn forums to analyse further the incident and to develop plans for areas of 
improvement and future prevention. 
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Appendix 2 

Nursing and Midwifery Dashboard Description 

The Nursing & Midwifery dashboard is made up of a number of metrics that provide the Trust with 
“at a glance” RAG rated position against key performance indicators including the quality of care, 
patient experience, workforce resource and outcome measures. The framework for the dashboard 
was designed in line with the recommendations set out in the ‘High Quality Care Metrics for 
Nursing’ report 2012 which was commissioned by Jane Cummings via the Kings Fund. 
 
The Quality Care Indicators (QCI) is first section of the dashboard and is made up of several 
observational and review audits which are asked undertaken each month for in-patient areas. 
There are two types of indicators those questions designed for the specialist areas and those for 
the general in-patients. The specialist areas were designed against their specific requirements, 
quality measures and national recommendations; therefore as every area has different questions 
they currently have their own individual dashboards.  
 
Within the QCI assessment there are 15 sections reviewing all aspects of patient care, patient 
experience, the safety culture and leadership on the ward – this is assessed through a number of 
questions or observations in these 15 sections. In total 147 questions are included within the QCI 
assessment, for 96 of the questions 5 patients are reviewed, 5 staff is asked and 5 sets of records 
are reviewed. Within parts of the observational sections these are subjective however are also 
based on the ’15 Steps’ principles which reflect how visitors feel and perceive an area from what 
they see, hear and smell.  
 
The dashboard will assist the N&MPF in the assessment of achievement of the Nursing & 
Midwifery objectives and standards of care. The dashboard is made up using four of the five 
domains within the 2015/16 Accountability Framework. The dashboard triangulates the QCI data, 
Safety Thermometer ‘harm free’ care, pressure ulcer prevalence, falls with harm, infection rates, 
overdue patient observations (Vitalpac), nursing specific complaints & PALS, FFT results, safe 
staffing rates and staffing related datix.  The domains used are: 
 

 Effective 

 Safe 

 Well led 

 Caring 
 
The Matrons undertake the QCI and upload the data by the 3rd of each month. The N&M 
dashboard is populated monthly by the Information Team and will be ready no later than the 10th of 
the month. At the monthly N&MPF the previous month’s dashboard will be presented in full and 
Red and Amber areas discussed and reviewed by the senior nursing team. Due to the timings of 
the NMPF meeting the current month’s QCI data will be presented verbally by the Matrons with 
particular attention to any below standard sections, if this is a continued pattern and what actions 
are in place to support the ward in improving these areas. The Senior Nursing & Midwifery Team, 
led by the Director of Nursing, will hold the Matrons to account for performance at this meeting and 
will request actions if performance is below the expected standard. The Matrons and ward 
Sister/Charge Nurse will have two months to action improvements and assure N&MPF with 
regards to the methodology and sustainability of the actions. The Matrons will be responsible for 
presenting their results at the Directorate Meetings and having 1:1 confirm & challenge with their 
ward Sisters/Charge Nurse. The Director of Nursing will highlight areas of good practice and any 
themes or areas of concern via the N&M Care Report. 
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Declaration of Compliance against Mixed Sex 
Accommodation 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
10 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Carolyn Fox, Director of Nursing, Midwifery & Patient Services  

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Carolyn Fox, Director of Nursing, Midwifery & Patient Services  
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
Assurance & Information  

Executive summary  
 

 The attached document is the Trust declaration of compliance against the requirements to 
eliminate mixed sex accommodation for the fiscal year of 2015/16.  
 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

To be able to provide a quality care to all our patients 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

The report aims to provide assurance to the Trust regarding the 
quality of nursing and midwifery care being delivered 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 1 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (N) 
 
 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
 28 July 2016 
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Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Are there any legal/regulatory implications of the paper - NO 

 
Actions required by the Board 
 
For information only. 
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Delivering Same-Sex Accommodation 
Declaration of compliance – July 2016 

 
Northampton General Hospital is proud in its achievement of continuing in eliminating mixed 

sex accommodation. 
 
Delivering same sex accommodation 
Every patient has the right to receive high quality care that is safe, effective and respects their 
privacy and dignity.  Northampton General Hospital is committed to providing every patient with 
same sex accommodation, because it helps to safeguard their privacy and dignity when they are 
often at their most vulnerable.  
 
We are proud to confirm that mixed sex accommodation has been eliminated in our trust.  Patients 
who are admitted will only share their bed area with members of the same sex, and same sex 
toilets and bathrooms will be close to their bed area.   
Within our day case areas separate toilet and changing facilities are in place and same sex lists are 
in operation where appropriate. 
 
Sharing with members of the opposite sex will only happen by exception based on clinical need for 
example where patients need specialist equipment or care such as in ITU or CCU or when patients 
choose to share. 
 
What does this mean for patients? 
Other than in the circumstances set out above, patients admitted to Northampton General Hospital 
can expect to find the following 

 
 

Same sex-accommodation means: 

 Your bed area (bay) within the main ward will only have patients of the same sex as you 

 Your toilet and bathroom will be just for your gender, and will be close to your bed area  
 
It is possible that there will be both men and women patients on the ward, but they will not share 
your sleeping area.  You may have to cross a ward corridor to reach your bathroom, but you will 
not have to walk through opposite-sex areas. 
 
You may share some communal space, such as day rooms or dining rooms, and it is very likely 
that you will see both men and women patients as you move around the hospital (eg on your 
way to X-ray or the operating theatre). 
 
It is probable that visitors of the opposite gender will come into the room where your bed is, and 
this may include patients visiting each other. 
 
It is almost certain that both male and female nurses, doctors and other staff will come into your 
bed area.  
 
If you need additional help to use the toilet or take a bath (eg you need a hoist or special bath) 
then you may be taken to a “unisex” bathroom used by both men and women, but a member of 
staff will be with you, and other patients will not be in the bathroom at the same time. 
 

The NHS will not turn patients away just because a “right-sex” bed is not immediately 
available 
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What are our plans for the future? 
 
In any new developments we will be ensuring facilities are planned to promote same sex 
accommodation.  
Patients and public are involved in any new facilities to ensure they are fit for purpose 
We have a Privacy & Dignity Forum which meets quarterly and is attended by Dignity Champions 
from every ward.  
 
How will we measure success? 
 
We are currently using a variety of patient feedback mechanisms which include patient advice and 
liaison service (PALS) and the Friends & Family test in all areas, the results of which are fed back 
to every ward and department to ensure standards are maintained. 
 
All exceptions of same sex accommodation are escalated for approval by a director of the trust; 
these exceptions are then recorded by directorates and reported to the trust board. 
 
What do I do if I think I am in mixed sex accommodation? 
 
We want to know about your experiences.  Please contact the nurse in charge or ward/unit 
manager in the first instance or contact PALS on 01604 545784 if you have any comments, 
concerns or compliments. 
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attended the A&E department during the 24 hours in which the survey was conducted, had 
attempted to, or managed to speak to a healthcare professional prior to coming  to A&E.   

 The comments made by patients throughout the survey indicate some issues with gaining 
access to the GP Surgery. It is apparent when reviewing patient’s responses that a great 
deal of faith is placed in the hands of the healthcare professionals that patients have 
contacted, in particular GP’s and the 111 service 

 Telephone conversations (as opposed to face to face consultations) led to 64% of patients 
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Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
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Summary  
 
Background 

 
Northampton General Hospital (NGH) have witnessed the increase in demand for A&E and statistics 
produced for the 15/16 annual report show  an increase of 6393 patients from 13/14 to 15/16, an 
average of 17 more patients within the department each day.  
 
It is evident that a better understanding as to why patients are opting to attend A&E is necessary for 
identifying measures to prevent inappropriate attendances where possible, moving forward. 
 
This project therefore aimed to understand the following; 
 

 Why are patients presenting at A&E? 

 Did they contact any other healthcare providers first? If so, who? 

 What did the healthcare provider say? 

 Were they advised to come to A&E? 

 Do they (the patient) believe A&E is the right place for them today? 

 Was the patient an appropriate attendance- and if not, where should they have been treated? 

 

Methodology 

 
The hospital opted to conduct a patient survey to gain patients own understanding on their attendance to 
the department for that day. The survey covered 24 hours from 8am on the 22

nd
 of March until 8am on 

the 23
rd Patients were asked to complete the survey if they were in the waiting room at the main 

entrance of the department, or within the children’s waiting room.  One of the key aspects of this project 
was to identify whether the patient should have been within the department, or whether they could have 
been treated elsewhere Following data entry into excel an extract for the time period of the survey was 
taken from the PAS. Patients who had participated in the survey were identified and a clinical opinion 
was made from the Associate Director of Nursing for Medicine Division, as to whether the patient 
required emergency treatment, or whether they could have been treated by a GP within a primary care 
setting. 
 

Results 

 
 In total, 144 patients took part in the survey, giving a response rate of 50%.  

 Of the 141 patients that answered,65% (n=92) stated they had spoken to a healthcare 
professional prior to attending the A&E Department. When asked who they had spoken to, of 
those that responded (n=87) the majority of patients had spoken to either a GP (n=33) or the 
111 out of hours service (n=23). The next most common person that patients stated they had 
spoken to was the GP Surgery Receptionist (n=10).  

 When reviewing the patients that had been in touch either with a GP, the 111 service or the GP 
Receptionist, 66 patients were advised to attend A&E. When totalled, the majority of patients 
were advised to come to A&E by their GP or GP reception. Ten Patients in total stated they had 
spoken to their GP reception before attending A&E.  

 Patients were asked whether they themselves believed that A&E was the right place for them at 
that point. Of those that responded (n=133), 89% felt that they were in the right place, 10% 
stated they didn’t believe so and 1% were unsure 

 The majority (73%) of patients stated their symptoms or illness as a reason for attending, these 
were themed as ‘Require treatment’. Of the remaining 27%, 6% of patients believed A&E was 
the right place for them because they had been told to attend by a GP. A further 6% said they 
felt it was the right place for them as they had been unable to get an appointment with their GP. 

 It was identified that 52% (n=73) of the patients surveyed were needed to be seen within the 
A&E department. However, 37% (n= 53) could have been seen by a GP. For 11% (15) it wasn’t 
clear. 

 looking at the results for patients stating they had spoken to a GP and been advised to attend 
A&E, from clinical opinion 64% (n=9) of the issues the patient presented with could have been 
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treated by a GP. For patients that saw a GP, 35% (N=6) could have been treated within primary 
care. Patients who spoke to the GP Receptionist who advised that there were no appointments, 
or for them to come to A&E 46% (5) could have been treated by a GP. The 111 service advised 
11 patients to come to present at A&E for issues which could have been managed in primary 
care facilities.  

 

Conclusion & Recommendations 

 
From reviewing the results to the survey It is apparent that a large number of patients that attended the 
A&E department during the 24 hours in which the survey was conducted, had attempted to, or managed 
to speak to a healthcare professional prior to coming  to A&E.  Of those that were advised to attend, a 
concerning amount were identified as potentially being inappropriate attendees to the department, with 
conditions and concerns which could have been dealt with elsewhere.  
 
The comments made by patients throughout the survey indicate some issues with gaining access to the 
GP Surgery. It is apparent when reviewing patient’s responses that a great deal of faith is placed in the 
hands of the healthcare professionals that patients have contacted, in particular GP’s and the 111 
service. Most patients that have attended A&E from the advice given by the healthcare professional, 
believe they are at the right place and evidently do not question this advice.  
 
Patients talked of their frustration of not being able to access their GP, with ‘No choice’ stated on a 
number of occasions as the reason for attending.  
 
Telephone conversations (as opposed to face to face consultations) led to 64% of patients being told to 
attend A&E when they could have been seen within a primary care setting.  
 
It is evident that there are a number of concerning factors with regards to patients attendance which if 
improved, could reduce the amount of patients presenting at A&E inappropriately; 
 

 Improved education for patients on when to access emergency services  

 Improved access to GP Services within primary care, particularly around face to face 
appointments as opposed to telephone calls  

 Improvement in the use of Pharmacy Services  

 Prevention of GP Receptionists advising patients to attend A&E or giving A&E as the alternative 
when there are no GP appointments available 

 Improvement in the accuracy of the advice given by the  national 111 service 
 
Ultimately, the biggest and most significant improvements are required within the primary care setting. 
None of the recommendations made relate to the services provided by the hospital, and instead refer to 
measures which can be taken within the community to prevent patients from attending A&E 
inappropriately.  
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Executive Summary  
 
Background 

 
Northampton General Hospital (NGH) have witnessed the increase in demand for A&E and statistics 
produced for the 15/16 annual report show  an increase of 6393 patients from 13/14 to 15/16, an 
average of 17 more patients within the department each day.  
 
It is evident that a better understanding as to why patients are opting to attend A&E is necessary for 
identifying measures to prevent inappropriate attendances where possible, moving forward. 
 
This project therefore aimed to understand the following; 
 

 Why are patients presenting at A&E? 

 Did they contact any other healthcare providers first? If so, who? 

 What did the healthcare provider say? 

 Were they advised to come to A&E? 

 Do they (the patient) believe A&E is the right place for them today? 

 Was the patient an appropriate attendance- and if not, where should they have been treated? 

 

Methodology 

 
The hospital opted to conduct a patient survey to gain patients own understanding on their attendance to 
the department for that day. The survey covered 24 hours from 8am on the 22

nd
 of March until 8am on 

the 23
rd. Patients were asked to complete the survey if they were in the waiting room at the main 

entrance of the department, or within the children’s waiting room.  One of the key aspects of this project 
was to identify whether the patient should have been within the department, or whether they could have 
been treated elsewhere Following data entry into excel an extract for the time period of the survey was 
taken from the PAS. Patients who had participated in the survey were identified and a clinical opinion 
was made from the Associate Director of Nursing for Medicine Division, as to whether the patient 
required emergency treatment, or whether they could have been treated by a GP within a primary care 
setting. 
 

Results 

 
 In total, 144 patients took part in the survey, giving a response rate of 50%.  

 Of the 141 patients that answered,65% (n=92) stated they had spoken to a healthcare 
professional prior to attending the A&E Department. When asked who they had spoken to, of 
those that responded (n=87) the majority of patients had spoken to either a GP (n=33) or the 
111 out of hours service (n=23). The next most common person that patients stated they had 
spoken to was the GP Surgery Receptionist (n=10).  

 When reviewing the patients that had been in touch either with a GP, the 111 service or the GP 
Receptionist, 66 patients were advised to attend A&E. When totalled, the majority of patients 
were advised to come to A&E by their GP or GP reception. Ten Patients in total stated they had 
spoken to their GP reception before attending A&E.  

 Patients were asked whether they themselves believed that A&E was the right place for them at 
that point. Of those that responded (n=133), 89% felt that they were in the right place, 10% 
stated they didn’t believe so and 1% were unsure 

 The majority (73%) of patients stated their symptoms or illness as a reason for attending, these 
were themed as ‘Require treatment’. Of the remaining 27%, 6% of patients believed A&E was 
the right place for them because they had been told to attend by a GP. A further 6% said they 
felt it was the right place for them as they had been unable to get an appointment with their GP. 

 It was identified that 52% (n=73) of the patients surveyed were needed to be seen within the 
A&E department. However, 37% (n= 53) could have been seen by a GP. For 11% (15) it wasn’t 
clear. 
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 looking at the results for patients stating they had spoken to a GP and been advised to attend 
A&E, from clinical opinion 64% (n=9) of the issues the patient presented with could have been 
treated by a GP. For patients that saw a GP, 35% (N=6) could have been treated within primary 
care. Patients who spoke to the GP Receptionist who advised that there were no appointments, 
or for them to come to A&E 46% (5) could have been treated by a GP. The 111 service advised 
11 patients to come to present at A&E for issues which could have been managed in primary 
care facilities.  

 

Conclusion & Recommendations 

 
From reviewing the results to the survey It is apparent that a large number of patients that attended the 
A&E department during the 24 hours in which the survey was conducted, had attempted to, or managed 
to speak to a healthcare professional prior to coming  to A&E.  Of those that were advised to attend, a 
concerning amount were identified as potentially being inappropriate attendees to the department, with 
conditions and concerns which could have been dealt with elsewhere.  
 
The comments made by patients throughout the survey indicate some issues with gaining access to the 
GP Surgery. It is apparent when reviewing patient’s responses that a great deal of faith is placed in the 
hands of the healthcare professionals that patients have contacted, in particular GP’s and the 111 
service. Most patients that have attended A&E from the advice given by the healthcare professional, 
believe they are at the right place and evidently do not question this advice.  
 
Patients talked of their frustration of not being able to access their GP, with ‘No choice’ stated on a 
number of occasions as the reason for attending.  
 
Telephone conversations (as opposed to face to face consultations) led to 64% of patients being told to 
attend A&E when they could have been seen within a primary care setting.  
 
It is evident that there are a number of concerning factors with regards to patients attendance which if 
improved, could reduce the amount of patients presenting at A&E inappropriately; 
 

 Improved education for patients on when to access emergency services  

 Improved access to GP Services within primary care, particularly around face to face 
appointments as opposed to telephone calls  

 Improvement in the use of Pharmacy Services  

 Prevention of GP Receptionists advising patients to attend A&E or giving A&E as the alternative 
when there are no GP appointments available 

 Improvement in the accuracy of the advice given by the  national 111 service 
 
Ultimately, the biggest and most significant improvements are required within the primary care setting. 
None of the recommendations made relate to the services provided by the hospital, and instead refer to 
measures which can be taken within the community to prevent patients from attending A&E 
inappropriately.  
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1. Background  

 

Emergency departments throughout the UK are seeing unprecedented levels of attendees and 

demands on their services, with many failing to reach national waiting time targets and declaring 

internal incidents due to the continued pressure for beds. Most recent data published by NHS 

England for February 2016 showed a national increase in attendance of 13.1% when compared to 

February 2015.  Within the same month 87.8% of patients were seen within 4 hours in all A&E 

departments, the lowest performance since monthly data became available in August 2010. This is 

below the 95% standard and lower than 92% for the same month last year.  

 

Northampton General Hospital (NGH) have witnessed the increase in demand for A&E and statistics 

produced for the 15/16 annual report show  an increase of 6393 patients from 13/14 to 15/16, an 

average of 17 more patients within the department each day.  

 

Activity Comparison 2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 

 

Patients seen in A&E 

 

 

107,786 

 

109,305 

 

114,179 

 

It is evident that a better understanding as to why patients are opting to attend A&E is necessary for 

identifying measures to prevent inappropriate attendances where possible, moving forward. 

 

This project therefore aimed to understand the following; 

 

 Why are patients presenting at A&E? 

 Did they contact any other healthcare providers first? If so, who? 

 What did the healthcare provider say? 

 Were they advised to come to A&E? 

 Do they (the patient) believe A&E is the right place for them today? 

 Was the patient an appropriate attendance- and if not, where should they have been treated? 

 

The results from this project will be used to identify gaps within primary care services which are 

leading to an increase in attendance at A&E. Results will be presented to Nene Clinical 

Commissioning Group (CCG) 

 

2. Methodology  

 

The hospital opted to conduct a patient survey to gain patients own understanding on their attendance 

to the department for that day. The survey covered 24 hours from 8am on the 22
nd

 of March until 8am 

on the 23
rd

.  
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In order to maintain impartiality and ensure patients felt able to speak honestly, Healthwatch 

Northamptonshire were asked to conduct the survey on behalf of the hospital. In total, 8 volunteers 

(all DBS cleared and trained to conduct surveys) and 5 staff from Healthwatch carried out the survey.  

 

2.1 Sampling Method 

 

Patients were asked to complete the survey if they were in the waiting room at the main entrance of 

the department, or within the children’s waiting room. Patients that came in by ambulance and were 

taken into treatment were not included. It was considered that by the nature of the topic of the project, 

if they required urgent treatment; they were likely to be in the right place.  

 

2.2 Survey Design 

 

The survey was designed to be completed either by the patient on their own, or by the volunteers in 

structured interview style. The survey contained questions on demographics (age, gender, GP 

Surgery), and both closed and open ended questions based around the journey which had brought 

the patient to A&E that day. In addition to this, a question was included at the end to ask patients if 

there was anything further that they would like to add. This was identified as being important to give 

patients an open platform, as opposed to the structured approach to the rest of the survey.  

 

One of the key aspects of this project was to identify whether the patient should have been within the 

department, or whether they could have been treated elsewhere. Therefore patients were asked to 

provide their full name, with an explanation from the volunteers that if they provided their name, their 

records would be reviewed to identify further information about their visit to the department that day. 

They were also informed that their response would be anonymised following the extract from the 

Patient Administration System (PAS) being taken and for the rest of the analysis process. It was 

considered that this may be a block for some patients who would not be comfortable with giving their 

name, however only 3 patients surveyed throughout the day opted not to.  

 

Following data entry into excel an extract for the time period of the survey was taken from the PAS. 

Patients who had participated in the survey were identified and a clinical opinion was made from the 

Associate Director of Nursing for Medicine Division, as to whether the patient required emergency 

treatment, or whether they could have been treated by a GP within a primary care setting. If it was 

unclear whether the patient should have been within the department, this was stated as ‘unclear’ 

within the analysis.  

 

2.3 Analysis  

 

Due to the survey containing both closed and open ended questions, both quantitative and 

qualitative analysis methods were used.  
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Closed questions were pivoted into tables within excel. To best show results, these tables were used 

to create bar graphs and pie charts.  

 

Open ended questions which contained more narrative detail were analysed using thematic analysis, 

the method for identifying themes was; 

 

 Thorough read through of the comments  

 Highlighting of key words based around the same subject  

 Identification of ‘code’ words based on commonly occurring subjects 

 Theming of the data based on the code words identified 

 

This was found to be particularly useful when identifying the reasons why patients had attended A&E, 

what the healthcare professional had said to them previously, and why they believed that A&E was 

the right place for them that day.  

 

An extract from the data entry spreadsheet provides an insight into this process and how conclusions 

were drawn, the green columns are the verbatim closed and open answers to the questions asked- 

the purple column are the themes identified; 

 

Q6 Do you believe A&E is 
the right place for you 
today? 

Q6a Why do you believe 
A&E is the right place? 

Why do you believe A&E 
is the right place for 
you? 

Yes Wrist hurting a lot Require treatment  

Yes 
Lady who looks after me 
thought I should come Advice from other 

Yes Advice of 111 Advice from 111 

Yes Probably needs an  X-ray Require treatment  

Yes Best advice/help Provide help/advice  

Yes 

No doctors open plus 
pharmacist pills don't work, 
doctor would have sent me 
here anyway  

Unable to get GP 
Appointment 

Yes No doctor’s appointments  
Unable to get GP 
Appointment 

 
Where possible, links between responses were identified. For example, where patients identified that 

they had been recommended to attend A&E by their GP, this was reviewed alongside whether they 

were an appropriate attendance or not. Similarly, where the patient was identified as having been 

better suited to being treated in primary care, their GP was identified.  
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13% 

9% 

12% 

16% 12% 

11% 

9% 

5% 

5% 
6% 2% 

Age Brackets 

0 to 10 11 to 15 16 to 21 22 to 30

31 to 40 41 to 50 51 to 60 61 to 70

71 to 80 81 to 90 91 to 100

3. Results  

 

3.1 Demographics 

 

The survey was carried out across a 24 

hour period, from 8am on the 22
nd

 of 

March until 8am the following day. 

Within the 24 hours, 300 patients were 

seen within the department. Of those, 

40% were seen ‘Out of Hours’ (defined 

for the purpose of this study as the 

hours between 5pm and 8am).   

 

In total, 144 patients took part in the 

survey, giving a response rate of 50%. 

When looking at the gender split, 51% 

of the respondents were male, giving an 

even response from both genders. The 

most responses were received from patients aged 22-30 (16%) and 0-10 (13%). 

 

3.2 Patient Results  

 

Of the 141 patients that answered,65% (n=92) stated they had spoken to a healthcare professional 

prior to attending the A&E Department. When asked who they had spoken to, of those that responded 

(n=87) the majority of patients had spoken to either a GP (n=33) or the 111 out of hours service 

(n=23). The next most common person that patients stated they had spoken to was the GP Surgery 

Receptionist (n=10).  

 

 
 

0
5

10
15
20
25
30
35

What Healthcare Professional did you speak to before coming to 
A&E? 
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0

5

10

15

20

25

30

Saw GP Spoke to GP GP
Reception

111 Service

Who advised you to come to A&E? 

Patients were asked what the Healthcare Professional had said when they had spoken to them. All of 

the free text comments were reviewed and themed according to the common words mentioned. Of 

the 69 patients that responded to this question, 80% stated they had been advised to attend A&E and 

9% had been advised to call an ambulance. 

 
 
It was identified that through the dataset, there were patients that had spoken to a GP over the 

telephone and patients that had physically 

seen a GP at the surgery. It was 

acknowledged that this is an important 

distinction and for the purpose of the rest of 

the analysis these were considered 

separately.  

 

When reviewing the patients that had been in 

touch either with a GP, the 111 service or the 

GP Receptionist, 66 patients were advised to 

attend A&E. When totalled, the majority of patients were advised to come to A&E by their GP or GP 

reception. Ten Patients in total stated they had spoken to their GP reception before attending A&E. 

 

Spoke to Reception and told to come to A&E Total 

Abbey Medical Centre  1 

Danes Camp Surgery 1 

Danetre Medical Practice  1 

Delapre Medical Centre 1 

Denton Village Surgery  1 

Lings brook Practice  1 

Mounts Medical Centre 1 

Queensview medical centre 1 

St Lukes Primary care centre 1 

Towcester Medical Centre  1 

Grand Total 10 

 

80% 
2% 

9% 
1% 

6% 1% 
1% 

What did the Healthcare Professional say? 
Attend A&E Attend Ambulatory Care

Call ambulance Call out of hours

Gave medical advice Need to be checked by healthcare professional

No appointments at surgery
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89% 

10% 1% 

Do you believe A&E is the right 
place for you today? 

Yes No Don't know

Patients were asked whether they themselves believed that A&E was the right place for them at that 

point. Of those that responded (n=133), 89% felt 

that they were in the right place, 10% stated they 

didn’t believe so and 1% were unsure.  

 

Patients that stated they did believe it was the right 

place for them were asked why, their responses 

were themed. The majority (73%) of patients stated 

their symptoms or illness as a reason for attending, 

these were themed as ‘Require treatment’. Of the 

remaining 27%, 6% of patients believed A&E was 

the right place for them because they had been told 

to attend by a GP. A further 6% said they felt it was the right place for them as they had been unable 

to get an appointment with their GP.  

 

The 10% of patients that stated they didn’t believe A&E was the right place for them, the majority of 

them believed they should have been seen by a GP, but were unable to get an appointment.  

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

73% 

6% 

6% 

6% 

4% 
2% 1% 1% 1% 

Why do you believe A&E is the right place for you? 

Require treatment Unable to get GP Appointment Advice from GP

Advice from other Advice from 111 Provide help/advice

Advice from GP Reception Injured on hospital grounds Advice from Out of Hours
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37% 

11% 

52% 

Appropriate Attendance? 

No - GP Surgery Unclear Yes

3.3 Clinical Opinion 

 

Further to the feedback gained from patients, a clinical opinion was made for each patient as to 

whether they should have been within the 

department, or whether they could have received 

treatment from another source. It was identified that 

52% (n=73) of the patients surveyed were needed 

to be seen within the A&E department. However, 

37% (n= 53) could have been seen by a GP. For 

11% (15) it wasn’t clear. 

 

It is important within these results to identify 

whether the patients that had previously stated that 

they had been advised to attend A&E by a 

healthcare professional, were in the right place. From looking at the results for patients stating they 

had spoken to a GP and been advised to attend A&E, from clinical opinion 64% (n=9) of the issues 

the patient presented with could have been treated by a GP. For patients that saw a GP, 35% (N=6) 

could have been treated within primary care. Patients who spoke to the GP Receptionist who advised 

that there were no appointments, or for them to come to A&E 46% (5) could have been treated by a 

GP. The 111 service advised 11 patients to come to present at A&E for issues which could have been 

managed in primary care facilities.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

46% 

4% 

50% 

Patients who spoke to 111 

No - GP Surgery Unclear Yes

46% 

27% 

27% 

Patients who spoke to a GP 
Reception 

No - GP Surgery Unclear Yes

35% 

30% 

35% 

Patients who saw a GP 

No - GP Surgery Unclear Yes

64% 

7% 

29% 

Patients who spoke to a GP 

No - GP Surgery Unclear Yes
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In total, 17 patients that were advised to attend A&E by their GP Surgery also stated which GP 

Surgery they belonged too.  When looking at the results, 2 surgeries referred 2 patients within the 24 

hours to A&E when they could have been seen within the surgery, Abbey Medical Centre and Beech 

Avenue.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Looking further at the data for these surgeries it is evident that 3 of the patients were told to come to 

A&E by their GP, and 1 patient was told to come to A&E because there were no appointments at the 

surgery. 

GP 
Practice 

Q1 Why did 
you choose 
to come to 
A&E today? 

Why did 
you chose 
to come to 
A&E today? 

Q2 Did you speak to 
any other healthcare 
providers before 
coming to A&E? 

Q2a 
Who? 

Q4 What did 
the 
healthcare 
prof say? 

What did the 
healthcare 
professional say? 

Abbey 
Medical 
Centre  

GP told me to 
come down 
concerned 
about 
medication 
levels 

Advised by 
GP 

Yes GP 
Told to come 
straight down 
to AE 

Attend A&E  

Abbey 
Medical 
Centre  

High 
temperature 
sore throat 

Concerned 
about health  

Yes 
GP 
Reception 

No 
appointments 

No appointments at 
surgery  

Beech 
Avenue 

GP said 
Advised by 
GP 

Yes GP Come to AE Attend A&E  

Beech 
Avenue 

Phoned GP 
this am 
neck/head 
sore. Thought 
they would 
come out- told 
to go straight 
to A&E 

Advised by 
GP 

Yes GP Go to A&E Attend A&E  

Surgery  
Total advised to 
attend A&E 

Abbey House Surgery 1 

Abbey Medical Centre  2 

Abington Park Surgery  1 

Beech Avenue 2 

Brooke Health Centre 1 

Bugbrooke Medical Practice 1 

Greens Norton Medical Practice  1 

Greenview Practice 1 

Leicester Terrace 1 

Lings brook Practice  1 

Maple Access Partnership 1 

Moulton Surgery  1 

St Lukes Primary care centre 1 

Towcester Medical Centre  1 

Woodview Medical Centre  1 

Grand Total 17 
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4. Discussion  

 

Emergency Departments throughout the UK have seen unprecedented increases on the demand for 

their services. This survey was conducted in order to gain a better understanding of why patients are 

attending A&E at Northampton General Hospital and to best understand what can potentially be done 

to prevent patients from attending inappropriately. In total, 144 patients completed the survey 

between 8 am on the 22
nd

 of March and 8am on the 23
rd

.  Three hundred patients attended A&E that 

day (excluding Eye casualty) giving the survey a 50% response rate.  

 

This report will now focus on answering the key questions detailed within the Background section.  

 

Are patients contacting other ‘healthcare professionals’ before attending? 

 

It is evident that the majority of patients surveyed had made an attempt to contact a healthcare 

professional before attending A&E (65%). Most patients had spoken to either their GP (38%) or to the 

111 service (26%) in order to get advice. It became apparent during analysis that there were two 

different groups of patients who had made contact with their GP- those that had spoken to a GP on 

the telephone and those that had seen their GP in person. It was considered that this was an 

important distinction for this project and to understanding patients prior contact with a healthcare 

professional.  

 

It was also interesting to see that the third most common person patients stated they had spoken too 

before attending A&E was their GP Receptionist. Ten patients in total when asked if they had spoken 

to a ‘Healthcare professional’, said they had spoken to the GP receptionist.  

 

What did the ‘healthcare professional’ say? 

 

Patients were asked what the healthcare professional had said when they spoke to them (please 

note, GP Receptionists have been included as a ‘healthcare professional’).  Of the 69 patients that 

responded, 80% stated that they had been advised to attend A&E and a further 9% stated that an 

ambulance had been called for them. 

 

‘Receptionists at GP surgery said go to walk-in’ 

‘Told to go to AE within 4 hours’ 

 

Only 6% of patients stated that the healthcare professional they had seen/spoken to had given them 

treatment advice.  
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A number of patients were evidently confused about advice that had been given to them and had 

therefore opted to attend A&E; 

 

‘GP Advised patient to ring 111. Paramedics surprised GP advised to call 111, should have been 

dealt with by GP’ 

‘Think 111 said go to A&E’ 

 

Why are patients attending A&E and do they feel it is the right place for them? 

 
 

Patients were asked for the reason that they had opted to attend A&E. From reviewing the free text 

comments it was found that most patients attended for treatment, indicating that they felt A&E was the 

right place for them to get the treatment they needed (it will be discussed later in the report whether 

this was in fact the case).  

 

There were however comments from patients that had evidently opted to attend A&E because they 

were unable to get a GP appointment or access to a GP with seven patients in total found to have 

attended A&E that day because of a lack of a suitable alternative.  

 

‘Couldn't get a GP Appointment so had no choice but to come to A&E’ 

‘Receptionist told patient to come to AE’ 

 

A number of patients (n=14) stated the main reason they attended A&E was simply because they had 

been told to by either their GP, GP Receptionist or the 111 service. 

 

When asked whether they felt that A&E was the right place for them that day, 89% of patients 

believed it was. When asked why, the majority (73%) of patients again stated reasons relating to 

requiring treatment; 

 

‘Need an X-ray’ 

‘Extremely concerned about swelling in leg’ 

 

However, a number of patients stated that they believed A&E was the right place for them that day 

because their GP or 111 service had told them to come; 

 

‘111 said not to wait until the morning.’ 

‘Drs advice’ 

 

From reading the comments, it is evident that being referred to the department by a healthcare 

professional validated the patients opinion that it was the right place for them and that they should 

therefore be there.  
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Five patients stated the reason they felt A&E was the right place for them was because they couldn’t 

get a GP appointment, either because their lists were full, or because of the time of day when their 

problem had occurred.  The patients believed that this was a viable and valid reason for attending the 

A&E department.  

 

Far fewer patients (n=13, 10%) believed A&E was not the right place, most of which felt that their 

particular issue could have been dealt with by a GP. Interestingly, 10 of the 13 patients that did not 

believe A&E was the right route had spoken to either their GP, GP Receptionist or 111 prior to 

attending. Five of those that had spoken to either the receptionist, or in one case the GP, had either 

been told to attend A&E because there were no appointments- or had opted to attend because they 

were unable to get an appointment. These patients expressed frustration at not being able to get an 

appointment, or feeling like they were not in the right place; 

 

‘Feels that blood result can be communicated via GP Practice’ 

‘No really, can’t get any appointments with GP- they could have sorted the medication issue’ 

‘Not really by GP told patient to go to AE’ 

 

Was A&E the right place? 

 

Understanding whether A&E was the right place for the patient was critical to this project. It was 

important to understand patients motivations and intentions for attending and whether they were 

being advised to attend the department correctly. 

 

Of those patients whose details could be accessed through the Patient Administration System (PAS), 

it was found that 52% (n=73) of patients did need to be seen within the department; however 37% 

could have been seen within a primary care setting.  

 

When reviewing the patients stated reasons for attending against whether they were an appropriate 

attendance, for patients that stated they attended because they were concerned about their health, 

82% were identified as being an appropriate attendance for A&E. For patients that stated their reason 

for attending as being because of an injury, 75% were an appropriate attendance. 

 

Of concern, are the patients that stated that they had been advised to attend A&E after speaking to a 

GP. It was found that 64% (9) of these patients would have been better suited to being treated within 

primary care. For patients that had seen a GP, 33% (6) were identified as being inappropriate 

attendances within A&E (for 28%, n=5, it was unclear). For those patients that had spoken to the 111 

service and been advised to attend A&E, 46% (n=11) were found to be inappropriate, with patients 

presenting with issues which could have been managed elsewhere.   

 

The contrast between patients that stated their reason as attending being due to an accident or health 

concern and the patient stating they attended because they were told to is interesting. When asked 

whether they believed A&E was the right place for them, patients again stated that they believed it 
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was the right place, because they had been told to attend.  This is an interesting dynamic, and 

indicates the importance of accurate advice and guidance from within the primary care setting. Only a 

few patients stated that they didn’t feel that A&E was the right place for them following conversations 

with their GP or receptionist, however the main reason for this was because they could not get an 

appointment at the surgery- as opposed to the fact they had been asked to attend because they 

needed emergency care.    

 

In total, 17 patients surveyed had been referred to A&E by a GP surgery, two surgeries had 

potentially inappropriately referred 2 of their patients to attend the department within the 24 hour 

period, these were Abbey Medical Centre and Beech Avenue Surgery. When reviewing these 4 

patients, 3 had been told to go to A&E by the GP and 1 had spoken to the GP reception and advised 

that there were no appointments for that day.  

 

5. Conclusion & Recommendations 

 

From reviewing the results to the survey It is apparent that a large number of patients that attended 

the A&E department during the 24 hours in which the survey was conducted, had attempted to, or 

managed to speak to a healthcare professional prior to coming  to A&E. The majority (69%) of 

patients that gave the need for treatment as their primary reason for attending were found to be in the 

right place, as opposed to those that stated they had been sent or advised to attend the department 

by either 111, their GP or the GP Receptionist.  Of those that were advised to attend, a concerning 

amount were identified as potentially being inappropriate attendees to the department, with conditions 

and concerns which could have been dealt with elsewhere.  

 

The comments made by patients throughout the survey indicate some issues with gaining access to 

the GP Surgery.  It is evident that GP Receptionists hold some power in this situation, acting as 

gatekeepers to accessing a healthcare professional, with 10 patients in total attending the A&E 

department that day due to speaking to the receptionist. If this was the same every week day, this 

could equate to a potential extra 2607 patients a year. When you also consider this alongside the fact 

that 46% of these patients were found to have been at A&E inappropriately and a further 27% were 

unclear, this is concerning.  

 

It is apparent when reviewing patient’s responses that a great deal of faith is placed in the hands of 

the healthcare professionals that patients have contacted, in particular GP’s and the 111 service. 

Most patients that have attended A&E from the advice given by the healthcare professional, believe 

they are at the right place and evidently do not question this advice.  

 

Although a great deal of patients that gave their reason of attending A&E as ‘for treatment’, there are 

still a number of patients that are not choosing wisely when considering where to seek help. Patients 

talked of their frustration of not being able to access their GP, with ‘No choice’ stated on a number of 

occasions as the reason for attending.  
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What is not clear through this survey, is whether the patients that are being advised to attend A&E by 

their GP when their condition could have been treated in the surgery, are being advised this to ease 

the pressures within the GP Surgery. Telephone conversations (as opposed to face to face 

consultations) led to 64% of patients being told to attend A&E when they could have been seen within 

a primary care setting. It would be difficult to determine the motivations behind this without conducting 

a further project.  

 

It is evident that there are a number of concerning factors with regards to patients attendance which if 

improved, could reduce the amount of patients presenting at A&E inappropriately; 

 

 Improved education for patients on when to access emergency services  

 Improved access to GP Services within primary care, particularly around face to face 

appointments as opposed to telephone calls  

 Improvement in the use of Pharmacy Services  

 Prevention of GP Receptionists advising patients to attend A&E or giving A&E as the 

alternative when there are no GP appointments available 

 Improvement in the accuracy of the advice given by the  national 111 service 

 
Ultimately, the biggest and most significant improvements are required within the primary care setting. 

None of the recommendations made relate to the services provided by the hospital, and instead refer 

to measures which can be taken within the community to prevent patients from attending A&E 

inappropriately.  
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Equality and Diversity 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
12 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Janine Brennan, Director of Workforce & Transformation 
 

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Andrea Chown, Deputy Director of Human Resources 
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
Assurance that the equality agenda including the public sector duty 
in accordance with the Equality Act 2010 is being implemented for 
staff across the Trust  
 

Executive summary 

The Public Sector Equality Duty requires the Trust to have due regard to the need to eliminate 
discrimination, advance equality of opportunity and foster good relations between different people when 
carrying out its activities.  To ensure transparency, and to assist in the performance of this duty, the 
Equality Act 2010 (Specific Duties) Regulations 2011 require the Trust to publish information to 
demonstrate compliance with the Public Sector Equality Duty.  

The Equality and Human Rights Workforce Annual Report 2015/2016  

The Equality and Human Rights Workforce Annual Report for 2015/2016 aims to demonstrate this 
compliance and provide assurance that the Trust is meeting its duty by reviewing the progress 
Northampton General Hospital has made to promote equality and celebrate diversity in the year 2015 to 
2016.  This report is provided for information and the Trust Board is asked to note the contents.   
 
The Equality and Human Rights Workforce Monitoring Report 2015/2016 
 
The Equality and Human Rights Workforce Monitoring Report for 2015/2016 aims to demonstrate this 
compliance and provide assurance that the Trust is meeting its legal duty to monitor our workforce by 
the protected characteristics.   This report is provided for information and the Trust Board is asked to 
note the contents. 
 
Equality Objectives July 2016 
 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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The Trust Board is asked to approve the refreshed Equality Objectives Four Year Plan 2016 – 2020, for 
the workforce, which incorporates the Trust’s actions in relation to WRES (Workforce Race Equality 
Standard).   
 
As part of the EDS2 (Equality Delivery System 2) the Trust is required to have equality objectives linked 
to a four year plan.  The current set of objectives end in 2016 and have therefore been reviewed and 
refreshed. In addition the Trust is also required to develop an action plan in relation to the findings from 
the WRES gap analysis exercise and these actions have been built into the Equality Objectives Four 
Year Plan as EDS2 and WRES are closely linked to one another. 
  

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Enable excellence through our people. 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

The Trusts equality agenda for staff is being monitored through the 
equality and diversity group with progress reports on the Four Year 
Action Plan and the WRES.   

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 4.3 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? No 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? No 
 

  

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

NHS Constitution 
Public Sector Equality Duty 
Equality Act 2010 
Equality Delivery System 2 (EDS2) 
Workforce Race Equality Standard (WRES) 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Board  is asked to: 
 

 Note the contents of the Equality and Human Rights Workforce Annual Report 2015/2016 and 
the Equality and Human Rights Workforce Monitoring Report 2015/2016 

 Approve the Equality Objectives Four Year Plan 2016 – 2020 
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Our Vision and Values 
 
 

Our vision is:  To provide the best possible care for our patients 
 

Our Values are: 

 We put patient safety above all else  

 We aspire to excellence 

 We reflect, we learn, we improve 

 We respect & support each other 
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Executive Summary 

 

The Equality and Human Rights Annual Report for 2015/2016 reviews the 

work Northampton General Hospital has made to promote equality and 

celebrate diversity within its workforce during April 2015 to March 2016. 

 

During the period that this report covers we continued to focus on the 

recruitment of nurses including many from overseas.  In addition we have 

worked hard to recruit and engage apprentices in a variety of different roles 

across the organisation and this work was recognised by South Leicestershire 

College who presented us with an Employer of the Year Award for our support 

of apprentices in February.  We continued to demonstrate our commitment to 

equality in recruitment through the Two Ticks Scheme and our commitment to 

staff through our Staff Engagement Strategy.  

 

During 2015/2016 we made progress against our objectives and action plan 

that is required in accordance with the NHS Equality Delivery System (EDS2) 

and also produced our first baseline data report for the Workforce Race 

Equality Standard that was introduced in the NHS in late 2014. 

 

The 2015 National Staff Survey results showed improvements in the elements 

of the survey that relate to equality and diversity, however we are mindful that 

we need to continue to work hard to ensure further improvements are made. 

 

Underpinning all of this work is our Equality and Human Rights Strategy and 

our Equality Analysis processes. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Dr Sonia Swart Paul Farenden 

 Chief Executive  Chairman 
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Introduction 

 

 

Northampton General Hospital believes that Equality and Diversity (E&D) is 

central to what we do. Equality is about creating a fairer society where 

everyone has the opportunity to fulfill their potential.  

 

The Trust aims to deliver high quality support to staff that is accessible, 

responsive and appropriate to meet the diverse needs of the different groups 

and individual members of staff we employ.  

 

To achieve this aim, we want to ensure that employees are not subject to any 

form of discrimination or unlawful treatment. Everyone can expect to be treated 

with equal respect and dignity regardless of their background or circumstances.  

 

It is important to us that we do not discriminate unlawfully in the way we recruit, 

train and support our workforce. The Trust does not tolerate any forms of 

unlawful or unfair discrimination. In addition it recognises that all people have 

rights and entitlements by law.  
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Our Population 
 
 
 

We provide general acute services for a population of 380,000 and hyper-

acute stroke, vascular and renal services to 692,000 people living throughout 

the whole of Northamptonshire.  The Trust is also an accredited cancer 

centre, providing services to a wider population of 880,000 who live in 

Northamptonshire and parts of Buckinghamshire. For one highly specialist 

urological treatment we serve an even wider catchment. 

 

Our principal activity is the provision of free healthcare to eligible patients.  We 

provide a full range of outpatients, diagnostics, inpatient and day case elective 

and emergency care and also a growing range of specialist treatments that 

distinguishes our services from many district general hospitals. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                   Local Population by age 
 

 
 

Local Population by ethnicity 
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Our People 

 
 
 

The Trust employs 4250.94 whole time equivalent (wte) members of staff, a 

headcount of 4885 people, (as at 31 March 2016). 
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Our People  
interesting articles 

 
 

NHS Equality, Diversity and Human Rights Week 11-15 May 2015 

 

Linking Our Thinking 
 
The fourth NHS Equality, Diversity and Human Rights Week, organised by 

NHS Employers, was held from 11-15 May 2015 and shone a light on the 

ongoing work across the NHS to ensure that it continues to meet the diverse 

needs of its local populations and is a place where staff from all backgrounds 

will want to work. 

 

The theme was about ‘Linking Our Thinking’ and focused on how diversity of 

thought can contribute to address and solve problems for all under-

represented and disadvantaged groups and individuals within the workplace.   

 

We asked our staff to take the opportunity 

during the Equality, Diversity and Human 

Rights Week ask themselves the following 

question “What do I do to contribute to 

promoting equality and diversity here at 

NGH?” 

 

Staff could also get involved with Equality, 

Diversity and Human Rights Week by joining 

the conversation on twitter and Facebook. 
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Support for Staff becoming a Parent 

 

During 2015/2016 the Trust continued to provide support for staff becoming a 

parent to ensure that they are aware of their rights and entitlements.  In 

addition to the Trust’s Maternity, Paternity, Adoption and Shared Parental 

Leave Procedure we have a dedicated member of staff who can provide 

support and advice to individuals who are applying for these types of leave. 

 

A regular schedule of workshops are run for staff who are pregnant to provide 

additional support and information.  For other parenting leave such as 

adoption or shared parental leave individuals are seen on a one to one basis. 

 

During the 12 month period that this report covers: 

 

 158 members of staff commenced maternity leave 

 37 members of staff took paternity leave 

 1 member of staff commenced adoption leave 

 

The Trust also organised 

sessions for managers in 

March 2016 to ensure that 

they were fully up-to-date 

with the rules, regulations 

and entitlements so that they 

too could better support their 

staff in relation to parenting 

leave.  Thirty managers 

attended the sessions and it 

is hoped that more will be run 

during 2016. 
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Equality Analysis 

 

 

The Trust continues to undertake Equality Analyses to ensure that its 

services, plans, policies and procedures, continue to meet our public sector 

duties and give ‘due regard’ to ensure that everyone who works at the Trust or 

uses its services are treated fairly, equally and free from discrimination.   

 

During the period April 2015 – March 2016 162 Equality Analyses were 

completed. 
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Workforce Race Equality Standard (WRES)  

 

 

In 2014 NHS England took the decision to introduce a National Workforce 

Race Equality Standard.  This decision was made following numerous reports 

that evidenced systematic discrimination against Black and Minority Ethnic 

(BME) staff in the NHS.   

 

The evidence from the reports highlighted that people from a BME 

background are less likely to be appointed once shortlisted, less likely to be 

selected for training and development programmes, more likely to experience 

harassment, bullying and abuse and more likely to be disciplined and 

dismissed.  The Standard is made up of 9 indicators and these will highlight 

any differences between the experience and treatment of White staff and BME 

staff in the NHS with a view of encouraging and enabling NHS organisations 

to reduce the differences. 

 

In line with the guidance issued by NHS England the Trust produced baseline 

data for each of the 9 indicators in April 2015 and these were published on the 

internet.  The Trust will be repeating the exercise in April 2016 and comparing 

these results to those of 2015 to establish if there have been improvements in 

the experiences or the 

treatment of White staff 

and BME staff, if there 

are any areas for 

concern and, if any are 

found, to look at the 

steps the Trust can take 

to make improvements.  
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Staff Survey 2015 Equality & Diversity Results 

 

 

The 2015 annual National NHS Staff Survey took place during September to 

November 2015.   A total of 4676 surveys were sent directly to all staff and 

1442 members of staff returned the survey.   

 

Of the 32 key findings this year there has been improvement in 9, no 

deteriorations, 13 have stayed the same and 10 could not be compared. This 

is again an overall improvement and continues our positive trend of 

improvement over the last 3 years. 

 

The demographics of the staff that responded when compared to the Trust 

profile were broadly similar with the exception of disabled staff where 15% of 

the respondents were disabled compared to the 3% of the Trusts workforce. 

 

Within the Staff Survey there are two specific key findings that relate to 

equality and diversity.   

 

The first key finding is in relation to the percentage of staff experiencing 

discrimination at work in the last 12 months and in this area the Trust has 

significantly improved since the 2014 survey results and is above average 

when compared to acute Trusts.   

 

There has been a slight improvement in relation to the second key finding 

which relates to the percentage of staff who believe that the organisation 

provides equal opportunities for career progression and/or promotion.  The 

Trust is also below average when compared to other acute Trusts  

 

We recognise that overall the survey shows improvement however it 

highlights some areas of concern and the Trust continues to work to improve 

the results, through the work of its Organisational Development Team and the 

Improving Quality and Efficiency Team to bring about a fundamental shift in 

culture, where everyone is focused on quality, continuous improvement and 

meaningful staff engagement to sustainably improve staff satisfaction at work.   
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Equality & Human Rights Strategy 2013 -2016 
 
 

The Trust’s Equality and Human Rights Strategy details how the Trust will 

eliminate discrimination, advance equality and foster good relations between 

people who share certain characteristics and those who do not: age; disability; 

gender reassignment; pregnancy and maternity; race; religion or belief; sex; 

and sexual orientation. It builds on the work already done and progress made 

on equality, diversity and human rights over the years and sets out our co-

ordinated and integrated approach.  The Trust Board receives regular 

feedback on the implementation and promotion of this Strategy and we 

evaluate progress to ensure we are striving towards what we set out to 

achieve.  We will also be reviewing the strategy in 2016 to ensure that it 

remains current and complies with the Equality Act 2010. 

 

Underpinning the strategy are a number of Trust policies and procedures that 

support the day to day work of the Trust and some of these have specific 

connections to the Equality Act of 2010, namely: 

 

 Bullying, Harassment  & Victimisation 

 Employment of People with a Disability 

 Flexible Working 

 Management of Sickness Absence 

 Maternity, Adoption, Paternity and Shared Parental Leave 

 Recruitment, Selection & Retention. 

 

In addition all our Human Resources procedural documents advise that our 

policies and procedures will be applied fairly and consistently to all employees 

regardless of age, disability, gender reassignment, marriage and civil 

partnership, pregnancy and maternity, race, religion or belief, sex or sexual 

orientation, whether working full or part-time or whether employed under a 

permanent, temporary or fixed-term contract. 
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Equality & Diversity Group - Staff 
 
 

The Trust has an Equality and Diversity Staff Group (EDS) that meets on a 

quarterly basis.  The purpose of the group is to champion and steer the work 

of Northampton General Hospital (NGH) so that the Trust is in full and positive 

compliance of equality and human rights legislation, regulations and codes of 

practice including NHS and Department of Health standards.   

 

The aim is twofold.  To lead, advise and inform on all aspects of policy 

making, and employment including various engagements related to equality 

and inclusion legislation and policy direction.   

 

In addition the group also leads and monitors progress on the development of 

the action plan that is required in accordance with the NHS Equality Delivery 

System (EDS2).  As part of this action plan there are two objectives that relate 

to our workforce: 

 

1. A representative and supported workforce –  

 

We will aim to improve our staff satisfaction rates as reported in the 

annual staff survey and the staff family and friends test.  In response to 

the question regarding whether staff would recommend the Trust as place 

to work. 

 

2. Inclusive leadership - 

 

To develop improved leadership and management capability. 

 

The Trust is pleased to advise that all actions linked to these objectives have 

either been completed or are in progress. 
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Recruitment 

 

 

During the past year the Trust has recruited many staff through various 

different recruitment methods and events.  In particular the Trust has worked 

hard to increase its number of nurses and this has included recruiting from 

overseas.  During the period that this reports covers we recruited 246 nurses 

and 103 of these were recruited from counties such as Romania, Holland, 

Spain and India.   

 

All our new employees over the past 12 months, regardless of their role, come 

from differing backgrounds, beliefs and life experiences that contribute to the 

richness and diversity of the Trust’s workforce.         

 

The Trust has also recently reviewed and updated its recruitment training for 

managers and this now includes specific guidance and best practice on how 

the Equality Act 2010 and the Trust values apply in relation to the recruitment 

practices of the Trust.  This 

training is currently being 

rolled out across the 

organisation. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

E
nc

lo
su

re
 H

Page 90 of 235



 

20 Chairman: Mr Paul Farenden 
  Chief Executive: Dr Sonia Swart 

 

   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Corporate Global Challenge 

 

 

During the year Trust staff took part in the Global Corporate Challenge (GCC), 

which is a 100-day virtual tour around the globe whereby employees around 

the world compete in teams and record their daily activity as the GCC takes 

them on a journey that will increase their physical activity levels and improve 

their diet and the quality of their sleep.   

 

This challenge was a resounding success with large number of staff of all 

ages, backgrounds and roles forming teams from wards and departments 

from across the whole 

organisation taking part.  It is 

hoped that the beyond the 

100 days, the challenge has 

provided a platform to ensure 

that learning and positive 

habit formation continues 

throughout the year for all the 

staff that participated. 
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Employer of the Year Award for Learning & Development 

 

 

In February 2016 the Trust was presented with an Employer of the Year 

award for its support of apprentices. South Leicestershire College presented 

the award to Becky Sansom, Learning and Development Manager, who has 

personally driven the NGH apprenticeship programme.  The award recognised 

the continual support given to our apprentices throughout their programme of 

learning and, where possible, their progression into substantive contracted 

posts within the organisation.  It is a three-way partnership that culminates in 

the learner gaining valid and 

valuable real work experience 

and ensures that they have the 

work and life skills needed to 

move into employment.  The 

Trust works closely with the 

college to strive for excellence 

and opportunities for the young 

people in our community and 

was very proud to receive an 

award to recognise this. 
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Mind the Gap – Exploring the Needs of Early Career Nurses and Midwives 

 

 

A report produced in 2015 from Health Education England and Birmingham 

and Solihull Local Education and Training Council explored staff retention 

among newly qualified health professionals.  The report was part of the ‘Every 

Student Counts’ project, which was initiated in response to concerns from 

employers about the recruitment and retention of nurses and midwives, and in 

particular concerns over a high turnover rate for band 5 nurses. 

 

Using views and information collected through a variety of methods the 

conclusions drawn related to generational differences evident amongst 

healthcare professionals, and suggested employers needed to accommodate 

generational needs in order to ensure that newly qualified staff of all ages 

were supported and retained.  The report stated: 

 

“…there are generational concepts that require consideration if we are to 

appropriately support individuals as they begin their professional careers.  For 

the first time in history four different generations will be working together in the 

same employment environment… Understanding different motivational needs 

across these generations offers employers and education providers a real 

opportunity to better align support to meet individual needs and to improve 

recruitment and retention.” 

 

Whilst the report emphasised that broad descriptions can lead to stereotyping 

and therefore the categories below should be considered a general guide to 

understanding only, four generational profiles are applied in the analysis of 

staff behaviours and characteristics: 
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Generational 
Profile 

Date of Birth 
Range 

Brief Descriptor 

Baby Boomer 
 

1946 - 1964 
“I am a post war 
child” 

Generation X 
 

1965 - 1979 
“I am a latch-key 
kid” 

Generation Y 
 

1980 - 1994 “I am a millennial” 

Generation Z 
1995 – 2010 
(just entering higher 
education) 

Generation Z 

 
The report also highlighted some general expectations of early career nurses 

and midwives, and gave recommendations that employers ‘live their values’, 

facilitate work-life balance for staff and offer clear pathways for career 

development. 

 

The during 2015/2016 the Trust has been sharing this report and its 

recommendations with its managers, to raise their awareness of generational 

needs so they can better support newly qualified staff, of all ages, when they 

join the Trust. 
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State of the Art Gym Opens at Cripps Recreation Centre 
 

 

Following extensive improvement works, Northampton Leisure Trust (NLT) is 

pleased to announce that the new Trilogy gym at Cripps Recreation Centre is 

now open. The state of the art facility features a calming and stretching studio, 

functional training studio as well as a strength, conditioning and free weights 

area.  

 

NLT took over the management of Cripps Recreation Centre located within 

the grounds of Northampton General Hospital on 6 May. It now operates 

Cripps alongside its four other leisure facilities across Northampton under the 

Trilogy brand. 

 

Ian Redfern, Managing Director, Northampton Leisure Trust comments 

“Inspiring Active Lifestyles is what we do. Our partnership with Northampton 

General Hospital at the Cripps Recreation Centre enables us to expand our 

offering to customers. Cripps now features state of the art equipment and a 

comprehensive studio/indoor cycling programme, making it an extremely 

motivating place to exercise. The facility also enables us to deliver our Junior 

Active membership package with swimming lessons and holiday activities 

already on offer.” 

 

Charles Abolins, NGH Director of Facilities and Capital Development, said: 

“We recognise our responsibility to encourage and promote the health and 

wellbeing agenda not just in the context of our patients – and indeed helping 

to prevent people becoming patients in 

the first place - but also as one of 

Northampton’s largest employers.  

 

“We are delighted the future of Cripps 

has been secured through our 

partnership with NLT ensuring our 

employees have access to great 

facilities and services.”  
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Learning and Development 
 

 

During 2015/16 the learning and development department offered Excel 

Training to all staff.  Funding was obtained after it became apparent that staff 

had this skill gap. Staff completed a skills analysis which enabled them to be 

put onto the right level of course. In total 39 staff were trained. 

 

In 2016 NGH were nominated and won the Employer of the Year Award for its 

support of Apprentices. Apprenticeships that were offered this year included; 

Business Admin, Customer Service, Electrical Engineering, Mechanical 

Engineering, Catering and Apprentices in Healthcare. Alongside recruiting 

Apprentices, staff already employed were able to complete apprentice 

frameworks which included Business Admin, Customer Service and 

Healthcare.   

 

The Trust began its Francis Crick programme which is a management 

development programme commencing with the top 50 managers and then 

offering it to the next level of manager.  Working alongside this, a Vocationally 

Recognised Qualification (VRQ) in Team Leading became available and so 

the Trust piloted this 12 week programme with 10 staff aspiring to be team 

leaders. All of them achieved this qualification which included: communication 

skills, motivation, development. The success of this pilot means that further 

courses will be offered to all staff. 

 

All mandatory training subjects now have a workbook and assessment for 

staff to access instead of attending face to face sessions or e-learning. This 

method of training is designed to ensure that staff have maintained the level of 

knowledge and understanding needed for their job. This has mean that staff 

have not had to leave their workplace for an hour of training, but can complete 

the assessment from 10 mins. The workbooks in some subjects have been 

amended to help some staff understand the relevance of the subject. This 

means that we now have 3 methods of delivery for all mandatory training 

subjects; face to face (RoK), e-learning and workbook/assessment. By 

ensuring that we are covering all learning styles we are ensuring that the 

learning becomes embedded in staffs everyday practice. 

E
nc

lo
su

re
 H

Page 96 of 235



 

26 Chairman: Mr Paul Farenden 
  Chief Executive: Dr Sonia Swart 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 97 of 235



 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Northampton General Hospital 
 
 
 

Our Contact Details are: 
 

 Cliftonville, Northampton, NN1 5BD 

 01604 634700 

 www.ngh.nhs.uk 

 Find us on facebook 

 Follow us on twitter @nghnhstrust 
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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 
The Equality and Human Rights Workforce Monitoring Report for 2015/2016 provides 
analysis of the data that the Trust holds in relation to its workforce. 
 
Northampton General Hospital (NGH) has a legal duty to promote equality of opportunity, 
foster good relations and eliminate harassment and unlawful discrimination.  As part of our 
legal duty we must prepare and publish equality information annually comprising of an 
equality profile of our staff to determine if there are any issues. 
 
Our legal duty to monitor our workforce is addressed in this document. The report provides 
information for some of the protected characteristics in the following areas:  
 

 Trust’s Workforce Profile  

 Human Resources (HR) Recruitment Activity  

 HR Caseload Activity  

 Learning and Development Activity  
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INTRODUCTION  
 
Northampton General Hospital believes that Equality and Diversity (E&D) is central to what 
we do. Equality is about creating a fairer society where everyone has the opportunity to 
fulfill their potential.  
 
The Trust aims to deliver high quality services that are accessible, responsive and 
appropriate to meet the diverse needs of the different groups and individuals we serve and 
the staff we employ.  
 
To achieve this aim, we want to ensure that service users and employees are not subject 
to any form of discrimination or unequal treatment. Everyone can expect to be treated with 
equal respect and dignity regardless of their background or circumstances.  
 
It is important to us that we eliminate discrimination in the way we provide our services and 
the way we recruit, train and support our workforce. The Trust does not tolerate any forms 
of unlawful or unfair discrimination. In addition it recognises that all people have rights and 
entitlements.  
 
 

OUR POPULATION 
 
Northamptonshire has an estimated population of 725,000 people in mid-2016 (ONS 

population projections, published 29 May 2014).  More than 30% of the population are in 

the least deprived quintile, and around 12% are in the most deprived quintile.  While the 

population of Northamptonshire is expected to rise by around 5% to approximately 

749,000 by 2020, the increase in working age population is estimated at only 2%, whereas 

the total population aged 65 and over is projected to rise by 17% in this period.  The 70-74 

age group will rise by 40% (the post-war baby boomer generation), and the number aged 

90 and over is expected to rise by 30%. 

The latest Health Profile for Northamptonshire (Public Health England, 2 June 2015) 

describes 32 indicators, most of which are related to health and lifestyle.   

Northamptonshire is significantly worse than the England average for the following: 

 Smoking status at time of delivery 

 Excess weight in adults 

 Hospital stays for self-harm 

 Life expectancy at birth (female) 

 Under 75 mortality rate: Cancer 
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Northamptonshire Population (2011 Census) 

Ethnic Group Religion Marital Status Age Group Gender 

White  91.48% Christian 
59.9% 

Single  29.2% 0-17  22.5% Male 
49.3% 

Mixed  1.51% Buddhist 0.3% Married   41.4% 18-24  7.8%  Female 
50.7% 

Asian  4.04% Hindu 1.2% Civil Partnership 
0.2% 

25-34 12.6%  

Black  2.53% Jewish 0.1% Separated 5.3% 35-44  13.5%  

Other 0.43% Muslim 1.7% Divorced 14.3% 45-54 14.8%  

 Sikh 0.4% Widowed 9.6% 55-64 11.7%  

 Other 0.4%  65-74 9.8%  

 No religion 
29.2% 

 75-84 5.2%  

 Not stated 
6.7% 

 85+ 2.2%  

 
 

EQUALITY ANALYSIS  
 
Identifying and responding to the effect of the activities of the Trust on the different 
protected groups of staff remains of fundamental importance in the context of giving due 
regard in line with our Public Sector Equality Duties. 
 
Equality Analysis remains a key component in delivering a quality services and support to 
staff which meets the needs of all and ensures that employees are not excluded.  The 
Trust continues to utilise its systems for Equality Analysis on policies, procedures, 
services, plans and programmes of change to assess whether they have the potential to 
affect staff differently. The Trust recognises this process identifies and addresses real or 
potential inequalities resulting from policy, practice or service development. 
 
Where it is identified that a particular group or section of staff will be, or could be 
disadvantaged the Equality Analysis processes ensures that the Trust is able to: 
 
Remove or minimise disadvantage experienced by staff connected to ‘protected 
characteristics’ 
Take steps to meet the needs of staff who share a protected characteristic where these 
are different from staff who do not share it 
Encourage staff who share a protected characteristic to participate in public life or any 
other activity where participation is disproportionately low. 
 
During the period April 2015 – March 2016 the Trust completed 162 Equality Analyses. 
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WORKFORCE PROFILE – APRIL 2015 to MARCH 2016  
 
The following analysis contains quantitative information from the Electronic Staff Record 
(ESR) for the year ending 31 March 2016 relating to: 

 Staff in Post by pay band/grade 

 Sickness episodes by pay band/grade 

 Leavers by pay band/grade 
 

Information relating to Recruitment & Promotion, and Disciplinary & Grievance Procedures 
is provided separately within the monitoring report.   
 
Where possible the information has been analysed against the following protected 
characteristics: 
 

 Age 

 Disability 

 Gender 

 Ethnicity 

 Religious Belief 

 Sexual Orientation 

 Marital Status 
 

It is important to know and understand the demographic profile of our workforce, and to be 
able to compare this profile with that of the local population which we serve. 
 
Workforce Profile by Pay Band / Grade 
 
It is obviously important that the data we hold for employees relating to Protected 
Characteristics is as complete as possible in order to draw meaningful conclusions from 
any analysis. 
 
In some areas the level of completeness of data is very high; just over 96% of employees 
have their ethnic origin recorded, and a slightly smaller percentage (94.7%) have a record 
for marital status.  Gender and age are recorded for all employees.  Disability information 
has always been poorly recorded; just over 22.5% have no record relating to disability 
status, although this is an improvement on the reported figure in 2015 of 27%.  Sexual 
Orientation and Religious Belief were not collected until relatively recently, and as a 
consequence employees who have been with the trust for many years will often have 
nothing recorded against these criteria.  This results in just under 11.4% of employees for 
whom the trust has no record of Sexual Orientation, and just under 10.5% with no record 
of Religious Belief.  Over time the levels of employees with no record in these areas 
should reduce and these figures are down from just over 13% and 12% respectively in 
2015. 
 
Appendix 1 provides the data tables for detailed information regarding the workforce profile 
by protected characteristics. 
 

Protected 
Group 

Analysis 

Page 104 of 235



 

Page 7 of 49 
 

Age When compared to the Northamptonshire population, the percentage of 
staff in the 16-20 and over 60 age groups is significantly lower.  
However, this would be expected given the numbers of people in the 
wider population still in education in the first group, and the number 
having taken retirement in the second. 
 
If only those people in the 20-60 age groups of the Northamptonshire 
population and NGH workforce are considered, then the trust is fairly 
representative of the local population in most age groups.  However, 
the local population has 19.7% of the working age group in the 55 – 64 
range, whereas at NGH this falls to 13.8% which may relate to the 
lower pension age of 60 for many current and former NHS employees. 
 

Disability Only 2.54% of the NGH workforce has disclosed a disability.  
According to PANSI (Projecting Adult Needs & Service Information) the 
projection of Northamptonshire population aged between 18 and 64 
likely to have either a moderate or serious disability is 7.9 and 2.4% 
respectively.  However just under 27% of the workforce do not have a 
disability status recorded; if this data was complete the rate would 
probably increase but still be well below the local population estimated 
rate.  The physical nature of most work in the healthcare sector could 
help to explain the low representation of disabled people in the NGH 
workforce. 
 

Gender The NHS workforce is predominantly female, and at NGH the 
percentage is 78.8%.  The staff groups with the highest percentage of 
female employees are the registered nursing & midwifery (92.5%), 
admin & clerical (82.6%), and clinical support staff (88%) groups.  
However the percentage of male employees is higher than the total for 
all staff, in the Agenda for Change band 8a – 9 group, at 29.8%.  
Within the medical & dental staff group 58% are male, and 68% of 
consultants are male.  The percentage of male consultants has fallen 
since 2014, when the figure was 70%. 
 

Ethnicity According to the 2011 Census, the Northamptonshire population was 
91.5% white, 8.5% Black & Minority Ethnic (BME), whereas the trust 
employees (as at 31 March 2016) were 76.8% white (of which 69.8% 
were British or Irish), 19.4% BME.  The overall percentage of BME 
employees is boosted by the high representation of this group (49.1%) 
in the Medical & Dental staff group. 
 
If Medical & Dental staff were removed from the analysis, then the 
BME percentage in the remaining staff groups falls to 15.9%, but this 
nonetheless remains a significantly higher ratio than in the local 
population.  Although only 7.6% of staff in Agenda for Change bands 
8a – 9 are in the BME group, 19.4% of bands 5 – 7 are BME, higher 
than the average BME representation across all pay bands in the trust. 
 

Religion The 2011 Census data indicated that 59.9% of the population of 
Northamptonshire were Christian, 1.7% Muslim, and 1.2% Hindu.  
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Employee data showed 48.9% Christian, rising to 51.4% if Medical & 
Dental staff were excluded.  The percentage of the local population 
professing no religion was 29.2%; 10.2% of employee records had no 
religion defined, and a further 15.8% did not wish to state their religion 
or belief, while 11% professed to be Atheist.  In total, 14.1% of 
employees are from a minority faith community. 
 

Sexual 
Orientation 

Sexual Orientation information is not collected as part of the National 
Census so a comparison cannot be made between trust employees 
and the Northamptonshire population.  However, 73.1% of employees 
are recorded as heterosexual.  13.9% did not wish to state their sexual 
orientation, and a further 11.4% had no data recorded.  Bisexual, Gay 
or Lesbian employees made up 1.64% of the total. 
 

Marital Status Of the total number of employees, 51.4% were married compared with 
41.4% of the local population; 33.9% of employees were single, 6.7% 
divorced, 0.6% in a civil partnership, 1.2% separated, and 0.9% 
widowed.  The comparable figures in the local population were 29.2% 
single, 14.3% divorced, 0.2% civil partnership, 5.3% separated, and 
9.6% widowed.  The much higher percentage of widowed people in the 
population reflects the number in older age-groups no longer part of the 
working or economically active population. 
 

 

 
 
Sickness Absence Analysis (number of episodes) 
 
The number of separate episodes of sickness for the year ending 31 March 2016 was 
7,923.  Appendix 1 provides the data tables for detailed analysis of the information.  
 
Employees’ pay band or grade appears to have a relatively significant influence on the 
number of sickness episodes compared to other Equality & Diversity factors.  Band 2 
employees comprise 20% of the workforce, and are the second biggest staff group, but 
they were responsible for the single highest percentage of the sickness, equating to 
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27.01% of all episodes.  The biggest staff group in pay band terms is Band 5, with just 
under 21% of the workforce, and they accounted for the second highest percentage of 
sickness episodes, at 25.89%.  Staff in bands 7 and 8a-9 account for 8.5% and 3.5% of 
the workforce but only 6.5% and 2.3% of the sickness episodes. 

Protected Group Analysis 

Age The percentage of the total number of sickness episodes relating to 
each age group equates relatively to the proportionate size of each 
age group in terms of staff in post, indicating a fairly even spread of 
sickness across all age groups.  However, all the age groups from 
16-20 to 31-35 had a higher proportion of the sickness than would 
be indicated by their proportion of the workforce, while those groups 
from 46-50 to 71+ all had a lower proportion of the sickness 
episodes.  The second biggest age group numerically, 26-30 
(12.69% of the workforce) had the highest group percentage of the 
total number of sickness episodes at 13.56%. 
 

Disability Employees who declare a disability comprise 2.54% of the 
workforce, although this figure would probably increase if the status 
of the 22.5% where no record is held was known.  However, those 
employees who do declare a disability accounted for 4.1% of the 
sickness episodes.  It is perhaps to be expected that this would be 
the case. 
 

Gender Whilst 78.8% of employees are female, they accounted for 84.8% of 
the sickness episodes, indicating that gender does have an 
influence on the likelihood of sickness absence. 
 

Ethnicity In terms of ethnic groups as a percentage of the total number of 
employees, the percentage of sickness episodes in each group 
shows some variation.  Asian staff comprise 10.2% of the number of 
employees but account for only 7.9% of sickness episodes.  White 
employees comprise 76.8% of the workforce and account for 79.6% 
of sickness episodes. 
 

Religion Religious belief does not seem to play a significant part in an 
employee’s likelihood of having episodes of sickness absence.  The 
spread of sickness episodes across religious belief groupings is 
fairly consistent with the ratio of employees in each group, for 
example 49.6% of sickness episodes are within the Christianity 
group, which accounts for 48.9% of the workforce.  However Islam is 
stated as the religion for 2.6% of the workforce but accounts for only 
1.5% of sickness episodes, and similarly Hinduism applies to 2.9% 
of the workforce and only 1.4% of sickness episodes. 
 

Sexual 
Orientation 

As with religious belief, the percentage of staff within each category 
of sexual orientation as compared with the percentage of the total 
sickness episodes recorded does not show a significant variation, 
although those with no sexual orientation recorded or those not 
wishing to state their sexual orientation amount to 25.2% of the 
workforce and have 23.1% of sickness attributed to them.  This 
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represents a relatively large percentage of the workforce in total and 
may make meaningful analysis less likely.  Nonetheless, 74.5% of 
sickness episodes occur in the heterosexual group, which in turn 
makes up 73.1% of the workforce.  The Gay, Lesbian & Bisexual 
groups total 1.6% of the workforce and account for 2.4% of the 
sickness episodes. 
 

Marital Status There is some variation across the marital status groups between 
the percentage of employees in each one and the percentage of 
sickness episodes in each one.  For example, married or civil 
partnership employees are slightly less likely to have sickness, with 
52.% of the workforce being in these groups but only taking 48% of 
the sickness episodes.  By contrast divorced or legally separated 
employees make up 7.9% of the workforce and accounted for 9.5% 
of sickness episodes.  Single employees are 33.9% of the workforce 
and they accumulated 37.8% of sickness episodes. 
 

 

 
 
Leaving Employment 
 
In total, 486 employees with permanent contracts left the trust in the year ending 31 March 
2016.  The biggest pay band groups numerically had contrasting leaver records.  Band 2 
employees form 21.5% of the permanent workforce but 20.2% of leavers were from this 
group; band 5 employees (22% of the permanent workforce) made up 27.4% of leavers.  
Band 5 registered nurses were 17.3% of the workforce but 21.4% of leavers. 
 

Protected 
Group 

Analysis 

Age A higher proportion of employees in the age groups from 16 to 25 
left in the year than would be indicated by comparison with the 
percentage of the workforce that they represent.  Almost 16.5% of 
leavers came from this age group, which represents only 11.5% of 
the workforce in post. However this is an improvement from the 
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previous year when they formed 19.5% of leavers and 11.4% of 
the workforce. 
 
By contrast, the staff groups aged between 26 and 55 make up 
73.5% of the workforce, but only 63.2% of the leavers.  People in 
these groups seem to become a stable part of the workforce, 
compared to those younger and probably earlier in their careers 
who are more inclined to change their employer. 
 
Employees aged over 55 made up 20.4% of the leavers but 15.1% 
of the workforce, basically in line with what might be expected 
given the numbers who would be retiring from this range. 
 

Disability Although the number of leavers in the group declaring a disability 
was small, they represented 3.1% of leavers, slightly higher than 
their representation rate among all employees, which was 2.54%.  
Employees positively declaring no disability (66.9% of the 
workforce) made up 65% of leavers, again in line with what might 
be expected. 
 

Gender Whilst 78.8% of the workforce is female, they made up 80.7% of 
the leavers.  The male workforce (21.2%) provided 19.3% of 
leavers, so was slightly under-represented. 
 

Ethnicity White employees made up only 76.5% of leavers, compared to 
79.1% of the permanent workforce, so this group is under-
represented. Black employees are 6.1% of the workforce but 7.4% 
of leavers, so this group is slightly over-represented. Asian 
employees (10.2% of all employees, but 8.4% when employees on 
fixed term contracts are excluded as they do not form part of the 
leaver statistics) were only 6.79% of leavers, so therefore appear 
to be less likely to leave the trust. 
 

Religion Around 46.9% of leavers were recorded as Christian, a slightly 
lower rate than the overall rate in the workforce, which varies 
between 48.9% and 50.3% depending on whether employees on 
fixed term contracts are excluded.   Among the minority religions, 
the percentage of leavers is slightly higher than might be expected 
when compared to the ratio of permanent trust employees in each 
religious group. 
 

Sexual 
Orientation 

A reasonably comparable percentage of Heterosexual permanent 
employees were leavers (71%) compared with the permanent 
workforce (72.3%).  Those people not wishing to state their sexual 
orientation made up 18.3% of leavers compared with only 13.9% 
of the workforce.  Gay, Lesbian or Bisexual employees are 1.6% 
of the workforce and 1.6% of the leavers. 
 

Marital Status Married employees were less likely to leave than their proportion 
of the workforce would suggest; 48% of leavers were married or in 
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a civil partnership, compared to 52% in the workforce or 52.8% 
when those on fixed term contracts are excluded (as they are not 
included in the leaver figures).  Similarly, divorced and separated 
employees made up 7.9% of the workforce (8.36% excluding fixed 
term contracts) and 6.8% of leavers. 
Single employees by contrast comprise around 33% of the 
workforce (using both measures above) but 36.8% of leavers.  
This is likely to be linked to the age range of single employees, as 
they tend to fall into the younger age groups and are probably 
more likely to change employment before settling into a longer 
term career choice. 
 

 

 
 
 

RECRUITMENT ACTIVITY – APRIL 2015 TO MARCH 2016 
 
This section of the report is based on the recruitment activity information collected by the 
HR Service Centre between April 2015 and March 2016 and in relation to the protected 
characteristics of: 
 

 The number of applicants 

 Those shortlisted 

 Staff appointed.  
 
Equality and Diversity is addressed throughout the recruitment process, from 
advertisement of the job, to the appointment of the successful candidate, such as following 
the Trusts advertisement process, targeting a wide range of audiences.  
 
Managers receive anonymous applications to ensure the selection process is equal and 
fair. Candidates shortlisted for interviews are based on their education, qualifications, 
experience and their personal specification.  
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During the period that the report covers the Trust received 24,575 applications for 
vacancies, 6,565 people were shortlisted for interview and 1,334 people were appointed.  
This is an increase from the previous year whereby 22,867 were received, 5,784 people 
were shortlisted and 1,048 people were appointed. 
 
 
Recruitment - Ethnicity 
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The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by ethnicity.  
 
The charts demonstrate that White – British has the highest amount of applications with 
14,269 which equates to 58.06% of all applications. 3,944 were shortlisted and 814 of 
them were appointed to a position at the Trust.  
 
 WHITE - Any other white background has the second highest amount of applications 
made with 2,442 which resulted in 517 candidates being shortlisted of which 128 were 
successful in gaining a position with the hospital.   
 
ASIAN or ASIAN BRITISH - Indian has the third highest amount of applications with 
2,014 of which 609 were shortlisted and 97 were successful in gaining employment.  
 
The White – British categories continue to shortlist and appoint the highest number of 
applicants with 60.08% being shortlisted and 61.02% being appointed but this has had a 
slight decrease in comparison with 2014/2015 as in 2014/2015 62.1% White – British 
were shortlisted and 69.72% were appointed.  
 
There has been a 2% increase of applications received from WHITE – any other 
background candidates compared to 2014/2015 and a slight increase in ASIAN OR 
ASIAN BRITISH - INDIA.  This can be attributed to the specific recruitment drives 
targeting European and Indian nurses. 
 
Slight increases have also been noted in the ASIAN OR ASIAN BRITISH - Bangladeshi, 
MIXED - White & Black Caribbean appointments. 
 
There has been a significant increase in the Undisclosed category of 4.42%. 
 
There has been a slight decrease in percentage for some of the Asian and Mixed 
categories appointed in comparison to 2014/2015. 

 
Recruitment - Gender 
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Category Description Applications 
% 

Application Shortlisted 
% 

Shortlisted Appointed 
% 

Appointed 

Gender Male 5605.00 22.81 1368.00 20.84 255.00 19.12 

 
Female 18833.00 76.63 5139.00 78.28 1060.00 79.46 

 
Undisclosed 137.00 0.56 58.00 0.88 19.00 1.42 

        Total 
 

24575.00 100.0 6565.00 100.00 1334.00 100.00 

 
The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by gender. 
 
There is a significant correlation between the gender demographic of the Trust and the 
recruitment to posts by gender.  The Trust in line with previous year’s data appointed a 
slightly lower proportion of females with 76.63% applying for positions, 78.28% being 
shortlisted and 79.46% being appointed, which is 2.14% lower than the previous year.  
 
The Trust has appointed 0.9% more of males than in 2014/2015, however there were 
fewer applications received (22.81%) when compared to 23.3% the previous year.  Of 
those who applied, 20.84% were shortlisted and 19.12% were appointed.  This could be 
attributed to the number of male nurses appointed through international recruitment 
campaigns during 2015/2016. 
 
The undisclosed category for gender applications has remained the same. Applications 
are anonymous so that hiring managers are unable to identify the protected 
characteristics of individuals as both the application and shortlisting stages. This 
provides reassurance that this significant difference is not discriminatory at any stage.  
 
The high number of female gender applications may be the outcome of the nursing 
recruitment activity nationally and internationally.   All data indicators show that this 
particular staff group attracts a high proportion of female gender. 
 
Recruitment – Disability 
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Category Description Applications 
% 

Application Shortlisted 
% 

Shortlisted Appointed 
% 

Appointed 

Disability  Yes 889.00 3.62 272.00 4.14 49.00 3.67 

 
No 23315.00 94.87 6172.00 94.01 1262.00 94.60 

 
Undisclosed 371.00 1.51 121.00 1.84 23.00 1.72 

        Total 
 

24575.00 100.00 6565.00 100.00 1334.00 100.00 

 
The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by disability. 
 
Northampton General Hospital is committed to supporting people with disabilities.  The 
Trust has retained the “Two Ticks” symbol which provides recognition by Jobcentre Plus 
that employers have made certain commitments regarding employment, retention, 
training, support and carer development of disabled people.  
 
The Trust believes that its continued commitment encourages disabled people to apply 
for the jobs within the hospital and this is evidenced in the tables above which 
demonstrate the Trust's Guaranteed Interview Scheme is being applied as 3.62% of 
disabled people applied for a position at the Trust and of those 4.14% were shortlisted 
and 3.67 were appointed.  
 
There has been a 1.37% increase in the number of disabled people appointed to the 
Trust and the likely reason for this is due to the revised Appointing Officer Training that 
has been delivered to staff which includes greater emphasis on equality and diversity 
within the recruitment setting.   
 
Recruitment – Age 
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Category Description Applications 
% 

Application Shortlisted 
% 

Shortlisted Appointed 
% 

Appointed 

Age 
Band Under 18 187.00 0.76 74.00 1.13 32.00 2.40 

 
18 to 19 1045.00 4.25 230.00 3.50 62.00 4.65 

 
20 to 24 4766.00 19.39 985.00 15.00 206.00 15.44 

 
25 to 29 4371.00 17.79 1046.00 15.93 219.00 16.42 

 
30 to 34 3524.00 14.34 907.00 13.82 171.00 12.82 

 
35 to 39 2603.00 10.59 814.00 12.40 174.00 13.04 

 
40 to 44 2382.00 9.69 745.00 11.35 126.00 9.45 

 
45 to 49 2197.00 8.94 695.00 10.59 136.00 10.19 

 
50 to 54 1770.00 7.20 541.00 8.24 96.00 7.20 

 
55 to 59 1167.00 4.75 338.00 5.15 65.00 4.87 

 
60 to 64 458.00 1.86 139.00 2.12 24.00 1.80 

 
65 to 69 39.00 0.16 11.00 0.17 0.00 0.00 

 
70 and over 7.00 0.03 4.00 0.06 1.00 0.07 

 
Undisclosed 59.00 0.24 36.00 0.55 22.00 1.65 

Total  
 

24575.00 100.00 6565.00 100.00 1334.00 100.00 
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The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by age. 
 
In 2014/2015 the highest number of applications were received from the 20 to 24 age 
group with 4,766 applications (19.39%) out of these 15% were shortlisted and 15.44% 
were appointed.  
 
The second highest number of applicants came from the age group of 25 to 29 year 
olds with 4,371 applications (17.79).  15.93% were shortlisted and 16.42% were 
appointed.  
 
There has been an increase in the percentage appointed in the 45-49 age group of 
1.39%.  The age groups for under 18's and 18 to 19 have also increased and this is due 
to the Trust's ongoing work with apprentices.  In addition appointees who have not 
disclosed their age has increased by 1.45% to 1.65% in total. 
 
There was a slight decrease in the 20-24 and 25-29 age groups in 2014/2015.  
Recruitment had been targeted at student nurses and existing non-registered staff to 
undertake nurse training which would result in the higher age groups being appointed.  

 
Recruitment – Religious Belief 

 

 
 

Page 122 of 235



 

 

Page 25 of 49 
 

 
 

 
 

Category Description Applications 
% 

Application Shortlisted 
% 

Shortlisted Appointed 
% 

Appointed 

Religion Atheism 3187 12.97 829 12.63 198.00 14.84 

 
Buddhism 166 0.68 51 0.78 3.00 0.22 

 
Christianity 12819 52.16 3567 54.33 717.00 53.75 

 
Hinduism 842 3.43 205 3.12 33.00 2.47 

 
Islam 1559 6.34 315 4.80 49.00 3.67 

 
Jainism 21 0.09 6 0.09 2.00 0.15 

 
Judaism 18 0.07 5 0.08 0.00 0.00 

 
Sikhism 169 0.69 52 0.79 5.00 0.37 

 
Other 3072 12.50 750 11.42 124.00 9.30 

 
Undisclosed 2722 11.08 785 11.96 203.00 15.22 

Total  
 

24575 100.00 6565 100.00 1334.00 100.00 
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The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by religious belief. 
 
Christianity had the most number of applicants with 12,819 (52.16%), 3,567 of which 
were shortlisted (54.33%) and 717 were appointed (53.75%). This showed there has 
been a decreased in the number of Christians appointed when compared to 2014/2015.  
 
Atheism had the second highest amount of applications with 3,187 (12.97) and 829 
(12.63%) were shortlisted.  198 (14.84%) were appointed. In comparison to 2014/2015, 
the number of staff appointed in the Atheism category has decreased.  
 
Islam has increased by 1.07% in the number of appointed candidates compared to 
2014/2015.  There has also been a slight increase Hinduism, Jainism and other 
category for appointed candidates.   
 
However, there has been a significant increase of 4.12% in the number of appointed 
candidates who did not disclose their religious belief.  
 
Recruitment – Sexual Orientation 
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The charts above show the number of applications that have been received, shortlisted 
and appointed between April 2015 and March 2016 by sexual orientation. 
 
The highest number of individuals applying for posts at Northampton General Hospital 
and being appointed still remains within the heterosexual group, with 89.95% being 
shortlisted and 88.38% being appointed, which is a decrease from the previous year.  
 
The undisclosed category being used has increased for 2014/2015 significantly by 
4.22%.  The reasons for this are unknown. 
 
There has been a minor decrease in the Lesbian, Gay and Bisexual Categories for staff 
that have been appointed. 

 
 

HUMAN RESOURCES (HR) CASELOAD ACTIVITY – APRIL 2015 TO 
MARCH 2016 
 
Background 
 
This section of the report provides the equal opportunities breakdown for the formal 
Human Resources (HR) caseload activity across the Trust between the period of April 
2015 and March 2016 for both open and closed formal cases.  
 
The HR activity has been broken down into the following categories: 
 

 Harassment and Bullying 

 Grievances 

 Conduct – Disciplinary 

 Performance Management 
 
In the year ending March 2016 there were 99 formal cases; 10 Harassment and Bullying 
cases, 10 Grievances, 73 Disciplinary cases and 6 Performance cases recorded on the 
HR database.   
 
 
 
 
 

Category Description Applications 
% 

Application Shortlisted 
% 

Shortlisted Appointed 
% 

Appointed 

Sexual 
Orientation Lesbian 179 0.73 37 0.56 6 0.45 

 
Gay 210 0.85 60 0.91 13 0.97 

 
Bisexual 244 0.99 51 0.78 9 0.67 

 
Heterosexual 22175 90.23 5905 89.95 1179 88.38 

 
Undisclosed 1767 7.19 512 7.80 127 9.52 

Total 
 

24575 100.0 6565 100.00 1334 100.00 
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Harassment and Bullying Cases  
 

Age Group No. Comment 

16 - 20  There appears to be a trend towards the 51-55 age 
group for harassment and bullying complaints. 
However, this is also the age group with the highest 
proportion of staff in the Trust (12.90%) 

21 - 25 1 

26 - 30  

31 - 35 1 

36 - 40 1 

41 - 45 1 

46 - 50 2 

51 - 55 4 

56 - 60  

61 – 65  

66 - 70  

 

Disability No. Comment 

Yes 1 The numbers do not suggest any trend towards 
disabled or non-disabled members of staff. No 8 

Not Declared 1 

Undefined  

 

Gender No. Comment 

Female 6 Given the small number of cases, this split appears 
high for men against the 78.79% female and 21.21% 
male split in the trust as a whole. Further analysis 
may be required. 

Male 4 

 

Ethnicity No. Comment 

White 9 Given the small number of cases, this split appears 
slightly higher than expected for those with a White 
ethnicity based on the 75% White and 25% BME split 
across the Trust. 

BME 1 

 

Marital Status No. Comment 

Civil 
Partnership 

 There have been no allegations of marital status 
being a factor within the small number of cases 
reported. Divorced  

Legally 
separated 

 

Married 5 

Single 5 

Unknown  

Widowed  
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Sexual 
Orientation 

No. Comment 

Bisexual  It appears that sexual orientation was not a factor in 
any harassment or bullying cases. Gay 1 

Heterosexual 4 

Does not wish 
to disclose 

1 

Lesbian  

Undefined 4 

 

Religion No. Comment 

Atheism 1 The split of religious beliefs is not sufficiently 
disclosed to allow any meaningful analysis Buddhism  

Christianity 1 

Hinduism  

Does not wish 
to disclose 

1 

Other 1 

Undefined 6 

 
Grievance Cases   

 

Age Group No. Comment 

16 - 20 1 There does not appear to be a trend in relation to age 
group. 21 – 25  

26 - 30 1 

31 - 35 1 

36 - 40 1 

41 – 45  

46 – 50 2 

51 – 55 2 

56 – 60 2 

61 – 65  

66 - 70  

 

Disability No. Comment 

Yes  Disability did not factor in any grievance cases 
recorded. No 5 

Not Declared  

Undefined 5 

 

Gender No. Comment 

Female 8 Given the small number of cases, this split is 
reasonably representative of the 78.79% female and 
21.21% male split in the Trust as a whole. 

Male 2 
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Ethnicity No. Comment 

White 9 Given the small number of cases, this split appears 
slightly higher than expected for  those with a White 
ethnicity based on the 75% White and 25% BME split 
across the Trust. 

BME 1 

 

Marital Status No. Comment 

Civil 
Partnership 

 Just over half of NGH employees are married, which 
is reflected in the marital status of those employees 
involved in a grievance procedure in the year ending 
31 March 2016.   

Divorced 1 

Legally 
separated 

 

Married 5 

Single 4 

Unknown  

Widowed  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Sexual 
Orientation 

No. Comment 

Bisexual  The split of sexual orientation is not sufficiently 
disclosed to allow any meaningful analysis. Gay  

Heterosexual 5 

Does not wish 
to disclose 

 

Lesbian  

Undefined 5 

Religion No. Comment 

Atheism  The split of religious beliefs is not sufficiently 
disclosed to allow any meaningful analysis. Buddhism  

Christianity 4 
Hinduism  
Does not wish 
to disclose 

6 

Other  
Undefined  
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Disciplinary Cases  
 

Age Group No. Comment 

16 – 20 6 The spread of disciplinary cases is high between the 
ages of 41and 50, however is representative of the 
age ratio of staff across the Trust. 

21 – 25 4 

26 – 30 10 

31 – 35 5 

36 – 40 9 

41 – 45 12 

46 – 50 13 

51 – 55 7 

56 – 60 5 

61 - 65 2 

66 - 70 0 

 

Disability No. Comment 

Yes 12 12 of the disciplinary cases recorded involve 
employees with a declared disability which is 
significantly higher than expected, when compared 
with the Trusts profile on disability at 2.54%. 
As part of the disciplinary process it is extremely rare 
that an individual’s disability is apparent or known. 

No 43 

Not Declared 4 

Undefined 14 

 

Gender No. Comment 

Female 36 The gender split of disciplinary cases is not 
representative of the split in the organisation as a 
whole. 

Male 37 

 

Ethnicity No. Comment 

White 59 The ethnicity split of disciplinary cases does not 
represent the split in the organisation as a whole, of 
75% White and 25% BME. 

BME 11 

Not stated 3 

 

Marital Status No. Comment 

Civil 
Partnership 

1 The split of cases is higher than expected for singles 
based on the workforce profile for the Trust of 34% 
single. Divorced 4 

Legally 
separated 

 

Married 23 

Single 41 

Unknown 4 

Widowed  

 
 
 
 
 

Page 130 of 235



 

 

Page 33 of 49 
 

Sexual 
Orientation 

No. Comment 

Bisexual 1 The split of cases is indicative of the sexual 
orientation of NGH employees. Gay 1 

Heterosexual 39 

Does not wish 
to disclose 

6 

Lesbian  

Undefined 26 

 

Religion No. Comment 

Atheism 6 The split of religious beliefs is not sufficiently 
disclosed to allow any meaningful analysis Buddhism  

Christianity 22 

Hinduism  

Islam 1 

Does not wish 
to disclose 

9 

Other 3 

Undefined 32 
 

Performance Management Cases  
 

Age Group No. Comment 

16 – 20  The low numbers is not sufficient to allow any 
meaningful analysis. 21 – 25  

26 - 30 1 

31 - 35  

41 - 45 1 

46 - 50  

51 - 55 4 

56 - 60  

61 – 65  

66 - 70  

 

Disability No. Comment 

Yes 1 The low numbers is not sufficient to allow any 
meaningful analysis. No 4 

Not Declared  

Undefined 1 

 

Gender No. Comment 

Female 5 Given the small number of cases, this split is 
reasonable. Male 1 

 

Ethnicity No. Comment 

White 6 Given the small number of cases, this split is 
reasonably representative. BME  
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Marital Status No. Comment 

Civil 
Partnership 

 There have been no concerns raised regarding 
marital status being a factor within the small number 
of cases. Divorced  

Legally 
separated 

1 

Married 2 

Single 2 

Unknown 1 

Widowed  

 

Sexual 
Orientation 

No. Comment 

Bisexual  It appears that sexual orientation was not a factor in 
any performance cases. Gay  

Heterosexual 3 

Does not wish 
to disclose 

 

Lesbian  

Undefined 3 

 

Religion No. Comment 

Atheism  It appears that religious belief was not a factor in any 
performance cases. Buddhism  

Christianity 1 

Hinduism  

Does not wish 
to disclose 

1 

Other 1 

Undefined 3 

 
 

LEARNING AND DEVELOPMENT – APRIL 2015 TO MARCH 2016 
 
Background 
 
The Trust uses the Oracle Learning Management System (OLM) to record training 
information.  This is a centralised system and the focus since its implementation in 
2009. It has been used to record Mandatory Training and Role Specific Essential 
Training attendance which is then collated and reported from the Electronic Staff 
Record (ESR) system. 
 
The Trust also provides and maintains records on clinical training such as Cannulation, 
Glucometer, Catheterisation and Drug Calculation which are included in this section of 
the report.  We have continued to offer courses on Interview skills, Assertiveness, 
Communication skills, Appraisal Training for Managers, Appraisal Training for Staff and 
this year ran a pilot VRQ Team Leading course. This proved successful, so is now 
available for all staff who are aspiring to become team leaders.  
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Our training is split between Mandatory Training and Role Specific Essential Training 
(RSET). Mandatory means all staff need to attend, whilst RSET has been set against 
roles. It is a continuous piece of work to ensure that RSET training is accurately set 
against each role, so that when changes are made to the design of the course, or when 
regulations are updated those who need to attend the courses is reviewed. This 
ensures that staff do not attend courses that are not relevant to them.   
 
To ensure that all staff achieve the require outcomes of the training, sessions have 
been adapted to help staff within different roles understand what it means to them. 
 
The Trust Induction is now offered twice a month which has meant that the groups are 
now smaller. This has meant that instead of lecture style training, it is more interactive 
with group work, quizzes and case studies. This meets the different learning styles 
across our staff groups and has helped to embed learning. 
 
The Trust has continued to recruit International nurses, which has led to bespoke 
preceptorship programmes and clinical skills being run. The Trust provides the IELTS 
(International English Language Testing System) Level 7 and ‘Speak Up’ courses when 
required. 
 
Throughout the year, work has continued on producing workbooks and e-learning. We 
now have e-learning and workbook/Assessments for all mandatory training subjects, 
plus face to face sessions. 
 
Demand continues to be high for RoK and this with e-learning training seems to be the 
preferred option of training than attending a traditional classroom lecture. 
Staff are encouraged to access on-going development across all levels; this includes 
Apprenticeship Frameworks, NVQ’s & Foundation Degrees. Registered staff are also 
able to access modules at Degree & Masters level via the Learning Beyond Registration 
contract held with Health Education East Midlands and 12 Higher Education Providers 
across the region. 
 
In November NGH won ‘Employer of the Year’ for our support of Apprentices. We 
continue to employ Apprentices across Directorates and roles, with 24 apprentices 
commencing their apprenticeship during 2015 and 2016 and 11 apprentices have been 
offered full time employment by the Trust on completing their apprenticeship during 
2015 and 2016. This year we ran a pilot for 7 Clinical Apprentices, which resulted in 
another group of clinical apprentices who commenced in February 2016.  
 
The table below shows the analysis of the Trustwide workforce using the Trust 
headcount by protected characteristics and the number of training courses attended.  
We currently collect data on 6 of the 9 protected characteristics, those not included are; 
Gender Reassignment, Marriage and Civil Partnership and Pregnancy and Maternity.  
It is important to note that the reports used for the analysis include the Trust’s bank 
staff.   
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Training – Trust Headcount of 5,982 

Protected Group Analysis 

Sexual Orientation 

The number of ‘not stated’ has 
decreased from last year, but the 
number of staff who do not wish to 
disclose their sexual orientation has 
increased. There has however been 
an increase in the number of staff 
disclosing that they are Gay and 
Heterosexual compared to last year  
 
The report shows that all categories of 
sexual orientation are attending 
training and this correlates with the 
numbers of staff in post.   
 

Religious Belief 

The highest proportion of training was 
completed by the Christian religious 
group which correlates with the 
workforce profile.  There has been an 
increase in the number of staff who 
did not wish to disclose their 
religion/belief and in the Atheism 
group, but there has been a decrease 
in the number of staff not stating their 
religion/belief. 
 
The training in these other categories 
is being completed proportionately. 
 

Age Band 

Training is offered to all age groups. 
There has been an increase in the 
number of staff within all groups apart 
from 16-20 and 21-25. However, the 
biggest variance is within the age 
range 21-25 where more staff have 
attended training and the greater 
variance of non-attendance is within 
the 61-65 groups which may be 
attributable to this age group working 
more part-time and evenings or 
weekends. 
 

Gender 

There are more females attending 
training than males which correlate to 
the workforce profile. However, the 
report also identified that less males 
are completing training by proportion. 
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Disability 

The number of ‘not stated’ has 
decreased from last year and the 
report shows an increase on the 
number of staff disclosing a disability.  
 
Training is accessible to disabled staff 
with all training rooms providing good 
access. There is an increase in the 
opportunity to access training by e-
learning and workbooks so staff can 
complete their training at their usual 
workplace. 
 

Ethnic Origin 

The report details that training is 
provided to all staff and the Trust 
headcount and numbers of training 
courses attended by all staff reflects 
the Trust’s ethnic population.  For 
example the highest number of staff 
in the Trust is of white ethnicity with 
the second group being Asian and the 
third category from Black / Black 
British, which was the same last year. 
 
The highest variance in attendance is 
within the ‘Not Stated’ and then ‘White 
– Any other White Background’ group. 
Whilst the greatest variance in non-
attendance is in the ‘White – British’ 
group.  
 
There has been an increase in the 
number of staff who had ‘not stated’ 
and there has been an increase in 
‘Undefined’. 
 

 
The variance indicates whether the protected characteristics are accessing the training 
by proportion of headcount.   

 

Sexual Orientation
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

Bisexual 46 0.74% 473 1.03% 0.29%

Gay 37 0.60% 288 0.63% 0.03%

Heterosexual 4409 70.63% 33694 73.48% 2.85%

I do not wish to disclose my sexual orientation 966 15.48% 7275 15.86% 0.38%

Lesbian 19 0.30% 109 0.24% -0.06%

Not Stated 765 12.25% 4017 8.76% -3.49%

Total: 6242 45856  
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Age Band
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

16-20 183 2.93% 1563 3.41% 0.48%

21-25 676 10.83% 6051 13.20% 2.37%

26-30 851 13.63% 6837 14.91% 1.28%

31-35 736 11.79% 5488 11.97% 0.18%

36-40 724 11.60% 5617 12.25% 0.65%

41-45 708 11.34% 5350 11.67% 0.33%

46-50 699 11.20% 5050 11.01% -0.19%

51-55 713 11.42% 4699 10.25% -1.17%

56-60 527 8.44% 3339 7.28% -1.16%

61-65 272 4.36% 1420 3.01% -1.35%

66-70 116 1.86% 397 0.87% -0.99%

71 + 37 0.59% 45 0.10% -0.49%

Total: 6242 45856  

Religious Belief
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

Atheism 670 10.73% 5067 11.05% 0.32%

Buddhism 32 0.51% 230 0.50% -0.01%

Christianity 2919 46.77% 22395 48.84% 2.07%

Hinduism 182 2.91% 1486 3.24% 0.33%

I do not wish to disclose my religion/belief 1095 17.54% 8268 18.03% 0.49%

Islam 152 2.44% 1297 2.83% 0.39%

Jainism 6 0.10% 31 0.07% -0.03%

Judaism 6 0.10% 30 0.07% -0.03%

Other 436 6.98% 3220 7.02% 0.04%

Sikhism 25 0.40% 148 0.32% -0.08%

Not Stated 719 11.52% 3684 8.03% -3.49%

6242 45856  

Gender
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

Female 4788 76.71% 37225 81.18% 4.47%

Male 1454 23.29% 8631 18.82% -4.47%

Total: 6242 45856  

Disability
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

No 3975 63.68% 32041 69.87% 6.19%

Not Stated 2111 33.82% 12734 27.77% -6.05%

Yes 156 2.50% 1081 2.36% -0.14%

Total: 6242 45856  
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Ethnic Origin
Trust 

Headcount

Trust 

Headcount 

%

Trained 

Headcount

Trained 

Headcount 

%

Variance

A White - British 4174 66.87% 28606 62.38% -4.49%

B White - Irish 65 1.04% 496 1.08% 0.04%

C White - Any other White background 338 5.41% 3307 7.21% 1.80%

C3 White Unspecified 1 0.02% 14 0.03% 0.01%

CA White English 5 0.09% 44 0.10% 0.01%

CC White Welsh 1 0.02% 4 0.01% -0.01%

CFWhite Greek 3 0.05% 34 0.07% 0.02%

CH White Turkish 1 0.02% 0 0.00% -0.02%

CK White Italian 9 0.14% 70 0.15% 0.01%

CN White Gypsy/Romany 9 0.14% 142 0.31% 0.17%

CP White Polish 9 0.14% 75 0.16% 0.02%

CS White Albanian 1 0.02% 0 0.00% -0.02%

CX White Mixed 2 0.03% 11 0.02% -0.01%

CY White Other European 42 0.67% 322 0.70% 0.03%

D Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 33 0.53% 272 0.59% 0.06%

E Mixed - White & Black African 14 0.22% 103 0.22% 0.00%

F Mixed - White & Asian 21 0.34% 145 0.32% -0.02%

G Mixed - Any other mixed background 33 0.53% 248 0.54% 0.01%

GA Mixed - Black & Asian 1 0.02% 0 0.00% -0.02%

GC Mixed - Black & White 1 0.02% 3 0.01% -0.01%

GD Mixed - Chinese & White 1 0.02% 0 0.00% -0.02%

GE Mixed - Asian & Chinese 1 0.02% 6 0.01% -0.01%

GF Mixed - Other/Unspecified 1 0.02% 9 0.02% 0.00%

H Asian or Asian British - Indian 454 7.27% 3724 8.12% 0.85%

J Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 54 0.87% 467 1.02% 0.15%

K Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 28 0.45% 255 0.56% 0.11%

L Asian or Asian British - Any other Asian background 83 1.33% 752 1.63% 0.30%

LA Asian Mixed 1 0.02% 19 0.04% 0.02%

LE Asian Sri Lankan 9 0.14% 18 0.04% -0.10%

LF Asian Tamil 1 0.02% 15 0.03% 0.01%

LH Asian British 3 0.05% 32 0.07% 0.02%

LK Asian Unspecified 6 0.10% 55 0.12% 0.02%

M Black or Black British - Caribbean 68 1.09% 413 0.90% -0.19%

N Black or Black British - African 286 4.58% 2388 5.21% 0.63%

P Black or Black British - Any other Black background 25 0.40% 157 0.34% -0.06%

PC Black Nigerian 3 0.05% 6 0.01% -0.04%

PD Black British 7 0.11% 36 0.08% -0.03%

PE Black Unspecified 1 0.02% 1 0.01% -0.01%

R Chinese 24 0.38% 209 0.46% 0.08%

S Any Other Ethnic Group 50 0.80% 337 0.73% -0.07%

SC Filipino 9 0.14% 101 0.22% 0.08%

SD Malaysian 1 0.02% 0 0.00% -0.02%

SE Other Specified 8 0.13% 21 0.05% -0.08%

Undefined 76 1.22% 54 0.12% -1.10%

Z Not Stated 279 4.47% 2885 6.29% 1.82%

Total: 6242 45856  
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Equality & Diversity Training 
 
Our commitment to ensuring all our staff have appropriate equality and diversity training 
is borne out in the results of the Staff Survey. We made good progress over the last 
period, with an increase in our percentage of people saying the organisation acts fairly 
with regard to the career progression/ promotion, regardless of ethnic background, 
gender, religion, sexual orientation, disability or age, rising to 84%.  Equality and 
diversity training remains mandatory for all staff and is included on the Trust Induction.  
 
All staff have to update their refresh their Equality and Diversity Training every 3 years. 
To ensure staff are able to access this subject, we have various delivery styles; E-
learning, RoK sessions and Workbook/Assessment. In addition, all new staff are trained 
in Equality and Human Rights as part of their Trust Induction. 
 
All staff attending the Equality & Human Rights training are given an awareness of the 
nine protected characteristics under the Equalities Act 2010 and the adverse impact on 
clinical care if they are not respected.   
 
Conclusion 
 
With an increase in attendance of training for 2015/16, we can conclude that access to 
training and learning and development for all staff has improved.  To this end, provision 
has been developed to offer flexible approaches to learning that remove barriers to 
access for groups with protected characteristics. With the option of all mandatory 
training subjects can be completed through workbook/assessment sheets and e-
learning, this has meant that training can be accessed outside of normal working hours.  
 
Work has continued in certain areas to look at the way the training is delivered and the 
depth of knowledge required, this has led to some courses being adapted for those 
areas e.g. Domestic Services.  
 
We are aware that training and information accessed through attending sessions does 
not meet all of the different languages and culture requirements. Therefore we have 
worked with the relevant departments in making training easier to understand.  
Learning and Development continues to communicate to staff the Trust Mandatory 
Training Policy.  This policy ensures that all staff are aware of the mandatory and role 
specific training they are required to undertake and for the Trust to be compliant against 
its’ regulatory requirements.  
 
A prospectus is also made available to all staff detailing the clinical training that is 
available. 
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Equality and Human Rights Monitoring Report 2015~2016  
V1 Draft 
 

43 

 

Staff in Post by Ethnic Origin and Pay Group 

Ethnic Origin / Pay 

Group

Apprent

ice Band 1 Band 2 Band 3 Band 4 Band 5 Band 6 Band 7 Band 8A-9

Consul

tant Other

Other 

Medical Total

A White - British 20 222 732 318 316 548 496 348 148 105 19 77 3349

B White - Irish 7 10 2 2 12 7 4 4 2 3 53

C White - Any other 

White background 49 58 25 6 70 15 10 4 12 1 29 279

C3 White Unspecified 1 1

CA White English 2 2 1 5

CC White Welsh 1 1

CFWhite Greek 2 2

CK White Italian 1 2 1 2 1 1 8

CN White 

Gypsy/Romany 4 1 4 9

CP White Polish 1 4 1 1 1 8

CS White Albanian 1 1

CX White Mixed 1 1

CY White Other 

European 2 1 2 16 3 3 5 32

D Mixed - White & 

Black Caribbean 6 4 1 5 5 1 22

E Mixed - White & 

Black African 2 1 2 1 3 9

F Mixed - White & 

Asian 2 2 1 1 1 3 3 3 16

G Mixed - Any other 

mixed background 1 9 3 2 4 3 1 5 28

GC Mixed - Black & 

White 1 1

GE Mixed - Asian & 

Chinese 1 1

H Asian or Asian 

British - Indian 12 53 11 14 104 21 15 6 54 65 355

J Asian or Asian 

British - Pakistani 1 1 3 4 2 5 26 42

K Asian or Asian 

British - Bangladeshi 1 1 1 3 7 1 2 1 4 21

L Asian or Asian 

British - Any other 

Asian background 4 18 2 1 14 5 2 2 8 13 69

LA Asian Mixed 1 1

LE Asian Sri Lankan 3 3

LF Asian Tamil 1 1

LH Asian British 2 1 3

LK Asian Unspecified 1 4 5

M Black or Black 

British - Caribbean 5 13 3 4 15 3 5 2 1 1 52

N Black or Black 

British - African 17 33 9 6 96 30 9 1 3 16 220

P Black or Black 

British - Any other 

Black background 1 5 2 2 3 1 14

PC Black Nigerian 1 1

PD Black British 1 1 1 1 4

R Chinese 1 1 3 1 3 1 4 7 21

S Any Other Ethnic 

Group 1 6 4 1 12 2 3 1 4 11 45

SC Filipino 4 5 9

SE Other Specified 1 1 2 4

Undefined 1 1 2 4

Z Not Stated 21 17 7 14 77 16 9 1 6 3 14 185

Total 21 353 977 408 379 1011 615 413 171 216 23 298 4885

E
nc
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Equality and Human Rights Monitoring Report 2015~2016  
V1 Draft 
 

46 

 

Sickness Episodes by Ethnic Origin and Pay Group 

Ethnic Origin / Pay 

Group Apprentice Band 1 Band 2 Band 3 Band 4 Band 5 Band 6 Band 7 Band 8A-9 Consultant Other

Other 

Medical Total

A White - British 11 348 1644 601 521 1168 820 427 163 21 0 22 5746

B White - Irish 10 20 6 0 21 10 5 2 0 2 76

C White - Any other 

White background 70 104 51 7 107 24 23 7 0 0 8 401

C3 White Unspecified 2 2

CA White English 1 1 0 2

CC White Welsh 1 1

CFWhite Greek 5 5

CK White Italian 3 0 0 2 1 1 7

CN White 

Gypsy/Romany 0 0 8 8

CP White Polish 5 3 2 5 1 16

CS White Albanian 0 0

CX White Mixed 6 6

CY White Other 

European 1 2 0 23 6 1 3 36

D Mixed - White & 

Black Caribbean 8 8 4 17 14 1 52

E Mixed - White & 

Black African 1 0 1 0 1 3

F Mixed - White & 

Asian 0 0 1 0 2 1 0 1 5

G Mixed - Any other 

mixed background 4 17 11 3 9 1 0 4 49

GC Mixed - Black & 

White 1 1

GE Mixed - Asian & 

Chinese 2 2

H Asian or Asian 

British - Indian 15 115 9 3 211 40 25 6 4 33 461

J Asian or Asian 

British - Pakistani 4 2 6 6 1 0 20 39

K Asian or Asian 

British - Bangladeshi 0 3 0 2 8 1 3 0 1 18

L Asian or Asian 

British - Any other 

Asian background 2 44 6 0 34 7 0 0 2 6 101

LA Asian Mixed 1 1

LE Asian Sri Lankan 0 0

LF Asian Tamil 0 0

LH Asian British 6 1 7

LK Asian Unspecified 1 0 1

M Black or Black 

British - Caribbean 11 14 0 10 28 5 2 0 1 0 71

N Black or Black 

British - African 15 74 15 12 209 46 8 0 0 7 386

P Black or Black 

British - Any other 

Black background 2 16 3 0 8 1 30

PC Black Nigerian 4 4

PD Black British 0 2 3 3 8

R Chinese 2 0 0 3 1 0 3 1 10

S Any Other Ethnic 

Group 0 15 10 2 27 2 0 0 0 2 58

SC Filipino 2 12 14

SE Other Specified 2 0 0 2

Undefined 0 0 1 1

Z Not Stated 28 38 18 31 135 22 18 0 1 0 2 293

Total 11 519 2140 749 601 2051 1009 513 179 33 0 118 7923  
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Financial Position  - June (Q1) FY16-17 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
13 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Simon Lazarus, DoF  

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Andrew Foster, Deputy DoF  
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
To report the financial position for the period ended June 2016/17. 

Executive summary 
 
This report sets out the financial position of the Trust for the period ended 30th June (Q1). The overall 
I&E position is a deficit of £3.003m, £0. 043m favourable to the year to date plan.   

• This position is measured against the revised I&E control total agreed with NHSI for 
FY16-17 and includes STF funding of £2.4m at Q1 within the position. 
• Delivery of the revised control achieved at Q1 but subject to a limited range of non-
recurrent measures to offset increasing expenditure run rate. 
• Pay expenditure gives cause for concern at Q1 and is £2.496m (5%) adverse to plan for 
the year to date driven by high costs of agency medical staff and agency HCAs. 
• Income position continues to include provision for MRET and readmissions) penalties but 
excludes access fines as a condition of meeting the Q1 revised control total. 
• Host CCG raising significant contractual data challenges in Q1. Significant shortfall in 
CQUIN income expected (notably for antimicrobial resistance). 
• Agency expenditure is currently exceeding the authorised cap by £0.95m driven by a 
spike in Medical staffing costs in June. 
• Reduced CRL reflecting slippage in 60 Bedded Ward facility and further reduction to EFL 
reflecting revised loan profile pending receipt of £9.7m of STF funding noted above. 

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Financial Sustainability 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

The recurrent deficit and I&E plan position for FY16-17 signal 
another challenging financial year ahead and the requirement to 
develop a medium term financial strategy to deliver financial 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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balance in the medium term. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 3.1 (Sustainability); 5.1 (Financial Control); 5.2 (CIP delivery); 
5.3 (Capital Programme). 

Equality Impact Assessment 
 

N/A 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

NHS Statutory Financial Duties 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Board  is asked to: 
 
The Board is asked to note the financial position for the period ended June 2016/17 and to consider the 
actions required to ensure that the financial position can remain within planned levels at quarter 2 and 
beyond.  
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Janine Brennan, Director of Workforce & Transformation 

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Adam Cragg, Head of Resourcing & Employment Services 
Sam Wright, Workforce Systems Manager 
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
This report provides an overview of key workforce issues 

Executive summary 
 

 The key performance indicators show an increase in contracted workforce employed by the 
Trust, and an increase in sickness absence from May 2016. 

 Increase in compliance rate for Mandatory Training, Role Specific Essential Training and 
Appraisals. 
 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

 
Enable excellence through our people 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

Workforce risks are identified and placed on the Risk register 
as appropriate. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

 
BAF – 4.1, 4.2 and 4.3 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (Y/N) No 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
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against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (Y/N) No 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

No 
 

 
Actions required by the Board 
 
The Board is asked to Note the report. 
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Trust Board 

 
Thursday 28 July 2016 

 

Workforce Performance Report 
 

1. Introduction 
 

This report identifies the key themes emerging from June 2016 performance and identifies    
trends against Trust targets.  It also sets out current key workforce updates. 

 

2. Workforce Report 
 

2.1 Capacity 

Substantive Workforce Capacity increased slightly by 1.23 FTE in June 2016 to 4280.72 
FTE. The Trust's substantive workforce is at 90.16% of the Budgeted Workforce 
Establishment of 4747.72 FTE.  

Annual Trust turnover decreased by a further 0.17 to 9.97% in June which is above the 
Trust target of 8%.  Turnover within Nursing & Midwifery decreased by 0.12% to 9.80%;  
the Nursing & Midwifery figures are inclusive of all nursing and midwifery staff employed in 
various roles across the Trust.  Turnover also decreased in Additional Professional 
Scientific & Technical, Admin & Clerical, Allied Health Professionals and Healthcare 
Scientists. Additional Clinical Services, Estates and Ancillary and Medical & dental turnover 
increased. 

Medical Division: turnover decreased by just 0.09% to 10.51% 

Surgical Division: turnover decreased by 0.43% to 8.19% 

Women, Children & Oncology Division: turnover increased by 0.46% to 10.44% 

Clinical Support Services Division: turnover decreased by 0.59% to 8.51% 

Support Services: turnover decreased by 0.34% to 12.37% 

The vacancy rates for both Additional Clinical Services and Healthcare Scientists staff 
groups increased in June. All other staff groups had a decrease in vacancy rates with the 
biggest decrease coming in the Estates & Ancillary staff group which fell from 20.29% to 
18.58%. The Registered Nursing & Midwifery vacancy rate decreased slightly from 11.43% 
to 11.24%. 

In month sickness absence increased by 0.30% to 4.26% which is above the Trust target of 
3.8%. Only the W&C Division was below the trust target. In total 7 directorate level 
organisations were below the trust target rate. 
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2.2 Capability 

Appraisals, Mandatory Training and Role Specific Essential Training       

 

The current rate of Appraisals recorded for June 2016 is 83.57%; this is an increase of 0.56 
from last month’s figure of 83.01%. 
  
Mandatory Training compliance increased further in June from 85.91% to 86.25% which 
maintains the position above the Trust target of 85%. 
 
Role Specific Essential Training compliance increased in June to 76.14% from last month’s 
figure of 75.18%. 
  
The target compliance rates for Appraisals, Mandatory, and Role Specific Training have all 
been set at 85%, which should have been achieved by March 2015; this was not done but 
work continues to achieve this level of compliance. 

 

 

Policies 

During June 2016, minor amendments and additions were made to the following Trust 

Policies:  

 

 Maternity, Adoption, Paternity & Shared Parental Leave Procedure 

 Special Leave Policy 

 Flexible Working Policy 

 Internal Secondment Policy 

 

 

Assessment of Risk 

Managing workforce risk is a key part of the Trust’s governance arrangements. 

 

Recommendations/Resolutions Required 

The Board is asked to note the report. 

 

Next Steps 

Key workforce performance indicators are subject to regular monitoring and appropriate 

action is taken as required. 
 

Page 170 of 235



Trust Board: Capacity and Capability Report - June 2016

CAPACITY < 88% 88-93% > 93%

Staff in Post

Staff in Post (FTE) Apr-16 May-16 Jun-16 Establishment

Medicine & Urgent Care Division Medical Division Total 1011.88 1022.88 1019.07 1154.81 88.25%

Urgent Care 250.81 252.64 249.56 320.67 77.82%

Inpatient Specialties 452.84 457.86 456.66 463.19 98.59%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 307.23 311.88 311.85 367.95 84.75%

Surgical Division Surgical Division Total 1037.82 1038.82 1031.27 1142.21 90.29%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 391.83 391.03 390.28 444.61 87.78%

ENT & Maxillofacial 94.72 93.24 91.25 101.28 90.10%

Ophthalmology 83.17 81.17 82.45 85.78 96.12%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 185.35 186.32 180.43 209.01 86.33%

General & Specialist Surgery 277.95 282.27 282.05 295.73 95.37%

Women, Children & Oncology Division W, C & O Division Total 866.35 863.34 866.64 907.76 95.47%

Women 357.52 357.03 357.92 361.03 99.14%

Children 273.04 271.89 270.89 289.97 93.42%

Oncology & Haematology 233.93 232.57 236.97 253.91 93.33%

Clinical Support Services Division Clinical Support Division Total 599.36 600.95 604.03 674.82 89.51%

Imaging 165.18 167.67 167.75 195.77 85.69%

Pathology 153.25 156.25 156.25 182.64 85.55%

Other Clinical Support 33.05 33.20 33.20 37.93 87.53%

Medical Records 61.84 60.37 59.37 58.33 101.78%

Pharmacy 101.40 101.73 102.73 108.81 94.41%

Therapy Services 84.65 81.73 84.73 91.34 92.76%

Support Services Support Services Total 755.39 753.50 759.72 868.12 87.51%

Hospital Support 350.14 348.99 353.94 374.41 94.53%

Facilities 405.26 404.51 405.78 493.71 82.19%

Trust Total 4270.80 4279.49 4280.72 4747.72 90.16%

Establishment RAG Rates:

0

200

400

600

800

1000

1200

1400

M
ed

ic
al

 D
iv

is
io

n
 T

o
ta

l

U
rg

en
t 

C
ar

e

In
p

at
ie

n
t 

Sp
ec

ia
lt

ie
s

O
u

tp
at

ie
n

ts
 &

 E
ld

er
ly

 M
e

d
ic

in
e

Su
rg

ic
al

 D
iv

is
io

n
 T

o
ta

l

A
n

ae
st

h
e

ti
cs

, C
C

 &
 T

h
ea

tr
es

EN
T 

&
 M

ax
ill

o
fa

ci
al

O
p

h
th

al
m

o
lo

gy

Tr
au

m
a 

&
 O

rt
h

o
p

ae
d

ic
s

G
en

er
al

 &
 S

p
ec

ia
lis

t 
Su

rg
er

y

W
, C

 &
 O

 D
iv

is
io

n
 T

o
ta

l

W
o

m
en

C
h

ild
re

n

O
n

co
lo

gy
 &

 H
ae

m
at

o
lo

gy

C
lin

ic
al

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 D
iv

is
io

n
 T

o
ta

l

Im
ag

in
g

P
at

h
o

lo
gy

O
th

er
 C

lin
ic

al
 S

u
p

p
o

rt

M
ed

ic
al

 R
ec

o
rd

s

P
h

ar
m

ac
y

Th
er

ap
y 

Se
rv

ic
es

Su
p

p
o

rt
 S

er
vi

ce
s 

To
ta

l

H
o

sp
it

al
 S

u
p

p
o

rt

Fa
ci

lit
ie

s

Medicine & Urgent Care
Division

Surgical Division Women, Children &
Oncology Division

Clinical Support Services Division Support Services

Staff in Post (FTE) v Establishment 
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Trust Board: Capacity and Capability Report - June 2016

CAPACITY > 12% 7 - 12% < 7%

Staff Group (FTE v Est)

Staff Group Apr-16 May-16 Jun-16

Add Prof Sci & Tech 10.09% 13.05% 12.51%

Additional Clinical Services 7.27% 6.48% 8.72%

Admin & Clerical 8.62% 8.29% 8.12%

Allied Health Professionals 11.13% 11.46% 11.17%

Estates & Ancillary 19.63% 20.29% 18.58%

Healthcare Scientists 16.61% 13.31% 13.38%

Medical & Dental 13.29% 11.82% 11.68%

Nursing & Midwifery 11.60% 11.43% 11.24%

Staff Group Vacancy Rate (Contracted FTE v Establishment)

Vacancy RAG Rates:
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Trust Board: Capacity and Capability Report - June 2016

CAPACITY

Annual Turnover > 10% 8 - 10% < 8%

Annual Turnover (Permanent Staff) Apr-16 May-16 Jun-16

Medicine & Urgent Care Division Medical Division Total 11.26% 10.60% 10.51%

Urgent Care 13.06% 10.93% 11.09%

Inpatient Specialties 10.27% 9.79% 9.71%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 11.30% 11.46% 11.16%

Surgical Division Surgical Division Total 9.06% 8.62% 8.19%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 7.54% 7.82% 8.01%

ENT & Maxillofacial 5.08% 4.24% 4.22%

Ophthalmology 16.07% 14.53% 13.25%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 6.16% 6.33% 7.57%

General & Specialist Surgery 12.87% 11.34% 8.88%

Women, Children & Oncology Division W, C & O Division Total 10.08% 9.98% 10.44%

Women 9.07% 9.28% 10.61%

Children 8.24% 7.42% 7.30%

Oncology & Haematology 13.47% 13.72% 13.38%

Clinical Support Services Division Clinical Support Division Total 9.18% 9.10% 8.51%

Imaging 8.72% 8.25% 7.82%

Pathology 10.52% 9.30% 7.93%

Other Clinical Support 18.07% 16.68% 18.64%

Medical Records 6.23% 6.12% 4.51%

Pharmacy 8.05% 9.79% 9.84%

Therapy Services 7.55% 8.86% 8.35%

Support Services Support Services Total 13.56% 12.71% 12.37%

Hospital Support 14.82% 14.18% 13.47%

Facilities 12.46% 11.39% 11.34%

Trust Total 10.58% 10.14% 9.97%

Turnover RAG Rates:

Figures refer to the year ending in the month stated
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Trust Board: Capacity and Capability Report - June 2016

CAPACITY

Turnover by Staff Group > 10% 8 - 10% < 8%

Figures refer to the year ending in the month stated

Staff Group Apr-16 May-16 Jun-16

Add Prof Sci & Tech 10.10% 12.86% 11.47%

Additional Clinical Services 8.99% 9.13% 9.73%

Admin & Clerical 11.58% 11.45% 10.63%

Allied Health Professionals 12.66% 12.09% 11.67%

Estates & Ancillary 10.93% 9.70% 10.13%

Healthcare Scientists 13.82% 12.59% 9.03%

Medical & Dental 6.02% 5.57% 6.55%

Nursing & Midwifery 10.87% 9.92% 9.80%

Annual Turnover Rate for Permanent Staff

Turnover RAG Rates:
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Capacity: Substantive Workforce Capacity increased slightly by 1.23 FTE in June 2016 to 4280.72 FTE. The Trust's substantive 
workforce is at 90.16% of the Budgeted Workforce Establishment of 4747.72 FTE.  
  
Staff Turnover: Annual Trust turnover decreased by a further 0.17 to 9.97% in June which is above the Trust target of 8%.  
Turnover within Nursing & Midwifery decreased by 0.12% to 9.80%;  the Nursing & Midwifery figures are inclusive of all nursing 
and midwifery staff employed in various roles across the Trust.  Turnover also decreased in Additional Professional Scientific & 
Technical, Admin & Clerical, Allied Health Professionals and Healthcare Scientists. Additional Clinical Services, Estates and 
Ancillary and Medical & dental turnover increased. 
 
Medical Division: turnover decreased by just 0.09% to 10.51% 
Surgical Division: turnover decreased by 0.43% to 8.19% 
Women, Children & Oncology Division: turnover increased by 0.46% to 10.44% 
Clinical Support Services Division: turnover decreased by 0.59% to 8.51% 
Support Services: turnover decreased by 0.34% to 12.37%  
 
Staff Vacancies: The vacancy rates for both Additional Clinical Services and Healthcare Scientists staff group increased in June. 
All other staff groups had a decrease in vacancy rates with the biggest decrease coming in the Estates & Ancillary staff group 
which fell from 20.29% to 18.58%. The Registered Nursing & Midwifery vacancy rate decreased slightly from 11.43% to 11.24%.   
 
Sickness Absence: In month sickness absence increased by 0.30% to 4.26% which is above the Trust target of 3.8%. Only the 
W&C Division was below the trust target. In total 7 directorate level organisations were below the trust target rate. 
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Trust Board: Capacity and Capability Report - June 2016

CAPACITY

In-Month Sickness > 4.2% 3.8-4.2% < 3.8%

Monthly Sickness (as FTE) Apr-16 May-16 Jun-16 Jun-16 Short Term Long Term

Medicine & Urgent Care Medical Division Total 51.40 57.18 53.60 5.26% 2.90% 2.35%

Urgent Care 9.81 11.75 11.26 4.51% 2.19% 2.32%

Inpatient Specialties 20.88 23.49 23.11 5.06% 3.36% 1.70%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 20.77 21.93 19.24 6.17% 2.83% 3.35%

Surgery Surgical Division Total 40.99 38.54 40.84 3.96% 1.99% 1.97%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 18.02 15.25 15.77 4.04% 2.19% 1.85%

ENT & Maxillofacial 2.98 5.35 5.09 5.58% 2.69% 2.89%

Ophthalmology 0.88 1.69 2.26 2.74% 1.35% 1.40%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 8.01 8.85 6.86 3.80% 1.35% 2.45%

General & Specialist Surgery 11.06 7.37 10.89 3.86% 2.14% 1.72%

Women, Children & Oncology W, C & O Division Total 32.92 28.75 30.25 3.49% 2.10% 1.39%

Women 14.44 12.03 9.56 2.67% 2.28% 0.39%

Children 8.44 9.27 10.78 3.98% 1.96% 2.02%

Oncology & Haematology 10.04 7.44 9.91 4.18% 2.01% 2.18%

Clinical Support Services Clinical Support Division Total 16.54 21.93 24.52 4.06% 1.92% 2.14%

Imaging 9.56 7.23 8.82 5.26% 2.47% 2.79%

Pathology 6.41 7.05 5.42 3.47% 1.61% 1.86%

Other Clinical Support 0.00 0.00 1.00 3.01% 0.00% 3.01%

Medical Records 3.30 2.24 3.40 5.73% 2.71% 3.02%

Pharmacy 2.25 3.34 4.65 4.53% 2.58% 1.95%

Therapy Services 3.18 1.32 1.22 1.44% 0.80% 0.64%

Support Services Support Services Total 24.55 22.91 33.12 4.36% 2.85% 1.51%

Hospital Support 8.33 8.20 12.42 3.51% 1.91% 1.61%

Facilities 16.21 14.68 20.65 5.09% 3.67% 1.42%

Trust Total As FTE 175.53 169.47 182.36

As percentage 4.11% 3.96% 4.26% 2.37% 1.89%

Sickness % RAG Rates:
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CAPABILITY

Training & Appraisal Rates > 85%

Mandatory Training Compliance Rate Directorate Apr-16

Medicine & Urgent Care Division Medical Division Total 81.30% 82.35% 82.04%

Urgent Care 82.52% 83.87% 83.81%

Inpatient Specialties 78.55% 79.78% 78.75%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 84.27% 84.82% 85.28%

Surgical Division Surgical Division Total 85.78% 86.23% 86.93%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 85.59% 85.34% 85.33%

ENT & Maxillofacial 79.00% 81.28% 84.80%

Ophthalmology 90.59% 92.59% 91.09%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 85.02% 86.69% 86.63%

General & Specialist Surgery 87.23% 86.88% 88.79%

Women, Children & Oncology Division W, C & O Division Total 86.11% 87.49% 87.74%

Women 84.49% 85.90% 85.41%

Children 88.92% 89.74% 90.44%

Oncology & Haematology 84.57% 87.25% 88.18%

Clinical Support Services Division Clinical Support Division Total 88.91% 89.78% 89.34%

Imaging 89.13% 88.83% 88.17%

Pathology 84.12% 86.38% 87.27%

Other Clinical Support 92.06% 92.06% 88.36%

Medical Records 89.47% 82.84% 92.59%

Pharmacy 94.11% 93.10% 93.35%

Therapy Services 88.77% 90.32% 88.31%

Support Services Support Services Total 85.04% 85.23% 86.57%

Hospital Support 83.68% 84.29% 85.89%

Facilities 86.07% 85.95% 87.10%

Trust Total 85.13% 85.91% 86.25%

May-16 Jun-16

Training & Appraisal RAG Rates:

< 80% 80 - 84.9%
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CAPABILITY

Training & Appraisal Rates > 85%

Role Specific Training Compliance Rate Directorate Apr-16

Medicine & Urgent Care Division Medical Division Total 70.42% 72.31% 73.27%

Urgent Care 73.38% 75.99% 77.16%

Inpatient Specialties 66.18% 67.83% 68.71%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 73.70% 75.32% 76.22%

Surgical Division Surgical Division Total 71.80% 73.64% 75.40%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 73.82% 74.62% 74.36%

ENT & Maxillofacial 61.50% 65.06% 66.40%

Ophthalmology 69.28% 70.92% 76.95%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 71.55% 77.52% 79.51%

General & Specialist Surgery 72.51% 72.39% 76.16%

Women, Children & Oncology Division W, C & O Division Total 76.83% 78.00% 78.69%

Women 73.26% 73.59% 73.58%

Children 81.87% 84.39% 85.61%

Oncology & Haematology 77.83% 79.31% 80.97%

Clinical Support Services Division Clinical Support Division Total 84.60% 84.34% 83.54%

Imaging 82.74% 81.20% 81.31%

Pathology 77.89% 77.41% 77.88%

Other Clinical Support 79.27% 83.57% 81.43%

Medical Records 92.21% 93.42% 93.33%

Pharmacy 89.83% 87.54% 87.71%

Therapy Services 87.93% 89.08% 86.45%

Support Services Support Services Total 69.40% 69.86% 70.49%

Hospital Support 69.09% 69.99% 70.67%

Facilities 69.82% 69.72% 70.27%

Trust Total 73.70% 75.18% 76.14%

Training & Appraisal RAG Rates:

< 80% 80 - 84.9%

May-16 Jun-16

Capability 
 

Appraisals 
The current rate of Appraisals recorded for June 2016 is 83.57%; this is an increase of 0.56 from 
last months figure of 83.01%. 
 
Mandatory Training and Role Specific Essential Training       
Mandatory Training compliance increased further in June from 85.91% to 86.25% which maintains 
the position above the Trust target of 85%. 
 
Role Specific Essential Training compliance increased in June to 76.14% from last months figure of 
75.18%. 
  
The target compliance rates for Appraisals, Mandatory, and Role Specific Training have all been 
set at 85%, which should have been achieved by March 2015; this was not done but work 
continues to achieve this level of compliance. 
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CAPABILITY

Training & Appraisal Rates > 85%

Appraisal Compliance Rate Directorate Apr-16

Medicine & Urgent Care Division Medical Division Total 76.65% 74.36% 76.16%

Urgent Care 82.87% 80.31% 80.08%

Inpatient Specialties 71.93% 71.07% 73.23%

Outpatients & Elderly Medicine 77.92% 73.99% 76.92%

Surgical Division Surgical Division Total 91.16% 91.23% 90.84%

Anaesthetics, CC & Theatres 89.89% 89.32% 90.41%

ENT & Maxillofacial 85.90% 89.61% 89.47%

Ophthalmology 96.00% 93.15% 89.19%

Trauma & Orthopaedics 93.22% 93.75% 90.06%

General & Specialist Surgery 91.92% 92.37% 93.44%

Women, Children & Oncology Division W, C & O Division Total 84.81% 87.51% 89.28%

Women 82.59% 85.54% 88.00%

Children 89.74% 90.07% 91.48%

Oncology & Haematology 83.19% 88.24% 89.26%

Clinical Support Services Division Clinical Support Division Total 84.96% 84.29% 82.83%

Imaging 78.74% 76.88% 78.03%

Pathology 88.82% 87.20% 85.89%

Other Clinical Support 82.50% 85.00% 77.50%

Medical Records 87.01% 85.53% 90.67%

Pharmacy 93.16% 92.24% 88.03%

Therapy Services 79.17% 81.72% 76.04%

Support Services Support Services Total 76.28% 78.04% 78.52%

Hospital Support 66.05% 68.62% 68.52%

Facilities 83.93% 85.09% 86.06%

Trust Total 82.71% 83.01% 83.57%

May-16 Jun-16

Training & Appraisal RAG Rates:

< 80% 80 - 84.9%
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Clinical Collaboration Update 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
15 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Chris Pallot, Director of Strategy & Partnerships 
 

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Chris Pallot, Director of Strategy & Partnerships 
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
To provide and update on the clinical collaboration programme with 
Kettering General Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 

Executive summary 
 
The purpose of this paper is to brief the Board on the current position of the Clinical Collaboration 
Programme  
Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

No 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

2.2 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (N) 
 

Equality Impact Assessment 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed decision/ 
policy will not promote equality of opportunity for all or promote 
good relations between different groups? (N) 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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Is there potential for or evidence that the proposed decision/policy 
will affect different population groups differently (including possibly 
discriminating against certain groups)?(N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Are there any legal/regulatory implications of the paper: Yes – the 
development of the Federation with KGH 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Board is asked to note the update. 
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Public Trust Board 

28 July 2016 
 

Clinical Collaboration with Kettering General Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
 

Progress Update 
 

1. Introduction 
 
This paper provides a summary of progress to date with the delivery of the Clinical Collaboration 
Programme. 
 
This paper is the same as will be presented to the Clinical Collaboration Board (CSB).  
 

2. Sustainability and Transformation Plan 
 
The countywide STP was submitted to NHS England on-time with a confirm and challenge 

meeting taking place with Simon Stevens and Jim Mackay on Monday 18th July. Formal feedback 

will follow but the overarching message appears to be the need to rapidly work-up an 

implementation plan for every aspect of the plan to ensure delivery. 

A key consideration for the acute trusts (and indeed all partners) will be the level of resource 

available to deliver against the plan both in terms of finance and personnel. NGH has outlined the 

managerial resource that it already has deployed from the Strategy and Partnerships Directorate 

which is sufficient to support three of the ten specialities under review.  

Also to be considered will be whether or not there is resource to support some of the clinical 

change from a capital perspective. It has been made clear that there is little or no additional 

finance available in 2016/17 but nevertheless some changes will require support. An example 

would be the potential to transform pathology that is predicated on procuring identical reporting 

systems to enable cross-site working and consolidation. Discussions will be ongoing in this regard. 

The programme management structure will also need to change with the proposed structure for 

delivering the STP illustrated below. This will require a programme management approach to 

system-wide delivery as opposed to focussing on organisational level projects. 

This means that the bulk of the current clinical collaboration programme will fall under the 

scheduled care workstream as this is predominantly addressing elective and diagnostic care. 

Also falling under this work-stream will be “integrated outpatients” which is concerned with moving 

a large proportion of appointments into community setting, supported by GPs, nurses and other 

healthcare professionals.  

This will inevitably mean that the function of the CSB will change. There will still be a requirement 

for a group that oversees the work with KGH but a system-wide forum will be needed to deliver the 

overarching programme of work. A CSB will take place on Thursday 21 July (after this paper is 

submitted) to propose how this develops in-line with the overall programme. 
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Proposed Structure for Delivering the STP 
 

 
 
 

3. Clinical Collaboration Update 
 

3.1 Summary of Progress 

 

Progress is ongoing with the three key specialties; Dermatology, Rheumatology and Orthopaedics.  
Other specialities are progressing at a different pace pending additional dedicated project 
management resource to support these.   
 
The clinical collaboration working groups have included representatives from Northamptonshire 
Healthcare Foundation Trust (NHFT) and GP providers to ensure pathways are integrated across 
both acute and community providers. 
 
The McKinsey packs are being reviewed and finalised with each speciality to agree the next steps 
for development and implementation. 
 
The Clinical Collaboration Operational Delivery group continues to meet monthly and membership 
has been extended to include representatives from Finance, IT, Communications and Human 
Resources. 
 
Sub groups have been set up across specialities for IT and the triage referral process to develop 
common pathways for the referral triage hubs and identify any potential back office collaboration.   
 
 

Partner Board 

▪ Independent Chair  

▪ CEO’s from each NHS body

▪ Public Health

▪ NCC Rep

▪ VIN?

STP Lay Assurance  Group

▪ Chair

▪ NED from each NHS body

▪ NCC Rep.

Clinical Oversight Group

• Chair

• Medical Directors 

• Nursing Directors

• Public Health

SRO Group 

• STP Lead Chair  

• SRO leads 

PMO including Programme Director, System 

Finance Lead, Estates Lead and 

Communications Lead

Complex Care 

Programme

Prevention & Community 

Engagement  Programme
Scheduled Care 

Programme

Urgent Care 

Programme

Accountable bodies will retain responsibility for their performance and report on progress through the PMO.

In addition accountable bodies which being running programmes on key enablers and parts STP which will need 

to link in with the key workstreams and the PMO.

This would include;

• Acute service integration;

• Primary care sustainability;

• Development of GP Federations;

• Development of MCP;

• Other system workstreams, eg BCF, SRG etc will also report through this mechanism

IM&T ProgrammeWorkforce Programme
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3.2 Headlines for Rheumatology, Dermatology and Orthopaedic workgroups 
 

3.2.1 Rheumatology 

 Clinical workshop including KGH, NGH and NHFT carried out at which each of the 5 
consultants led a discussion to confirm each of the clinical pathways across the new service 

 Next steps following the workshop confirmed with the teams and an implementation plan 
finalised.  The aim is to start the Northamptonshire Rheumatology triage service from the 3rd 
October 2016 

 Business proposal to be reviewed and updated by mid-September 2016 to support 17/18 
commissioning plans 

 Workforce development; recruitment of 2 Rheumatology consultants confirmed and 
proceeding with joint job adverts.  Next steps to complete workforce modelling for specialist 
nurses and extended scope practitioners 

 
3.2.2 Dermatology 

 Business proposal being progressed and to be finalised to include completed activity, 
finance and workforce modelling by the end of July 16  

 Activity and finance modelling set to test the STP outpatient assumptions for reduced tariffs 
for GP and nurse led community clinics 

 Collaboration meeting confirmed revised model which does not include a central referral 
triage.  Community GP referrals will go directly to the newly established community GP 
clinics 

 Clinical governance programme for developing and supporting GPs being progressed 

 Referral and IT pathways being agreed 

 Progress being made to standardise current practice and pathways across the two trusts 

 Ongoing continued engagement by GPs with a special interest in Dermatology and those 
providing existing community Dermatology services  

 

3.2.3 Elective Orthopaedics 

 Workshop took place with KGH, NGH, NHFT and commissioners. Agreement was reached 
to update the business proposal by mid-September 2016 to include all community MSK 
activity 

 It was agreed to explore options to develop the existing NHFT MSK hubs into integrated 
MSK hubs to include elective orthopaedic referrals as well as community physiotherapy 
MSK referrals  

 Pathway groups established to standardise pathways across sub-specialties to incorporate 
M&M and MDT meetings.  These are to be completed by the next workshop to be held at 
the end of September 

 Standardised admin pathways to be agreed and completed by the next workshop at the 
end of September 

 
4. Risks, Issues and Mitigations 

 
The high level risks and mitigations for each of these three specialities are broadly similar.  A 
detailed risk log is being developed for each specialty.  In summary the risks include; 
 

 Risk to implementation due to unavailability of specialist workforce e.g. GPwSI and 
specialist nurses.  Training programmes to be developed as part of the implementation 
plans  
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 Risk to delivery due to different contractual mechanism for existing or newly formed 
community and acute services.  Single contracts for the integrated services to be 
negotiated 

 Consistent countywide reporting and appointment management will be mitigated by the 
MIG in the long term. However there is a risk to implementation dates if an interim solution 
cannot be identified.  IT teams are working with the collaboration projects to agree interim 
solutions to ensure referral hubs can be established and activity and finance data shared 

 
5. Progress against other specialties 

   
5.1 Cardiology 

 

 County wide meeting between KGH and NGH Cardiology teams set up for the 5th August.  
External facilitator to facilitate the session 

 
5.2 Pathology 

 

 In order to achieve the requirement set out in the NHSI letter dated 28th June 2016 for back 
office and Pathology reconfiguration, a joint meeting has been set up for the 19th July 
between the two Pathology teams.  The aim of the session  is to agree and develop an 
implementation plan for an integrated Pathology service across the county 

 
5.3 Ophthalmology, Radiology, ENT, Gynae, Urology 

 

 The clinical teams are currently reviewing the McKinsey packs to agree final assumptions 
and next steps 

 
6. Development of the Federation 

 
On 6 July 2016 the two Directors of Strategy from KGH and NGH met with our legal advisors to 
develop the formal arrangements for the federation between the two hospitals.  
 
This legally binding agreement will enable the organisations formalise a structure whereby 
services that are developed on the single service principle will be managed jointly. It will be 
underpinned by a single governance and financial framework. The important point is that this 
agreement is seen as over-arching document that facilities development of the services within 
collaboration. 
 
Each service could have a different model, and different partners working to deliver it. The 
important point being that the agreement is flexible to ensure that as services are redesigned, 
delivery of the new model is not constrained by ongoing discussions about the relationship 
between the partners because this is covered in the over-arching Memorandum of Understanding. 
 

7. Conclusion 
 
Some important foundations have been established as part of this programme, which provides 
both organisations with the opportunity to progress implementation with pace. 
 
Next steps: 
 

 Finalise the resource requirement for the programme to enable the remaining specialities 
to commence work 

 

 Finalise the Federation document for approval by both Boards 
 

 Review the governance arrangement for the programme taking into account its alignment 
with the STP. 
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8. Recommendation 
 

The Board is asked to note this update. 
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Title of the Report 
 

 
Annual Fire Safety Report 2015/16 including the 
Annual Statement of Fire Safety Compliance 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
16 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Charles Abolins, Director of Facilities and Capital Development 

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Stuart Finn, Head of Estates and Deputy Director of Facilities 
David Waddoups, Fire Safety Advisor 

 
Purpose 
 

 
For assurance  

Executive summary 
 
The report highlights Fire Safety statistics during the past 12 months and provides assurance regarding 
progress, investment and measures taken during the year to improve Fire Safety resilience within the 
Trust 

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

 To be a provider of quality care for all patients  

 Provide appropriate care for our patients in the most 
effective way 

 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

The report highlights areas of risk and proposes measures to 
mitigate those risks 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 5 Failure of the Estate infrastructure 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups?  No 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)?  No 
 

Equality Impact Assessment Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed decision/ 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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 policy will not promote equality of opportunity for all or promote 
good relations between different groups?  No 
 
Is there potential for or evidence that the proposed decision/policy 
will affect different population groups differently (including possibly 
discriminating against certain groups)? No 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Compliance with the Regulatory Reform (Fire Safety) Order 2005 
and compliance with the Department of Health Fire Safety Policy 
contained within HTM 05-01 

 
Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Board is asked to note the actions taken to improve Fire Safety within the Trust during the past 12 
months, the Annual Statement of Fire Safety Compliance and to support the ongoing investment and 
actions to mitigate risks related to Fire Safety on Trust premises. 

 

Page 187 of 235



 

 

 

E
nc

lo
su

re
 L

Page 188 of 235



 



 

1 of 9 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

ANNUAL FIRE SAFETY REPORT 
 
 

APRIL 2015 to MARCH 2016 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
David A Waddoups 
Fire Safety Adviser 
Northampton General Hospital 
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1.0 Introduction 
This report has been produced to provide the Trust Board with an overview of the current 
position of fire safety and to provide assurance that the Trust is meeting its statutory 
responsibilities. 
 

2.0 Governance and Assurance  
All fire safety arrangements within the Trust are modelled on the recommendations made 
by the Department of Health’s Firecode fire safety guidance documents. These are 
referenced and supported within the Trust’s Fire Safety Policy. 
 
The Department of Health announced in 2013, that they no longer require an Annual 
Certificate of Fire Safety Compliance but Trusts should implement a similar local 
certificate – see appendix 1 for the Trust’s local annual certificate of compliance.  
 
To provide assurance to enforcing bodies that the Trust is complying with its statutory 
obligations and has a plan of action for dealing with gaps in compliance an independent 
review of fire safety compliance was completed in 2014. The resulting action plan is 
being monitored through Fire Committee. 
 
Northamptonshire Fire and Rescue Service completed an audit during 2014 which 
resulted in a letter to the Trust confirming that all previous actions had been addressed 
and the Trust’s fire management arrangements were satisfactory. There have been no 
further inspections since. 

   
  Following a Fire Committee recommendation and discussions with Governance all fire  
  risk assessments were put on Datix by the Fire Safety Adviser. Since this was completed 
  it has become apparent that this was not the correct way forward and they are now to be 
  removed. 
 
  Generic site wide fire related risks have been entered separately onto Datix, these  
  include fire resisting doors, fire dampers, emergency lighting, compartmentation and  
  cavity barriers in Oxford construction. 

 
3.0 Fire Risk Assessments 

During 2015/16 new fire risk assessments continued to be completed for all areas owned 
or occupied by the Trust, in addition to reviewing the existing assessments. There are 
four main areas identified in these risk assessments that impact on the ability of the Trust 
to provide a safe environment for patients, visitors and staff.  
These are; Buildings/structural, Fire alarm, Vertical evacuation and Staff training. 
 
Findings from these assessments have been used to prioritise fire safety works within the 
rolling annual capital programme. These works, once completed, will reduce or eliminate 
the risk but ongoing investment is required to maintain risks at an acceptable level which 
in turn also demonstrates to the enforcing body that the Trust is satisfactorily managing 
its fire risk. 
 
3.1 Buildings/Structural 
Hospitals are designed and constructed to allow patients to remain inside, within fire 
safety compartments, should a fire occur in another part of the building. This requires 
them to be constructed using high levels of fire resistance to divide the building into 
designated compartments.  
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The Trust occupies many buildings dating from 1793, some of which have been built 
using construction methods that no longer satisfy current standards, for example the 
“Oxford Method”.  The affected buildings using “Oxford” were built in the late 1970s and 
currently house: Pharmacy, Main Theatres, A&E, Radiology, ITU/HDU, Benham Ward, 
Eleanor Ward and surrounding corridors, Talbot Butler Ward and Sturtridge Ward. This 
construction method relied on the fire integrity of a suspended asbestos ceiling to provide 
fire resistance to the floor above and the steel frame of the building. The void created by 
the suspended ceiling was not provided with cavity barriers, allowing a very large 
uncompartmented area through which fire, smoke and heat could spread unchecked.  
 
The Trust has carried out remedial work, on a phased basis, by installing cavity barriers 
in the voids during capital upgrading works. Asbestos ceiling tiles require specialist 
removal that would require lengthy closure of areas during the work, it is therefore 
operationally impractical to check the extent to which further fire compartmentation is 
required however it is considered that the areas still requiring work include: Benham 
Ward, Eleanor Ward, parts of ITU/HDU, parts of Radiology and part of Main Theatres. 
 
The risk has been mitigated by the installation of an automatic fire suppression system 
throughout the basement and other high-risk areas such as kitchens, stores and medical 
records, an automatic fire detection system, staff training, emergency plans and an on-
site Fire Response Team.  
 
When the opportunity arises through capital refurbishment or emergency repair works fire 
safety improvements are always included wherever practicable. Over the past number of 
years there have been substantial works to upgrade the fire alarm system by the 
installation of additional automatic fire detection and the upgrade of the systems control 
panels. 
 
Building works incorporating Fire Safety completed during 2015/16 include: 

 Completion of alterations to form new Ambulatory Care Centre, including 
improved fire barriers, fire alarm and automatic fire detection system, emergency 
lighting system and extension of the automatic fire suppression system; 

 Completion of alterations and extension to form new Clinical Observation Area  
including new fire barriers, new fire alarm and automatic fire detection system, 
new emergency lighting system  and extension of the automatic fire suppression 
system; 

 Completion of works to Gosset Ward including new fire alarm and automatic fire 
detection system and new emergency lighting system;  

 Completion of alterations to form a new Blood Taking Unit including extension to 
the existing fire alarm and automatic fire detection system and new emergency 
lighting system; 

 Completion of works to form new Fracture and Orthopaedic clinic including cavity 
barriers and fire dampers. 

 
Consultation has taken place with architects regarding fire safety recommendations for  
 A and E Fit Stop, the relocation of Orthopaedic Outpatients and third party pharmacy on 
Hospital Street for 15/16 capital works. 
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3.2 Fire alarm system 
The Trust’s fire alarm and automatic fire detection system continues to function correctly 
and has been extended and improved as building works and alterations take place to 
ensure that it complies with the relevant British Standards, HTM’s and codes of practice.  

 
A verification survey of the systems sounder circuits has been completed which will 
assist in the ‘cause and effect’ of detector circuits to be set and refined. 
Investment to improve and upgrade the system will need to extend into future years as 
part of a continued phased improvement and as components become unavailable/ no 
longer supported. These risks are being monitored and plans are in place to maintain 
them at an acceptable level which in turn also demonstrates to the enforcing body that 
the Trust is satisfactorily managing its fire risks.  
 
A series of false alarms in the Cripps PGMC building caused by unknown faults created 
much disturbance to residential staff. As the fault could not be confirmed a decision was 
made to initially replace the offending loop and then replace all of the loops in the 
building. During this upgrade the opportunity will be taken to extend the coverage of 
automatic fire detection throughout the Cripps building to bring it up to current standards. 

  
3.3 Staff Training 
It is a statutory requirement of the Regulatory Reform (Fire Safety) Order and a 
mandatory requirement of Firecode that all members of staff undertake fire training when 
they commence work, it is refreshed annually and that they take part in a fire drill. Annual 
fire training forms part of the Trust’s core mandatory training requirements. Where 
patients are dependent on the staff for their safe evacuation this training is vital.  
 
3.3.1 Training Sessions  
Training is delivered by the Trust Fire Safety Adviser but is organised by the Learning 
and Development department through Cluster and the Review of Knowledge sessions. In 
addition, training within a number of departments across the Trust has also been 
provided by the Trust Fire Safety Adviser as requested by those areas.  
 
E learning through the NHS Core-learning unit is approved as a means of providing fire 
training without attending a formal session. However it is only appropriate for staff not 
expected to evacuate patients and only when used every other year between face to face 
fire training.  
 
A fire safety work book and assessment sheet have recently been introduced for all staff, 
these are accessed via the Intranet. The completed assessments are sent to the Fire 
Safety Adviser for marking and staff are expected to achieve 80% in order to pass.  
There continues to be sufficient training capacity available to staff to enable the Trust’s 
target to be met. 

 
 3.3.2 Attendance 

From the records of attendance during 2015/16, 4686 members of staff received training 
an increase of 299 over the previous year’s attendance. This figure is calculated from all 
Fire training attendees and includes volunteers, Bank staff and students.At the end of 
April 2016 the Trust fire training figures were 78.3% compliant. 
Training at Danetre has been undertaken to ensure that NGH staff working there are up 
to date with their training. 
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The Trust Fire Safety Adviser reports attendance compliance to the Trust Fire Committee 
and 6 monthly reports to the Trusts Health and Safety Committee. 

  
    

         Total staff fire training attendance by year      Actual staff fire training attendance Vs target 
 

3.3.3 Fire drills 
Fire drills have continued during 2015/16 with 64 areas completing one. This is being 
monitored by the Trust Fire Committee and reported through the Trust Health & Safety 
Committee. 
The current methods of conducting drills have been reviewed by the Trust’s Fire 
Manager and Fire Safety Adviser and a training session has been delivered to remind 
managers of their responsibilities under the Fire policy and make them aware of the 
support available.  

 
4.0      Fire Alarms Activations 

There were a total of 157 actuations of the fire alarm during the reporting period, an 
increase of 1 from the last report.  
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Fires  
Six fire incidents occurred on site (5 - 2014/15), 5 resulted in the activation of the fire 
alarm system which were - 1 occurred in HDU caused by cleaner, 1 occurred in Abington 
Ward where a patient set fire to bed clothes, 1 occurred in Child Health due to an 
overheated e-cigarette battery, 1 occurred in Cripps Recreation (Trilogy) and lastly 
Allebone ward due to an overheated choke in a fluorescent lamp.  The fire that did not 
activate the fire alarm system was a bin fire outside Outpatients caused by discarded 
smoking materials. 

  
Good Intents  
There was a decrease of 60% of this type of call down to 8 from the 20 recorded for 
2014/15; good intents are caused by members of staff operating a call point suspecting a 
fire after smelling smoke/burning. 
 

 Pre Warnings  
There were 84 pre-warnings (78 for 2014/15) recorded of which 40 (37 – 14/15) were 
unknown causes, 18 (9 - 14/15) were caused by high temperature, 11 by contractors 
creating dust, 4 by cooking, 2 by a heater, 2 by steam from a nebuliser and the 
remainder were water leak, faulty food heater, cleaner dusting head, oil mist, 
contaminated head, steam leak and lastly toast. 

  
Detector Actuations  
55 actuations (50 for 2014/15) of detectors can be summarised as follows –  
24 faults, 8 contractors causing dust, 7 unknown,3 contractor testing, 2 contaminated 
heads, 2 cooking, 2 toast, 2 steam leak and then contractor working without an isolation, 
faulty food heater, hair straighteners, electric convector heater and aerosol spray.  
 
Water Misting System  
The water misting system activated twice during this reporting period, both caused by 
accidental operation. 
 
Five Year Overview 2011 to 2016 
Since 2011 the number of activations of the fire alarm has increased from 80 to 158 per 
annum; this has been caused by increases in pre-warnings (these have risen from 36 to 
84) and detector activations (which have risen from 26 to 55).   
 
Northamptonshire Fire and Rescue Service (FRS) response to emergency calls 
Northamptonshire Fire and Rescue Service have continued with their policy not to 
mobilise their resources to any Automatic Fire Alarm (AFA) between the hours of 8am-
8pm. During this time the Hospital Fire Response Team has investigated the alarm 
activation and has only escalated to FRS if the activation has been caused by a 
confirmed fire. 
 
The Trust’s operational fire policy, fire procedures and risk assessments already in place 
are considered substantive and sufficient to ensure that the FRS change in policy has not 
increased the risk to patients, staff, visitors and premises.  
 
Since 1st April 2015 there have been 35 activations of the fire alarm system between 
0800h and 2000h which would previously have had an FRS response but which were 
successfully dealt with by the Trust’s Fire Response Team. The FRS did attend on 7 
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occasions during this time. There were 33 actuations of the fire alarm between 2000 and 
0800h resulting in 26 attendances of the FRS. 

 
  5.0 Conclusion: 

Continued investment in fire safety through the annual capital plan has allowed the Trust 
to ensure that building/structural fire risks are eliminated or mitigated as much as 
practicable. Cavity barriers continue to be the biggest concern in the structural fire 
protection of the Trusts buildings. 
 
The external audit of the Trust’s fire safety management for compliance with HTM 05-01 
completed in 14/15 and, subsequent action plan, has provided further assurance that the 
existing systems are sufficient. It highlighted some minor improvements and focused on 
the need to improve on annual fire drill compliance. Actions to address the 
recommendations have been made but there has been some slippage on agreed target 
dates.  
 
The fire alarm and automatic fire detection system is a fully integrated and functioning 
part of the fire safety measures in the hospital. It has received substantial investment in it 
to reach the standard it is now however there is still more that needs to be done to 
ensure that it continues to maintain this high standard. This mainly involves the 
replacement of no longer supported detector heads.   
 
There has been an increase in alarm activations over the previous 2 years and although 
the causes have been minor, the responses to these have been timely and effective. 
Continued analysis of these activations has identified the majority of the increase has 
been in pre warnings and, within those pre warnings the most common cause has been 
recorded as ‘unknown’ i.e. there has been no obvious sign what caused the pre warning 
when the Fire Response Team has investigated.  
 
The analysis of the pre warning increase can be linked to the age of the detector heads. 
This has already been factored into the Estates Capital plan and there has been 
continued investment in the fire system including the installation of additional detectors 
and replacement of older ones. This investment continues in the Estates 5 year plan. 

 
Training all Trust staff on an annual basis continues to be a challenge but training places 
are available to enable this to be completed. Attendance figures have continued to 
improved year on year (at the end of April 2016 the Trust fire training figures were 78.3% 
compliant) but, further work is still required to attain the Trust’s 85% attendance rate. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

E
nc

lo
su

re
 L

Page 195 of 235



 

8 of 9 

 

 

ANNUAL STATEMENT of FIRE SAFETY COMPLIANCE 
 

NHS Organisation 
Code:  

 NHS Organisation Name:  
Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust 

I confirm that for the period 1st January 2015 to 31st December 2015, all premises which 
the Trust owns, occupies or manages, have fire risk assessments that comply with the 
Regulatory Reform (Fire Safety) Order 2005, and: 

1 There are no significant risks arising from the fire risk assessments.  

OR 
2 

The Trust has developed a programme of work to eliminate or reduce 
as low as reasonably practicable the significant fire risks identified by 
the fire risk assessment. 

Yes 

OR 
3 

The organisation has identified significant fire risks, but does NOT 
have a programme of work to mitigate those significant fire risks.* 

 

*Where a programme to mitigate significant risks HAS NOT been developed, please 
insert the date by which such a programme will be available, taking account of the 
degree of risk. 
  Date:  

4 During the period covered by this statement, has the organisation 
been subject to any enforcement action by the Fire & Rescue 
Authority? 
If Yes outline the details of the enforcement action in Annex A – Part 
1. 

No 

5 Does the organisation have any unresolved enforcement action pre-
dating this Statement? 
If Yes outline the details of unresolved enforcement action in Annex A 
– Part 2. 

No 

6 The organisation achieves compliance with the Department of Health 
Fire Safety Policy, contained within HTM 05-01, by the application of 
Firecode or some other suitable method. 

 
Yes 

7 There is a current fire safety policy in place. Yes 

Fire Safety Manager 
 
 

Name:  Stuart Finn 

E-mail:  stuart.finn@ngh.nhs.uk       

Contact details: Telephone:   01604 - 545903 

Mobile:       

Chief Executive 
Name: 

Dr. Sonia Swart 

Signature of Chief 
Executive: 

                                                             

Date:                              

Statement to be completed and forwarded to – the chief Executive, Director responsible 
for fire safety and the Fire Safety Manager. 

 

Page 196 of 235



 

 

 
 
 

 
 

 
Title of the Report 
 

 
Operational Performance Report 

 
Agenda item 
 

 
17 

 
Presenter of  Report 
 

 
Deborah Needham 
Chief Operating Officer 

 
Author(s) of Report 

 
Lead Directors & Deputies 
 

 
Purpose 
 

 
For Information & Assurance 

Executive summary 
 
The paper is presented to provide information and assurance to the committee on all national and local 
performance targets via the integrated scorecard. 
 
Each of the indicators which is red rated has an accompanying exception report 
 

 
 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 
 

Focus on quality & safety 

Risk and assurance 
 
 

Does the content of the report present any risks to the Trust or 
consequently provide assurances on risks N 
Risk of not delivering performance standards 
Associated fines 
Patient experience 
Reputation 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF – 1.2, 3.1 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
 

 
 
Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
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Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Are there any legal/regulatory implications of the paper (N) 

 
Actions required by the Board 
 
The Board is asked to: 
 

 Note the performance report 

 Seek areas for clarification  

 Gain assurance on actions being taken to rectify adverse performance 
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Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust 
 

Corporate Scorecard 
 
 

Delivering for patients: 
2016/17 Accountability Framework for NHS trust boards 

 
 
 
The corporate scorecard provides a holistic and integrated set of metrics closely aligned 
between NHS Improvement and the CQC oversight measures used for identification and 
intervention. 
 
The domains identified within are: Caring, Responsiveness, Effective, Well Led, Safe 
and Finance, many items within each area were provided within the TDA Framework 
with a further number of in-house metrics identified from our previous quality scorecard 
which were considered important to continue monitoring. 
 
The arrows within this report are used to identify the changes within the last 3 months 
reported, with exception reports provided for all measures which are Red, Amber or 
seen to be deteriorating over this period even if they are scored as green or grey (no 
target); identify possible issues before they become problems. 
 

Each indicator which is highlighted as red or Amber has an accompanying exception 
report highlighting the reasons for underperformance, actions to improve performance 
and trajectory for the reminder of the year. 
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Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 
 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
 

 

Title of the Report 

 

Report from the Finance Investment and 
Performance Committee  

 
Agenda item 
 

18 

Presenter of Report 

 
Phil Zeidler, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Finance 
Investment and Performance Committee 
 

Author(s) of Report 
 

 
Phil Zeidler, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Finance 
Investment and Performance Committee 
 

 
Purpose 
 

For Assurance 

Executive summary 
 
This report from the Chair of the Finance Investment and Performance Committee provides an update 
to the Trust Board on activities undertaken during the month of June.  

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Strategic Aim 3,4 and 5 

Risk and assurance 
 

Risks assessment provided within the report. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 1.2, 5.1, 5.2 and 6.3 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (Y/N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (Y/N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 
 

Statutory and governance duties  
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Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Trust Board is asked to note the report. 
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COMMITTEE HIGHLIGHT REPORT 
 

 
Report to the Trust Board: 28th July 2016 
 

 

Title  Finance Committee Exception Report  

Chair  Phil Zeidler 

Author (s)  Phil Zeidler 

Purpose  To advise the Board of the work of the Trust Board Sub committees 

 

Executive Summary  
The Committee met on 22nd June 2016 to discuss items on its agenda (drawn from its 
annual work plan, arising issues relevant to its terms of reference or matters 
delegated by the Trust Board). 

Key agenda items:  

 Changing care@NGH 

 Revised Control Total 

 Reference Costs Audit 

 Agency Cap 

 Operation Performance Report 

 Business Case Report 

Board Assurance 
Framework entries  
(also cross-referenced 
to CQC standards) 
 
 
 

Key areas of discussion arising from items appearing on the agenda 
 

 Discussed best ways to deliver value through the findings from the Carter report 

 Discussed the revised Control Total proposal from NHSI which if adopted delivers an 
additional £9.7m funding subject to conditions being met. 

 Discussed the Reference costs audit where we were deemed Non Compliant 

 Noted an improved A&E performance despite very high admissions. Due t reduced ALoS in 
part through less acuity and in part through more efficient discharges, notably at 
weekends 

 Cancer targets no a real focus, with much more granular reporting 

 Pharmacy weekend cover Business case required more information 
Any key actions agreed / decisions taken to be notified to the Board 
 

 Audit to instruct internal Audit to look at Reference Costs to get full assurance on the 
remedial action agreed with PWC 

 Paediatric Business case for opening PAU at weekends approved 
Any issues of risk or gap in control or assurance for escalation to the Board 
 

 16/17 contract dispute to be raised at Board 
Legal implications/ 
regulatory requirements 
 

The above report provides assurance in relation to CQC 
Regulations and BAF entries as detailed above. 

Action required by the Board 
 

 A recommendation to the Board that the Board accept the revised Control total of £24.8m 
before the £9.7m STF funding or £15.1m after accounting for the £9.7m STF funding from 
NHSI subject to various assumptions. 
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Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 
 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
 

 
 
 

 
Title of the Report 
 

Report from the Quality Governance Committee  

Agenda item 
 
19 
 

 
Presenter of Report 
 

 
Liz Searle, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Quality 
Governance Committee 
 

 
Author(s) of Report 
 

 
Liz Searle, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Quality 
Governance Committee 

 
Purpose 
 

For Assurance 

Executive summary 
 
This report from the Chair of the Quality Governance Committee (QGC) provides an update to the Trust 
Board on activities undertaken during the month of June. 

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Strategic Aim 3,4 and 5 

Risk and assurance 
 

Risks assessment provided within the report. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 
 

BAF 1.1, 1.3, 1.4, 1.6 and 2.1 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (Y/N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (Y/N) 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Statutory and governance duties  
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Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Trust Board is asked to note the report. 
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COMMITTEE HIGHLIGHT REPORT 
 

 
Report to the Trust Board: 28 July 16 
 

 

Title  Quality Governance Committee Exception Report  

Chair  Liz Searle 

Author (s)  Liz Searle 

Purpose  To advise the Board of the work of the Trust Board Sub committees 

 

Executive Summary  
The Committee met on 24 June to discuss items on its agenda (drawn from its annual 
work plan, arising issues relevant to its terms of reference or matters delegated by the 
Trust Board). 

Key agenda items:  
 

 Emergency Calls, Cardiac Arrests and DNACPR 

 Accessible Information Standards 

 Complaints & PALs Quarterly Report & Annual Report 

 Incident Report Q4 

 QI Presentation on SI’s 

 Risk Management Annual Report 

 Annual Audit Plan and Report 

 Health and Safety Annual Report 
 
 

Board Assurance 
Framework entries  
(also cross-referenced 
to CQC standards) 
 
 
 

Key areas of discussion arising from items appearing on the agenda 
 

 Theatre paper deferred till July 

 Accessible Information Standards – a lot of work to be done and will be unable to meet the 
July deadline. 

 Annual Audit Report – requested a further update in 3 months 

 CQC report to come monthly to QGC for the foreseeable future 
 

Any key actions agreed / decisions taken to be notified to the Board 
 

 Formal rule 28 issued 

 Annual Audit Report – requested a further update in 3 months 

 Deep-dive into communication issues 

 Concerns raised within the Health and Safety report on the increased physical aggression 
towards staff 

 

Any issues of risk or gap in control or assurance for escalation to the Board 
 

 Health and Safety Report – new Health and Safety officer in place and an update on her 
progress at mitigating the issues noted within the report to be presented in the next quarter.  

 

Legal implications/ 
regulatory requirements 

The above report provides assurance in relation to CQC 
Regulations and BAF entries as detailed above. 
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Action required by the Board 
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Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 
 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
 

 
 
 

Title of the Report 

 

Report from the Workforce Committee  

 

 
Agenda item 
 

20 

Presenter of Report 

 
Graham Kershaw, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Workforce 
Committee 
 

Author(s) of Report 
 

 
Graham Kershaw, Non-Executive Director and Chair of Workforce 
Committee 
 

 
Purpose 
 

For Assurance 

Executive summary 
 
This report from the Chair of the Workforce Committee provides an update to the Trust Board on 
activities undertaken during the month of June. 

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 

Strategic Aim 3,4 and 5 

Risk and assurance 
 

Risks assessment provided within the report. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 

BAF 4.1, 4.2, 4.3 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (Y/N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (Y/N) 
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Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 
 

Statutory and governance duties  
 

Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Trust Board is asked to note the report. 
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COMMITTEE HIGHLIGHT REPORT 
 

 
Report to the Trust Board for July 2016 
 

 

Title  Workforce Committee Report  

Chair  Graham Kershaw 

Author (s)   

Purpose  To advise the Board of the work of the Trust Board Sub committees 

 

Executive Summary  
The Committee met on 18/05/2016 to discuss items on its agenda (drawn from its 
annual work plan, arising issues relevant to its terms of reference or matters 
delegated by the Trust Board). 

Key agenda items:  
Medical Education Quarterly update 
Nurse recruitment and retention strategies/action plans. 
Workforce performance 
Safe nurse staffing  
 

Board Assurance 
Framework entries  
(also cross-referenced 
to CQC standards) 
 
 
 

Key areas of discussion arising from items appearing on the agenda. 
Recruitment of nurses continues to be challenging, more recruitment activity is now taking 
place in India The committee were also informed that the nurses accommodation would 
have broadband shortly as there had been issues with the supplier 
DoN discussed the new Associate Nursing role. Ms. Fox advised that the East Midlands had been 
requested to pilot the role. 
The committee was informed of a move to charge tuition. The committee expressed their strong 
concerns on the impact this would have on nurse training. Don reported that Northampton 
University could decide to only have 1 cohort of nurses qualify yearly.  
It was  
Dr Cusack presented the Medical Revalidation and Appraisal Quarterly Report.  
Dr Cusack advised that the report gives a summary of the medical appraisal and revalidation status 
at Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust for the period January 2016 – March 2016, Q4. A 
number of questions were asked about the report and for further assurance it was requested that 
when the external quality assurance report is complete Dr Cusack brought this back to the 
committee.  
The HR team on the various elements of our HR strategy made presentations. 
Mr. I Gregory presented the Employee Engagement Strategy and People strategy update. 
Mr. Bryden and Ms. Nicholson who gave a presentation Improving Quality and Efficiency which 
included:  
-The role of the IQE team  
-The story so far  
-The IQE approach  
-Current work  
-The future and  
-Getting it right.  
These presentations clearly demonstrated the work done on delivering our cultural change 
programme and the impact it was having. 
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Ms. Thorne presented the Freedom to Speak Up – Progress Report.  
Ms. Thorne advised the Committee that this report would be presented quarterly to the 
Workforce Committee.  
  
 

Any key actions agreed / decisions taken to be notified to the Board 
 
Mandatory training compliance had remained above the 85% target. 
 
Sickness continued to be above the trust target  
 
 
 
 
 

Any issues of risk or gap in control or assurance for escalation to the Board 
 
Non other than referred to above 
 

Legal implications/ 
regulatory requirements 
 

The above report provides assurance in relation to CQC 
Regulations and BAF entries as detailed above. 

Action required by the Board 
 
Note report 
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Report To 
 

 
PUBLIC TRUST BOARD 
 

 
Date of Meeting 
 

 
28 July 2016 
 

 
 

Title of the Report 

 
Report from the Hospital Management Team  
Workshop Meeting held on 5th July 2016 
 

Agenda item 
 

21 

Presenter of Report 
 
Deborah Needham, Chief Operating Officer/Deputy CEO 
 

Author(s) of Report 
 

 
Deborah Needham, Chief Operating Officer/Deputy CEO 
 

 
Purpose 
 

For Information & Assurance 

Executive summary 
 
This report provides an update to the Trust Board on activities undertaken at the Hospital Management 
Team meeting held in July 2016. 

 

Related strategic aim and 
corporate objective 
 

Strategic Aims - All  

Risk and assurance 
 

Risks assessment provided within the report. 

Related Board Assurance 
Framework entries 

BAF  
1.2, 1.5, 1.7, 2.1, 4.1, 4.2, 5.1,  
 

Equality Analysis 
 

Is there potential for, or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will not promote equality of opportunity for all or 
promote good relations between different groups? (N) 
 
Is there potential, for or evidence that, the proposed 
decision/document will affect different protected 
groups/characteristics differently (including possibly discriminating 
against certain groups/protected characteristics)? (N) 
 
 

Legal implications / 
regulatory requirements 

Statutory and governance duties  
 

Actions required by the Trust Board 
 
The Trust Board is asked to note the report. 
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COMMITTEE HIGHLIGHT REPORT 
 

 
Report to the Trust Board: 28th July 2016 
 

 

Title  HMT Exception Report  

Chair  Mrs Deborah Needham 

Author (s)  Mrs Deborah Needham 

Purpose  To advise the Board of the work of the Trust Board Sub committees 

 

Executive Summary  
The Committee (workshop) met on 5th July 2016 to discuss items on its agenda 
(drawn from its annual work plan, arising issues relevant to its terms of reference or 
matters delegated by the Trust Board). 

Key agenda items:  
 

1. Divisional updates  
2. Business cases (Additional beds & Vascular service 

expansion) 
3. Acute Assessment hub – model of care 

 

Board Assurance 
Framework entries  
1.1, 1.2, 2.2, 3.1, 3.2,  
 
 
 

Key areas of discussion arising from items appearing on the agenda 
 
Divisional updates 
Divisions presented their current concerns and actions being taken and any other divisional 
updates:  
 
Medicine & Urgent care 

a. Recruitment of medical staff including over recruitment of trust Grade doctors to 
ensure any gaps are covered.  

b. Ambulance handover improvements over the last 4 weeks. 
 

Surgery 
    a. Internal performance meetings continuing in the division. 
    b. Gap in trainee doctors within anaesthetics and the actions which the division are taking   
        to mitigate any risks. 
     
Women’s ,Childrens, Oncology, Haematology and Cancer 

a. No immediate items of concern or update received. 
 
Clinical Support services 

a. Staff retention. 
b. EMRAD – the effect of deployment and continuing plans to address risks. 
c. MRHA report for pathology and further actions being taken. 

 
 
Business cases 
Two in year business cases were presented: 
 
1. Due to the gap in bed capacity of up to 130 beds for this year. As part of winter planning a 
business case was presented to utilise up to 38 beds at a local nursing home, using a new 
model of care to ensure ongoing rehabilitation for our patients. 
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2. A further business case was presented to expand the current vascular service for 
Northamptonshire at NGH to include Milton Keynes vascular service. 
 
Both cases were supported by HMT and recommend for approval to the Finance, 
Performance & Investment committee which is due to meet in July 2016.  
 
Acute Assessment Hub 
Dr. Timperley (Clinical Director for Urgent Care) gave a comprehensive presentation on how 
the proposed new assessment hub would function, including timescales, build design, 
staffing and the medical model for the hub.  
 
 

Any key actions agreed / decisions taken to be notified to the Board 
 
 
  
Any issues of risk or gap in control or assurance for escalation to the Board 
 
All areas of risk regarding quality and performance are covered in Trust Board reports and 
detailed on the risk register 
 

Legal implications/ 
regulatory requirements 

The above report provides assurance in relation to CQC 
Regulations and BAF entries as detailed above. 

Action required by the Board 
 
To note the contents of the report. 
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